
AGENDA 

WYOMING CITY COUNCIL MEETING 

CITY COUNCIL CHAMBERS 

MONDAY, JUNE 1, 2015, 7:00 P.M. 

             

 1) Call to Order 

 2) Invocation – Pastor Dennis Gilbert, Church of the Open Door  

 3) Pledge of Allegiance 

 4) Roll Call 

 5) Student Recognition 

6) Approval of Minutes 

From the regular meeting of May 18, 2015  

7) Approval of Agenda 

8) Public Hearings 

7:01 p.m. To Consider Amendments to the Wyoming Recreation Plan, 2013-2017 

7:02 p.m. To Consider the Amendment of Industrial Development District 231 for 

Jasper Weller, LLC in the City of Wyoming 

7:03 p.m.   To Consider Use of the 2015 Edward Byrne Memorial Justice Grant Funds for 

Program Activities 

 9)    Public Comment on Agenda Items (3 minute limit per person) 

10) Presentations and Proclamations 

a)  Presentations 

 1. Kent County Land Bank 

 b) Proclamations 

11) Petitions and Communications 

a) Petitions 

b) Communications  

12) Reports from City Officers 

a) From City Council 

b) From City Manager 

13) Budget Amendments 

 a)   Budget Amendment No. 56 – To Appropriate $14,772 of Budgetary Authority for 

Capital Equipment for the District Court and Recognize the Associated Revenue of 

$14,772 from the State of Michigan for Drunk Driving/Drug Caseflow Assistance 

 b)   Budget Amendment No. 57 – To Appropriate $3,255.31 of Budgetary Authority for 

Forensic Lab Supplies and Training and Recognize the Additional Revenue of 

$1,755.31 from the Associated Reimbursement from the State of Michigan 

 c)   Budget Amendment No. 58 – To Appropriate $54,725 of Budgetary Authority for the 

Expenditures Related to the Gypsy Moth Suppression Program to be Funded by Special 

Assessment Rolls 15-794 and 15-795. Revenue will be Recognized in Fund 800 as 

Payments are Received. 

14) Consent Agenda 

(All items under this section are considered to be routine and will be enacted by one motion 

with no discussion. If discussion is desired by a Council member, that member may request 

removal from the Consent Agenda.) 



 a) To Set Meeting Day and Time for the Retirement Board of the City of Wyoming 

 b) To Appoint Jackie Moore as a Member of the Historical Commission for the City of 

Wyoming 

 c) To Authorize the Mayor and City Clerk to Execute an Amendment to the Streetlighting 

Contract with Consumers Energy Company 

 d) To Set a Public Hearing to Establish an Industrial Development District for Huizenga 

Properties, LLC in the City of Wyoming (June 15, 2015 at 7:01 p.m.) 

15) Resolutions 

 e) To Amend Industrial Development District 231 for Jasper Weller, LLC in the City of 

Wyoming 

 f) To Approve an Application by the Community Enrichment Commission of the City of 

Wyoming for a Permit for Discharge of Fireworks 

 g) To Adopt Amendments to the City of Wyoming Recreation Plan, 2013 Through 2017 

 h) To Authorize the City Manager to Execute an Employment Agreement with the Deputy 

Fire Chief (Assistant Deputy Director of Fire Services) 

16)   Award of Bids, Contracts, Purchases, and Renewal of Bids and Contracts 

 i) To Authorize the Mayor and City Clerk to Execute an Amendment to the License 

Agreement with Consumers Energy for the Interurban Trail Rehabilitation Project 

 j) To Authorize Extending the Contract with Multi Serve for Cleaning and Disinfecting 

Services 

 k) To Authorize the Purchase of a 2015 Ford SUV Interceptor  

17)   Ordinances 

 5-15 To Amend Article VII of Chapter 10 of the Code of the City of Wyoming (Property 

Maintenance Code) (Final Reading) 

 6-15 To Amend Section 90-32 of the Code of the City of Wyoming by Adding 

Subsection (100) Thereto to Rezone 0.4 Acres from RO-1 Restricted Office to B-1 

Local Business (4992 Wilson Avenue) (Final Reading)  

 7-15 To Amend Subsections 3(b), 3(c) and 3(d) of Section 90-50 of the Code of the City 

of Wyoming (Recreational Vehicles) (First Reading) 

18) Informational Material 

19) Acknowledgment of Visitors 

20) Closed Session (as necessary) 

21) Adjournment 



CITY OF WYOMING BUDGET AMENDMENT 

Date: June 1, 2015 Budget Amendment No. 056 

To the Wyoming City Council: 

A budget amendment is requested for the following reason: To appropriate $14,772 of budgetary authority 
for capital equipment for the district court and recognize the associated revenue of $14,772 from the State of 
Michigan for drunk driving/drug caseflow assistance. 

Description/ Account Code Current 

General Fund 

State Grants District Court Drunk Driving Caseload Asst 
101-544.000 $0 

District Court - District Court - Capital Outlay Equipment 
1 0 1-136-13600-984.000 $66,650 

Fund Balance (1 01) 

Recommended: ____.!tJ~~atA~~tb=.~::"= fJ~ fv~" )9.~--­Accounta~ 

Increase Decrease Amended 

$14,772 $14,772 

$14,772 $81,422 

$ - $ -

City Manager 

Motion by Council member , seconded by Council member--------­
that the General Appropriations Act for Fiscal Year 2014-2015 be amended by adoption of the foregoing budget 
amendment. 
Motion carried: _____ yeas, _____ nays 

I hereby certify that at a _______ meeting of the Wyoming City Council duly held on 
---------the foregoing budget amendment was approved. 

City Clerk 

Page 1 of 1 



CITY OF WYOMING BUDGET AMENDMENT 

Date: June 1, 2015 Budget Amendment No. 057 

To the Wyoming City Council: 

A budget amendment is requested for the following reason: To appropriate $3,255.31 of budgetary 
authority for forensic lab supplies and training and recognize the additional revenue of $1,755.31 from the 
associated reimbursement from the State of Michigan. 

Description/ Account Code Current 

General Fund 

Fees Forensics-Latent Fingerprint and Drug Tests 
101-641.003 $1,500 

District Court - District Court - Capital Outlay Equipment 
101-305-31200-973.013 

Fund Balance (101) 

Recommended: --'t4-+CUA~;.....;_..,.1fl~......,,'-'H-nlf)~""f-'-''-loi----­Accou~ 

$0 

Increase Decrease Amended 

$1,755.31 $3,255.31 

$3,255.31 $3,255.31 

$ - $ 1,500 

City Manager 

Motion by Council member , seconded by Councilmember --------­
that the General Appropriations Act for Fiscal Year 2014-2015 be amended by adoption of the foregoing budget 
amendment. 
Motion carried: _____ yeas, _____ nays 

I hereby certify that at a _______ meeting of the Wyoming City Council duly held on 
_________ the foregoing budget amendment was approved. 

City Clerk 

Page 1 of 1 



STAFF REPORT 

Date: May 26,2015 

Subject: Use of State of Michigan Reimbursement Funds to support the FSU 
Drug/Toxicology Laboratory 

From: Lt. Mark Easterly 

Meeting Date: June 1, 2015 

Recommendation: 

It is recommended that the City of Wyoming authorize the acceptance of reimbursement 
payments from the State of Michigan for self-initiated laboratory work; and the Quarterly 
Transfer of these funds to the Forensic Latent Fingerprinting and Drug Testing accounts as 
deemed appropriate by City of Wyoming Finance Department for use by the Public Safety FSU 
Unit for approved laboratory expenses and training. 

Sustainability Criteria: 

Environmental Responsibility: The Wyoming Department of Public Safety Forensic 
Science Unit actively engages in the protection of the natural environment and the public 
health of Wyoming's citizens. There will be no impact to this criterion. 

Social Equity: This recommendation will provide service to all residents of the City of 
Wyoming, and any other individual entered into the Criminal Justice System through the 
Wyoming Department of Public Safety, without regard to income level or socio­
economic status. 

Economic Strength: Sustainability is a key feature for this recommendation in that the 
City of Wyoming directly benefits from having its own Drug/Toxicology Laboratory. 
For every test that is not transferred to the State Police Crime Laboratory to complete, our 
laboratory receives a payment from the State of Michigan. 

Discussion: 

Both the City of Wyoming and the Michigan State Police benefit from the Wyoming Public 
Safety Department having its own Drug/Toxicology Laboratory. Our Department receives 
reimbursement from the State for every test that is not sent into the State Police Crime lab. This 
payment is made to the City of Wyoming on a quarterly basis. 

By Michigan Law, this reimbursement is to be strictly used for laboratory supplies and training 
of laboratory staff. 



Budget Impact: 

With this recommendation we would ask that the revenue from the State of Michigan laboratory 
reimbursement received in account 101-641.003 on a quarterly basis, result in a budget 
amendment to increase account 101-305-31200-973.013 to be used for these expenditures by the 
Forensic Science Unit. We would further ask that these budget amendments be completed on a 
Quarterly Basis by the City of Wyoming Finance Department as these funds are received. We 
would further ask that at year end, any balance that is not spent from this account be 
reappropriated to the next year's budget. 

Currently there is revenue received of $3,255.31. A budget amendment has been prepared 
reflecting the process outlined above. 



CITY OF WYOMING BUDGET AMENDMENT 

Date: June 1, 2015 Budget Amendment No. 058 

To the Wyoming City Council: 

A budget amendment is requested for the following reason: To appropriate $54,725 of budgetary authority 
for the expenditures related to the gypsy moth suppression program to be funded by special assessment rolls 15-
794 and 15-795. Revenue will be recognized in Fund 800 as payments are received. 

Description/Account Code Current Increase 

Special Assessment Fund 

General Government - City Council - Other Services 
800-000-101 00-956.000 $0 $54,725.00 ----'---

Fund Balance (800) 

Recommended: _...;..\b-+...:::(tt{...::..__;__ij=--~--l,I~,__--­
Accountant 

$ $ 

City Manager 

Decrease Amended 

$54,725.00 

54,725 

Motion by Council member , seconded by Councilmember ________ _ 
that the General Appropriations Act for Fiscal Year 2014-2015 be amended by adoption of the foregoing budget 
amendment. 
Motion carried: _____ yeas, _____ nays 

I hereby certify that at a _______ meeting of the Wyoming City Council duly held on 
_________ the foregoing budget amendment was approved. 

City Clerk 

Page 1 of 1 



06/01/2015 

Clerk/KV 

Resolution No. __________________ 

RESOLUTION NO.  __________ 

 

RESOLUTION TO SET MEETING DAY AND TIME 

FOR THE RETIREMENT BOARD 

OF THE CITY OF WYOMING 

 

 

 

WHEREAS: 

 

1. The Retirement Board currently meets on the fourth Monday of each month at 3:30 p.m. 

2. The Retirement Board has proposed changing its meeting schedule to the third Monday 

of each month at 3:00 p.m. 

3. Section 2.113 of the Code of Ordinances states that the days and times of regular 

meetings of all boards and commission shall be set by City Council resolution. 

 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED: 

 

1. The regular day and time for meetings of the Retirement Board shall be the third Monday 

of each month at 4:00 p.m. at City Hall. 

 

 

 

Moved by Councilmember: 

Seconded by Councilmember: 

Motion Carried Yes 

   No 

 

I hereby certify that the foregoing Resolution was adopted by the City Council for the City of 

Wyoming, Michigan at a regular session held on:  

 

       ____________________________________ 

       Kelli A. VandenBerg, Wyoming City Clerk 

 

 

 



06/01/15 

Clerk/IJ 

Resolution No. __________________ 

RESOLUTION NO.  __________ 

 

RESOLUTION TO APPOINT JACKIE MOORE AS A MEMBER OF THE  

HISTORICAL COMMISSION FOR THE CITY OF WYOMING 

 

 

 

WHEREAS: 

 

1. Jackie Moore has submitted an application requesting appointment to the Historical 

Commission for the City of Wyoming. 

2. A vacancy exists in an unexpired term ending June 30, 2018. 

3. Mayor Jack Poll has recommended that Jackie Moore be appointed as a member of the 

Historical Commission for the City of Wyoming. 

 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED: 

 

1. The City Council for the City of Wyoming, Michigan, does hereby confirm the 

appointment of Jackie Moore to the Wyoming Historical Commission for the unexpired 

term ending on June 30, 2018. 

 

Moved by Councilmember: 

Seconded by Councilmember: 

Motion Carried Yes 

   No 

 

I hereby certify that the foregoing Resolution was adopted by the City Council for the City of 

Wyoming, Michigan at a regular session held on June 1, 2015. 

 

       __________________________________ 

       Kelli A. VandenBerg, Wyoming City Clerk 

 

 



6/1/2015 
Public Works/WDD/ks 

Resolution No. __________ 
 

RESOLUTION NO.  __________ 
 

RESOLUTION TO AUTHORIZE THE MAYOR AND CITY CLERK 
TO EXECUTE AN AMENDMENT TO THE STREETLIGHTING 

CONTRACT WITH CONSUMERS ENERGY COMPANY 
 
 
WHEREAS: 
 

1. The City has entered into a contract with Consumers Energy Company which provides 
for a Consumers Energy Company owned streetlighting system within certain parts of the 
City. 

2. The City desires to have Consumers Energy Company replace one 400 watt Mercury 
vapor streetlight and replace it with one 250 watt high pressure sodium streetlight located 
at 590 44th St SW. 

3. The proposed change to a more energy efficient streetlight will result in a slight savings 
for the City which will be reflected on the monthly energy bills. 

4. Consumers Energy will replace this streetlight at no cost to the City but will charge a 
non-refundable payment of $100.00 for installation. 

5. Consumers Energy has submitted the attached modification to the streetlighting contract 
to address this change 

 
NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED: 
 

1. That the Mayor and City Clerk are hereby authorized to execute the attached 
Authorization for Change in Standard Streetlighting Contract and the accompanying 
Consumers Energy Resolution. 

 
 
Moved by Councilmember: 
Seconded by Councilmember: 
Motion Carried Yes 
   No 
 
I hereby certify that the foregoing Resolution was adopted by the City Council for the City of 
Wyoming, Michigan at a regular session held on June 1, 2015. 
 
       __________________________________ 
       Kelli A. VandenBerg, Wyoming City Clerk 
ATTACHMENTS: 
Authorization for Change in Standard Lighting Contract 
Consumers Energy Resolution w/ map  
 
 











06/01/2015 

Manager/JB 

RESOLUTION NO.  __________ 

 

RESOLUTION TO SET A PUBLIC HEARING  

TO ESTABLISH AN INDUSTRIAL DEVELOPMENT DISTRICT FOR  

HUIZINGA PROPERTIES, LLC IN THE CITY OF WYOMING  

 

WHEREAS: 

 

1. The City of Wyoming has the authority to establish Industrial Development Districts 

within the City of Wyoming under the provisions of Act 198 of Public Acts of 1974, as 

amended. 

2. Huizinga Properties, LLC has requested that the City establish an Industrial Development 

District for its property located at 5920 Clyde Park Avenue SW, Wyoming, MI, 49509. 

3. Prior to establishing such districts, it is necessary to first hold a public hearing at which 

the owners of the affected property and any other resident or taxpayer of the City can be 

given an opportunity to comment on the establishment of an Industrial Development 

District. 

 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED: 

 

1. The City Council shall hold a public hearing on June 15, 2015 at 7:01 p.m., at Wyoming 

City Hall, 1155 28
th

 Street SW, Wyoming, MI 49509, at which the owners of property 

located within the proposed Industrial Development District and other residents or 

taxpayers of the City shall be given an opportunity to comment on the establishment of 

the proposed district to be comprised of the property described on the attached Exhibit A, 

which is incorporated by reference, and commonly known as 5920 Clyde Park Avenue, 

SW, Wyoming, MI 49509. 

2. Notice of this hearing shall be given to the applicant, the Assessor, and a representative 

of each affected taxing unit, and shall be posted in City Hall. 

 

Moved by Councilmember: 

Seconded by Councilmember: 

Motion Carried Yes 

   No 

 

I hereby certify that the foregoing Resolution was adopted by the City Council for the City of 

Wyoming, Michigan at a regular session held on: June 1, 2015. 

 

 

       __________________________________ 

       Kelli A. VandenBerg, Wyoming City Clerk 

 

 

ATTACHMENT: Exhibit A - Legal Description 

 

Resolution No. ____________ 



EXHIBIT A 

 

Legal Description 

 

 

Address:    5920 Clyde Park SW, Wyoming Michigan, 49509 

 

Tax Parcel No.:   41-17-36-351-015 

    

Legal Description: 

 

411736351015 PART OF SW 1/4 COM 662.99 FT N 1D 57M 57S W ALONG W SEC LINE & 

50.05 FT S 89D 23M 05S E ALONG N LINE OF S 1/2 SW 1/4 SW 1/4 FROM SW COR OF 

SEC TH S 89D 23M 05S E ALONG SD N LINE 1021.35 FT TO WLY LINE OF HWY US131 

TH S 2D 21M 12S E ALONG SD WLY LINE 497.23 FT TO N LINE OF S 165 FT OF SW 1/4 

SW 1/4 TH N 89D 26M 03S E ALONG SD N LINE 634.45 FT TH N 1D 57M 57S W 447.34 

FT TH S 88D 02M 03S W 389.85 FT TO E LINE OF CLYDE PARK AVE TH N 1D 57M 57S 

W ALONG SD E LINE 67.85 FT TO BEG * SEC 36 T6N R12W 7.75 A. SPLIT/COMBINED 

ON 11/12/2013 FROM 41-17-36-351-003, 41-17-36-351-010; 



06/01/2015 
Clerk/JB 

RESOLUTION NO.  __________ 
 

RESOLUTION TO AMEND INDUSTRIAL DEVELOPMENT DISTRICT 231 
FOR JASPER WELLER, LLC IN THE CITY OF WYOMING  

 
WHEREAS: 
 

1. The City of Wyoming has the authority to amend Industrial Development Districts within 
the City of Wyoming under the provisions of Act 198 of Public Acts of 1974, as amended. 

2. The City Council established Industrial Development District 231 located at 1500 Gezon 
Parkway, Wyoming, Michigan, on May 24, 1999 with resolution number 19082. 

3. Jasper Weller, LLC has requested that the City amend Industrial Development District 231 
to include its property located at 1401 60th Street, 1521 60th Street and 5960 Burlingame 
Avenue SW, Wyoming, Michigan, as legally described on the attachment. 

4. Staff reviewed the request and found that the project to be located within the district will 
promote the economic health of the community by encouraging private capital investment 
and creating new employment opportunities in the City of Wyoming. 

5. Staff recommends that the City Council amend this district. 
6. A public hearing was held on June 1, 2015, at 7:02 p.m., at which time the property owners 

of real property within the proposed amended district and all residents and taxpayers of the 
City of Wyoming were afforded the opportunity to be heard. 

7. The City Council believes it is in the public interest of the City of Wyoming to amend the 
district.  

 
NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED: 
 

1. The Wyoming City Council amends Industrial Development District Number Two 
Hundred Thirty One (231) in the City of Wyoming, Kent County, Michigan, under the 
provisions of Act 198 of the Public Acts of 1974 as amended, for real and personal 
property at 1500 Gezon Parkway, 1401 60th Street, 1521 60th Street and 5960 Burlingame 
Avenue SW, Wyoming, Michigan, as legally described on the attachment. 
 

Moved by Councilmember: 
Seconded by Councilmember: 
Motion Carried Yes 
   No 
 
I hereby certify that the foregoing Resolution was adopted by the City Council for the City of 
Wyoming, Michigan at a regular session held on June 1, 2015. 
 
  
       ________________________________ 
       Kelli A. VandenBerg, Wyoming City Clerk 
 
ATTACHMENT: Exhibit A - Legal Descriptions 
 
 
Resolution No. ____________ 



EXHIBIT A 
 

Legal Descriptions 
 

Address:    1500 Gezon Parkway, Wyoming, MI 49509 
 
Tax Parcel No.:   41-17-35-300-028 
    
Legal Description: 
 
PART OF SW 1/4 COM ON SLY LINE OF GEZON PKWY AT A PT 1326.49 FT S 89D 36M 
50S E ALONG E&W 1/4 LINE & 712.50 NFT S 1D 26M 30S E TO E LINE OF W 1/2 SW 1/4 
FROM W 1/4 COR TH S 1D 26M 30S E ALONG SD E LINE 1274.90 FT TO S LINE OF N 
3/4 W 1/2 SW 1/4 TH N 89D 34M 03S W ALONG SD S LINE 681.30 FT TH N 1D 26M 30S 
W 250.0 FT TH NELY 137.20 FT ALONG A 60.0 FT RAD CURVE TO LT /LONG CHORD 
BEARS N 23D 03M 04S E 109.20 FT/ TH NWLY 35.79 FT ALONG A 50.0 FT RAD CURVE 
TO RT /LONG CHORD BEARS N 21D 56M 56S W 35.03 FT/ TH N 1D 26M 30S W 883.13 
FT TO SLY LINE OF GEZON PKWY TH ELY 219.66 FT ALONG SD SLY LINE ON A 
2956.25 FT RAD CURVE TO RT /LONG CHORD BEARS N 88D 16M 22S E 219.61 FT/ TH 
S 89D 35M 35S E 428.56 FT TO BEG * SEC 35 T6N R12W 19.10 A. 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
Address:    1401 60th Street, Wyoming, MI 49509 
 
Tax Parcel No.:   41-17-35-300-005 
    
Legal Description: Y1170A: E 660 FT OF S 1/2 SW 1/4 SW 1/4 SEC 35 T6N R12W 10 A. 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
Address:    1521 60th Street, Wyoming, MI 49509 
 
Tax Parcel No.:   41-17-35-300-004 
    
Legal Description:  
 
Y1170B: W 330 FT OF E 990 FT OF S 1/2 SW 1/4 SW 1/4 SEC 35 T6N R12W 5 A. 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
Address:    5960 Burlingame Avenue SW, Wyoming, MI 49509 
 
Tax Parcel No.:   41-17-35-300-035 
    
Legal Description: 
 
S 1/2 SW 1/4 SW 1/4 EX W 40 FT & EX E 990 FT & EX S 40 FT OF REMAINDER * SEC 35 T6N R12W 4.12 A. 

 
 



06/01/2015 
Clerk/KV 

Resolution No. __________________ 

RESOLUTION NO.  __________ 
 

RESOLUTION TO APPROVE AN APPLICATION BY THE 
COMMUNITY ENRICHMENT COMMISSION OF THE CITY OF WYOMING 

FOR A PERMIT FOR DISCHARGE OF FIREWORKS  
 
 
 
WHEREAS: 
 

1. The Fire Safety Act of 2011 requires that any permits issued under that act for the 
discharge of fireworks for a variety of purposes requires local legislative body approval. 

2. The Community Enrichment Commission has made application to have a public display 
of fireworks, operated by licensed fireworks operator Melrose Pyrotechnics, Inc., 
following the Concerts in the Park event on June 30, 2015 at Lamar Park. 

3. The Department of Public Safety has reviewed the application and recommends approval. 
4. Section 34-109 of the Code of the City of Wyoming allows the City Council to establish 

a fee for a fireworks permit. 
 
NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED: 
 

1. The Application by the Community Enrichment Commission for a fireworks permit for 
June 30, 2015 at Lamar Park is approved. 

2. The associated fireworks permit fee is waived.   
 
 
Moved by Councilmember: 
Seconded by Councilmember: 
Motion Carried Yes 
   No 
 
I hereby certify that the foregoing Resolution was adopted by the City Council for the City of 
Wyoming, Michigan at a regular session held on June 1, 2015. 
 
       __________________________________ 
       Kelli A. VandenBerg, Wyoming City Clerk 
ATTACHMENTS: 
Permit Application 
Certificate of Insurance 
 
 















 



RLR:rlr 
06/01/2015 
 

RESOLUTION NO. ______________ 
 

RESOLUTION TO ADOPT AMENDMENTS TO THE CITY OF WYOMING  
RECREATION PLAN, 2013 THROUGH 2017 

 
WHEREAS: 
 

1. The Michigan Department of Natural Resources (DNR) requires that, as a 
prerequisite to qualifying for DNR recreation grants, communities must have an 
adopted five-year Recreation Plan, incorporating the requested projects. 

 
2. A plan amendment is necessary to incorporate the Ideal Park master development 

plan, adopted by the Wyoming City Council on February 16, 2015, which was 
necessary to address the significant loss of recreation facilities, trees and other park 
features due to a tornado in July 2014.  

 
3. The City of Wyoming uses its Recreation Plan in prioritizing recreation program 

development and use of its limited capital and operating funds. The plan amendment 
shall make the City of Wyoming eligible for various local, state, and federal grants. 

 
4. On May 15, 2015 the Parks and Recreation Commission gave unanimous support for 

this plan amendment.  
 

5. Following an 18 day public review and comment period the Wyoming City Council 
held a public hearing on June 1, 2015 on the proposed amendments to the Wyoming 
Recreation Plan, 2013-2017. 

 
NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED: 
 

1. The Wyoming City Council does hereby adopt the City of Wyoming Recreation 
Plan, 2013 through 2017, as amended. 

 
 
Moved by Commissioner: 
Seconded by Councilmember: 
Motion Carried Yes 
   No 
 
I hereby certify that the foregoing Resolution was adopted by the City Council for the City of 
Wyoming, Michigan at a regular session held on June 1, 2015. 
 
      ___________________________________ 
      Kelli A. VandenBerg, Wyoming City Clerk 
 
 
 
 
Resolution No. _____________ 





City of Wyoming Community Recreation Plan Amendment Documents 
Replacing pages 43 – 45, adding page 102-B to the approved plan, a full copy of which is available on the City 
website: http://www.wyomingmi.gov/ParksRec/Documents/COW_Community_Recreation_Plan_FINAL.pdf  
 

Ideal Park 
 

 
 

Ideal Park-5843 Crippen Avenue 
Portions are Dedicated Park, Resolution 6470, 1971  
 
Ideal Park was initially developed in the 1930’s, prior to the incorporation of the City, 
and is one of the oldest parks within the City.  It is located in the southern region of the 
City with Buck Creek flowing through the middle of the park.  The park has historic 
structures including an art deco style bridge, a log cabin lodge, and stone structures. 
Historically, the park has been a gathering site for large group picnics and family 
reunions.  Access to the park is at the end of Crippen Street with large parking areas.  A 
paved pathway provides a connection to the Inter-urban Bike Trail. 
 
In April of 2013, the park experienced significant flooding which resulted in the loss of 
playability on the park’s tennis and basketball courts. In July 2014 the park was hit by a 
tornado, resulting in the loss of over 90% of the park’s trees, many of which were 100 
to 300 years old and the destruction of the playgrounds and picnic section areas.  
 
Park Size: 41.9 Acres 
  

p. 43 
Amended June 2015 



City of Wyoming Community Recreation Plan Amendment Documents 
Replacing pages 43 – 45, adding page 102-B to the approved plan, a full copy of which is available on the City 
website: http://www.wyomingmi.gov/ParksRec/Documents/COW_Community_Recreation_Plan_FINAL.pdf  
 

Useable Facilities and Resources following Flood (2013) & Tornado (2014): 
●Picnic shelter with tables  ●Restroom Building 
●Entry drive and parking area ●Historic Lodge 
●Buck Creek access (limited) ●Two bridges 
●Natural surface pathways  ● Paved pathway connector to Inter-urban Trail 

 
Universal Access and Americans with Disabilities (ADA) Assessment 
*See MDNR definition of and explanation in the Recreation Inventory Section of Plan 
 
Based on the MDNR review requirements, Ideal Park is scored as a 1-None of the 
facilities/park areas meet accessibility guidelines.  The newly adopted master plan 
provides for accessibility throughout the entire park.  As facilities are upgraded or 
added they will be developed to meet universal accessibility guidelines. 
 
Future Needs to Increase Universal Access 
Development of the universally accessible facilities will be completed based on the new 
master plan.  
 
Future Needs to Increase Universal Access 
●Provide access walks to all remaining facilities. 
●Implement redevelopment based upon new park master plan. 
 
Ideal Park Capital Development and Planning Needs 
Ideal Park was initially developed in the 1930’s.  Following the flood of 2013 and the 
tornado of 2014 a new master plan was adopted by City Council on February 16, 2015.  
Several projects are given below as specific needs within the park and will be 
implemented as part of the master plan. 
 
*Historic lodge Retained  *Art Deco and Existing Foot Bridge Retained 
*Events patio at Lodge  *Large and small pavilions 
*Large play area   *Picnic areas 
*Naturalization of creek  *Seating near creek 
*Pedestrian pathways  *Bicycle pathways, trailhead, and connections 
*Lawn areas for open play  *Woodlot preservation and pathways 
*New and improved parking *Basketball court 
*Gateway and park entrances *Restrooms 
*ADA accessibility   *Improved park security 
*Replanting of trees   *Buffer views and noise 
*Maintenance vehicle bridge 
 

p. 44 
Amended June 2015 



City of W
Replacing 
website: ht
 

Wyoming C
pages 43 – 45,
ttp://www.wyo

ommunity R
, adding page 1
omingmi.gov/P

Recreation 
102-B to the ap
ParksRec/Docu

Plan Amen
pproved plan, a
uments/COW_C

dment Docu
a full copy of w
Community_R

uments 
which is availab
Recreation_Plan

ble on the City
n_FINAL.pdf 

Amend

y 

  p. 45 
ded June 2015 



City of Wyoming Community Recreation Plan Amendment Documents 
Replacing pages 43 – 45, adding page 102-B to the approved plan, a full copy of which is available on the City 
website: http://www.wyomingmi.gov/ParksRec/Documents/COW_Community_Recreation_Plan_FINAL.pdf  
 

 

p. 102-B 
Amended June 2015 



060115 

Human Resources/KRO 

RESOLUTION NO.____________ 

 

RESOLUTION TO AUTHORIZE THE CITY MANAGER TO EXECUTE AN 

EMPLOYMENT AGREEMENT WITH THE 

DEPUTY FIRE CHIEF (ASSISTANT DEPUTY DIRECTOR OF FIRE SERVICES) 

 

WHEREAS: 

 

1. The City Manager desires to enter into employment agreements with officers and 

employees in administrative service for the City. 

2. Section 4.7 of the City Charter allows the City Manager to “…exercise his judgment 

in the appointment or employment of officers and employees in the administrative 

service.” 

3. The City Manager has negotiated an employment agreement with the Deputy Fire 

Chief (Assistant Deputy Director of Fire Services). 

 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED: 

 

1. The City Manager is authorized to execute an employment agreement with the 

Deputy Fire Chief (Assistant Deputy Director of Fire Services).  

2. The City Manager is authorized to approve future amendments to the agreement that 

are generally equivalent to the existing City of Wyoming bargaining agreements. 

 

Moved by Councilmember: 

Seconded by Councilmember: 

Motion Carried Yes 

   No 

 

I hereby certify that the foregoing Resolution was adopted by the City Council for the City of 

Wyoming, Michigan at a regular session held on: 

 

 

 ____________________________________ 

ATTACHMENT:     Kelli A. VandenBerg, Wyoming City Clerk 

Employment Agreement 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Resolution No.______________ 

 



 

CITY OF WYOMING 

EMPLOYMENT AGREEMENT 

DEPUTY FIRE CHIEF (ASSISTANT DEPUTY DIRECTOR OF FIRE SERVICES) 

 

 THIS AGREEMENT between Brian G. Bennett, of 7003 84
th

 SE, Caledonia, MI  

49316 (“Employee”), and the City of Wyoming, a municipal corporation, of 1155 – 28
th

 

Street SW, Wyoming, Michigan 49509 (“City”), is made on the following terms: 

1. TERM.  The City hereby employs the Employee as Deputy Fire Chief 

(Assistant Deputy Director of Fire Services) of the City.  This appointment shall be 

effective June 8, 2015.  The Employee understands that as Deputy Fire Chief (Assistant 

Deputy Director of Fire Services), he serves at the pleasure of the City Manager, who may 

terminate the Employee for any reason at any time as provided by the City Charter and City 

Code. 

2. PERFORMANCE.  The Employee agrees to perform the duties of Deputy 

Fire Chief (Assistant Deputy Director of Fire Services) in a competent and professional 

manner and as set forth in the City Charter, City Code, established policies and regulations 

of the City and the laws of the State of Michigan.  A job description has been provided to 

the Employee that the City may periodically revise with notice to the Employee.  The 

Employee shall report to and be supervised by the Deputy Director of Fire Services.      

3. SERVICE DATE.  The Employee’s date of service with the City shall be 

June 8, 2015.  The Employee shall be credited with all earned benefits from his service date 

and shall accumulate benefits uninterrupted after the effective date of this Agreement. 



 

 2 

4. COMPENSATION.  The Employee’s salary shall be established by the 

City Manager in accordance with the annual budget authorization, the City Charter, and the 

City Code.  The salary shall be paid in accordance with City payroll procedures. 

5. BENEFITS.  The Employee shall be provided the same health insurance, 

health insurance opt-out, pension, holidays, vacation, sick leave, sick leave incentive, 

bereavement leave, educational benefits, longevity pay, and payout of accrued benefits 

upon separation from employment as provided to regular employees in the Administrative 

and Supervisory Association unless otherwise stated herein.  Benefits shall be based on a 

hire date of June 8, 2015. The Employee shall contribute 20% of the premium cost for 

health insurance as an active employee.  The health insurance premium shall be based on 

the premium recommended by the City’s insurer or, if applicable, third-party administrator.   

Notwithstanding any other provision of this Agreement, the Employee shall not be 

eligible for a payout of any accrued benefits upon separation from employment until he has 

been employed by the City for at least three (3) years. 

6. TERMINATION.  This Agreement and the Employee’s employment 

pursuant to it may be terminated as follows: 

 a. By the Employee’s resignation.  The Employee shall give written 

notice of the Employee’s resignation at least thirty (30) days prior to its effective 

date.  If the Employee fails to do so, any other provision of this Agreement 

notwithstanding, the City shall have no obligation to pay the Employee for 

accumulated sick leave or vacation time or any other accrued benefits, the amount 

of which the City shall be entitled to retain as liquidated damages for the costs it 

will incur as a result of such sudden resignation. 



 

 3 

 b. By the City Manager for the reason that the Employee 1) failed to 

substantially perform the Employee’s job duties; 2) committed misfeasance, 

malfeasance or nonfeasance in the Employee’s position; 3) engaged in criminal 

misconduct; 4) is convicted of any felony; 5) is convicted of a misdemeanor 

involving bodily harm or dishonesty; or 6) performed a deliberate and wrongful act.  

In such circumstances, any other provision of this Agreement notwithstanding, the 

City shall have no obligation to pay the Employee for accumulated sick leave or 

vacation time or any other accrued benefits. 

 c. By the City Manager, other than as provided in subsection (b) of this 

Section.  If such action is taken, the City shall pay the Employee, in addition to any 

other amounts to which the Employee is entitled under this Agreement, an amount 

equal to six months of the Employee’s base salary.  Such severance pay will be paid 

to the Employee over a six-month period by checks issued on regular City paydays 

and will have appropriate amounts withheld.  The Employee’s insurance (health, 

dental, vision and life) shall continue to be paid by the City for the same period.  

However, if the Employee secures another position of equal or greater pay during 

the six-month period, the City’s obligation to make severance payments and 

continue insurance will cease.  If the Employee takes another position at less pay 

during the six-month period, the City‘s obligation will be limited to the difference in 

pay for the balance of said six-month period.  For purposes of this section, “another 

position” shall include employment, self-employment, independent contracting, or 

compensation from any source.  The aforesaid severance pay and benefits shall be 



 

 4 

paid to the Employee contingent upon the Employee executing a waiver and release 

of all claims satisfactory to the City. 

 d. Upon termination of the Employee’s employment, the Employee 

shall arrange for the immediate and orderly transfer of the Employee’s office and 

the City-owned personal property, records, documents and other items in the 

Employee’s possession. 

 e. Nothing in this Agreement shall prevent, limit, or otherwise interfere 

with the right of the City to terminate the services of the Employee at any time and 

for any reason, subject only to the provisions set forth in this Section.  Nothing in 

this Agreement shall prevent, limit, or otherwise interfere with the right of the 

Employee to resign at any time from the Employee’s position with the City, subject 

only to the provisions set forth in this Section. 

7.  SCOPE AND AMENDMENTS.  This Agreement is made in accordance 

with the provisions of the City Charter and City Code and shall be the sole agreement of 

the parties, any written or oral contracts to the contrary notwithstanding.  By way of 

illustration and not limitation, any prior agreement or promises, and any collective 

bargaining agreements, have no application to the Employee or to the employment 

relationship between the Employee and the City.  This agreement may not be modified 

orally, but only by an agreement in writing signed by the parties. 

8.  SEVERABILITY.  The invalidity or unenforceability of any term in this 

Agreement shall not affect the validity or enforceability of any other term in this 

Agreement.  If any term in this Agreement is determined to be invalid, unenforceable or 



 

 5 

over broad in any respect, that term shall nevertheless be enforceable to the fullest extent 

permitted by law. 

9.  APPLICABLE LAW.  The terms of this agreement are to be interpreted, 

construed, enforced, and performed under the laws of the State of Michigan. 

10.  ASSIGNMENT.  Neither party may assign its rights, duties or interests in 

this Agreement without the prior written consent of the other party. 

11.  JURISDICTION AND VENUE.  To the extent permitted by law, the 

parties agree that the jurisdiction and venue of any action brought pursuant to or to 

enforce this Agreement shall be solely in state court in Kent County, Michigan. 

12.  BINDING.  This Agreement shall be binding upon the parties and their 

heirs, subrogates, successors and assigns. 

13.  RETURN OF CITY PROPERTY.  The Employee agrees that when the 

Employee’s employment ends, the Employee is responsible for returning any City-owned 

property in the Employee’s possession and for paying any expenses or other amounts that 

the Employee may owe to the City at that time.  The Employee authorizes the City to 

deduct any amount owed from any wage or benefit payments that may be due to the 

Employee. 

14.  SHORTENED LIMITATIONS PERIOD.  The Employee agrees that any 

lawsuit or claim against the City arising out of the Employee’s employment or 

termination of employment (including, but not limited to, claims arising under state, 

federal or local civil rights laws) must be brought within the following time limits or be 

forever barred: (a) for lawsuits requiring a Notice of Right to Sue from the Equal 

Employment Opportunity Commission, within 90 days after the EEOC issues that Notice; 



 

 6 

or (b) for all other lawsuits, within (i) 180 days of the event(s) giving rise to the claim, or 

(ii) the time limits specified by statute, whichever is shorter.  The Employee waives any 

statute of limitations that exceeds this time limit. 

 

 CITY OF WYOMING 

Dated:  _______________ ______________________________ 

 Curtis Holt  

 City Manager 
 

 

 

Dated:  _______________ ______________________________ 

 Brian G. Bennett 

 Deputy Fire Chief 

 (Assistant Deputy Director of Fire Services) 

 

 



6/1/15 
Engineering/RJH: 

 
 

RESOLUTION NO. _______________ 
 

RESOLUTION TO AUTHORIZE THE MAYOR AND CITY CLERK TO  
EXECUTE AN AMENDMENT TO THE LICENSE AGREEMENT WITH  

CONSUMERS ENERGY FOR THE INTERURBAN TRAIL REHABILITATION PROJECT 
 
 

WHEREAS: 
 

1. The City of Wyoming received a Transportation Alternative Program (TAP) grant for the 
rehabilitation of the existing Interurban non-motorized trail from 60th Street to 32nd Street 
in Wyoming. 

2. The current trail is a six-foot wide asphalt trail that runs north-south through Wyoming 
approximately one-quarter mile west of Division. 

3. Consumers Energy has submitted an amended License Agreement dated May 4, 2015, 
allowing the City of Wyoming to widen the existing trail to meet current standards along 
their right-of-way. 

4. The Interurban Rehabilitation project will widen the current trail to a minimum 10 feet 
(with 2-foot shoulders) in width in areas where the trail is off-street and enhance 
pavement markings and signage where the trail is on-street. 

5. The attached License Agreement amendment increases the trail width though the 
Consumers Energy right of way to 14 feet, a10-foot trail with two 2-foot shoulders. 

6. The City of Wyoming’s annual obligation for the amended license agreement remains 
unchanged. 
 

 
NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED: 
 

1. The Major and City Clerk are hereby authorized to execute the attached Amended 
License  Agreement with Consumers Energy for the rehabilitation of the Interurban Trail 
from 60th Street to 32nd Street through Consumers Energy right-of-way.  

 
 
Moved by Councilmember: 
Seconded by Councilmember: 
Motion Carried Yes 
   No 
 
I hereby certify that the foregoing Resolution was adopted by the City Council for the City of 
Wyoming, Michigan at a regular session held on June 1, 2015. 
 
       __________________________________ 
       Kelli A. VandenBerg, Wyoming City Clerk 
 
ATTACHMENT: Amendment to License Agreement 
    
 
Resolution No. _______________ 















6/1/15 
WDD:lmb  
 
 

RESOLUTION NO. __________ 
 

RESOLUTION TO AUTHORIZE EXTENDING THE CONTRACT  
WITH MULTI SERVE FOR CLEANING AND DISINFECTING SERVICES 

 
 
WHEREAS: 
 

1. The city has a contract with Multi Serve to provide cleaning and disinfecting services in 
homes that are affected by a sewer backup or water break. 

2. The three year contract allows for two one year extensions if agreed by the city and Multi 
Serve. This would be the final one year extension period. 

3. Multi Serve is providing high quality service to the residents of Wyoming. 
4. Multi Serve has submitted the attached letter offering to extend their current bid prices 

for one year. 
5. Sufficient funds are available in the Sewer and Water Funds 590-441-54200-930.000 and 

591-441-56700-930.000. 
 
NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED: 
 

1. The City Council agrees to extend the contract for cleaning and disinfecting services with 
Multi Serve for one year. 

 
Moved by Councilmember: 
Seconded by Councilmember: 
Motion Carried Yes 
   No 
 
I hereby certify that the foregoing Resolution was adopted by the City Council for the City of 
Wyoming, Michigan at a regular session held on June 1, 2015. 
 
 
      ________________________________________ 
      Kelli A. VandenBerg, Wyoming City Clerk 
 
ATTACHMENT: 
Letter 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 Resolution No. ____________ 





06/01/15 
Purchasing/KRO 

 

RESOLUTION NO.____________ 
 

RESOLUTION TO AUTHORIZE THE PURCHASE 
OF A 2015 FORD SUV INTERCEPTOR 

 
WHEREAS: 

 
1. As detailed in the attached Staff Report, it is recommended the City Council authorize 

the purchase of a replacement Ford SUV Interceptor from Signature Ford in the total 
amount of $29,243.00. 

2. Michigan Municipal Risk Management Authority (MMRMA) will reimburse the City 
$25,370.00 and cost of transferring the existing police equipment to the new vehicle.  

3. Funds for the purchase are available in the Motor Pool Capital Outlay Depreciation 
and Reserve account number 662-441-58500-985000. 

 
NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED: 

 
1. The City Council does hereby authorize the purchase of a 2015 Ford SUV Interceptor 

in the total amount of $29,243.00. 
2. The Wyoming City Council does hereby waive the provisions of Sections 2-252, 2-

253, 2-254 and 2-256 of the City Code regarding publication and posting of bid 
notices, notification of bidders and the bid opening procedure. 

 
 
Moved by Councilmember: 
Seconded by Councilmember: 
Motion Carried Yes 
   No 
 
I hereby certify that the foregoing Resolution was adopted by the City Council for the City of 
Wyoming, Michigan at a regular session held on June 1, 2015. 
 
 

 ____________________________________ 
ATTACHMENT:     Kelli A. VandenBerg, Wyoming City Clerk 
Staff Report 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Resolution No._______________  
s:\purchasing\resolutions\fy 14-15 resolutions\police vehicle replacement sr.docx 

  



 
 
 

STAFF REPORT 
 
 
DATE:   May 26, 2015 
 
SUBJECT:  Purchase of Replacement Vehicle 
 
FROM:  Ted Seil, Fleet Services Supervisor 
 
Date of Meeting: June 1, 2015 
 
 
RECOMMENDATION 
 
It is recommended that the City Council authorize the purchase of a 2015 Ford SUV Interceptor 
from Signature Ford to replace a Ford SUV Interceptor (Unit 088-002) totaled in an accident on 
May 16, 2015. 
 
SUSTAINABILITY CRITERIA 
 
Environmental Quality 
The Public Works Department is ardently involved in the protection of Michigan’s natural 
resources and the public health and welfare.  By carefully researching and specifying specific 
equipment we will use fewer natural resources by extending the life maintenance cycles and 
durability of city equipment. 
 
Social Equity 
Police vehicles are used to patrol streets and respond to emergency calls within the City.  All of 
the City’s residents enjoy equal access to the benefits of the Public Safety Department. 
 
Economic Strength 
Police vehicles allow our Public Safety Department to protect the citizens of the city 24 hours a 
day to maintain peace and sustain public and private property values. 
 
DISCUSSION 
 
On May 16, 2015, while responding to an emergency call, unit 088-002 was involved in a 
collision resulting in a total loss of the vehicle.  The cost of a new vehicle is $29,243.   Michigan 
Municipal Risk Management Authority will cover $25,370 and Wyoming is responsible for the 
difference of $3,873.  MMRMA will also cover the cost of transferring the existing police 
equipment to the new vehicle. 
 
BUDGET IMPACT 
 
The city’s portion of $3,873 will be paid from the insurance fund. 
 



JRS/sak 
3/2/15 
          

ORDINANCE NO. 5-15 

 
AN ORDINANCE TO AMEND ARTICLE VII  

OF CHAPTER 10 OF THE CODE 
OF THE CITY OF WYOMING 

 
 THE CITY OF WYOMING ORDAINS: 

 Section 1.  That Article VII of Chapter 10 of the Code of the City of Wyoming entitled “Property 

Maintenance Code” is hereby amended to read as follows: 

ARTICLE VII 

PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE 

 

Sec. 10-176. Adoption of Code. 

The International Property Maintenance Code/2012 as published by the International Code 
Council, Inc. is adopted by reference as herein modified for the purposes of protecting the public health, 
safety and welfare in all existing structures, residential and nonresidential, and on all existing premises by 
establishing minimum maintenance standards for all structures and occupants of all structures; and 
providing for administration, enforcement and penalties.  The International Property Maintenance Code 
2012 together with the provisions of this ordinance shall be known and may be cited as the Property 
Maintenance Code of the City of Wyoming. 

Sec. 10-177. References in Code. 

References in the International Property Maintenance Code/2012 to “name of jurisdiction” shall 
mean the City of Wyoming: 

Sec. 10-178. Availability of code. 

Complete copies of the code are available at the office of the city clerk for inspection and 
distribution to the public. 

Sec. 10-179. Changes in code. 

The following sections and subsections of the International Property Maintenance Code 2012 are 
hereby amended as provided herein and additional sections and subsections are added as indicated.  
Section numbers used in this ordinance shall refer to the like numbered sections in International Property 
Maintenance Code/2012. 

 
(1) Section 101.1 is hereby amended to read as follows: 
 
Sec. 101.1 TITLE 
 



 These regulations shall be known as the Property Maintenance Code of Wyoming, 
hereinafter referred to as “this code”. 

 
(2) Section PM-102.3 is hereby amended to read as follows: 

Sec. 102.3 APPLICATION OF OTHER CODES.   

Repairs, additions or alterations to a structure, or changes of occupancy, shall be done in 
accordance with the procedures and provisions of the Michigan Building Code, Michigan Residential 
Code, Michigan Rehabilitation Code for Existing Buildings, Michigan Electrical Code, Michigan 
Mechanical Code, Michigan Plumbing Code and International Fire Code.  Nothing in this code shall be 
construed to cancel, modify or set aside any provision of the Wyoming Zoning Code. 

 (3) Section PM 102.6 is hereby deleted. 

 (4) Section PM 103.1 is hereby amended to read as follows: 

Sec. 103.1 RENTAL REGISTRATION AND INSPECTION. 

(a) No person shall rent, lease or offer for rent or lease any residential unit or 
residential property without first registering said unit or property with the City. 

(b) A residential unit or property may be rented, leased or offered for rent or lease if: 

1. An application is submitted indicating the owner and manager, the number of units 
and buildings for which application is sought, the type of units intended, any other pertinent data 
sought by the Code Official. 

2. All related program fees are paid based on a fee schedule as adopted by the City.  
The fees shall be a debt to the City, which may be assessed as a lien against the property until 
paid. 

3. If an inspection is performed on the property based on any rental inspection 
schedule as adopted by the City all violations disclosed thereby are either corrected or waived by 
the Housing Board of Appeals. 

(c) A registration for properties with four (4) or more units shall be in effect for two (2) 
years from the date of issue unless revoked for cause by the City. 

A certificate for properties with less than four (4) units shall be in effect for four (4) years 
from the date of issue unless revoked for cause by the city. 

Exceptions: 

If a property with less than four (4) units is in violation of one or more of the following, the 
property shall be issued a two (2) year certification. 

Safety: 

(1) Smoke detector violations 

(2) Work completed without a permit 

(3) Eminent electrical hazards 

(4) Eminent mechanical hazards 

(5) Eminent building hazards 



Cosmetic: 

(1) More than one window with broken or missing glazing 

(2) Peeling paint on more than 25% of the building 

(3) Loose or damaged siding, facia or soffit materials on the house or garage.  
Reasonable wear and minor maintenance concerns related to these items shall not 
disqualify property owners from a four year certification. 

(4) Damaged exterior doors on the house or garage that prevents the door from opening 
and/or closing, locking, or operating as designed or where more than 25% of the exterior 
surface area is dented, peeling or otherwise in disrepair. 

(5) Damaged or excessively worn roof/shingles 

Other: 

In addition to any one (1) of the above, if a property has more than four maintenance code 
violations the property shall receive a two (2) year certification. 

 Failure to register and certify a rental unit in accordance with the provisions of this ordinance or 
failure to pay the program fees is a violation of this code. 

d.  Suspension or Revocation of registration. Any registration issued by the City under this 
ordinance may be suspended by the Code Official for cause, and any permit issued by the City 
may be suspended or revoked by the Housing Board of Appeals for cause. The owner shall have 
the right to a hearing before the Housing Board of Appeals on any such action of the Code 
Official, provided a written request therefore is filed with the City Clerk within five (5) days after 
receipt of notice of suspension. The Housing Board of Appeals may confirm the suspension or 
revoke or reinstate the license. The action taken by the Housing Board of Appeals shall be final. 

 
 e.  Cause defined. The term “cause”, as used in this article, shall include the doing or 

omitting of any act, or permitting any condition to exist in connection with any registration 
granted under the provisions of this ordinance, or upon any premises or facilities used in 
connection therewith, which act, omission on condition is: 

 
  (1)  Contrary to the health, safety or welfare of the public. 
  (2)  Unlawful or fraudulent in nature. 
  (3)  Unauthorized or beyond the scope of the registration. 

(4)  Forbidden by the provisions of this ordinance, or any duly established rule or 
 regulation of the City applicable to housing. 

  (5) A nuisance on the registered property. 
 
 f.  Inspections. In order to safeguard the health and welfare and safety of the public, the Code 

Official or his representative is authorized to enter any structure or premises at any reasonable 
time for the purpose of making inspections and performing his duties under this Code. Inspections 
may be made at any time on individual or multiple units as a result of a complaint or if a serious 
health/safety problem is suspected. Scheduled Inspections will be based on any Rental Inspection 
Schedule as adopted by the City. 

 
 g.  Fees. Fees for such licenses and registration shall be set by resolution of the City Council. 



Such fees may reflect the cost of processing, inspection, supervision and other related costs of 
regulations. Fees for not complying with the rental program shall be established by resolution of 
the City Council. 

 
 
 (5) Section 103.2 is hereby amended to read as follows: 
 
 Sec. 103.2 VACANT STRUCTURE AND ABANDONED STRUCTURE. 
 
 (a) No person shall occupy or allow to be occupied, any building that is posted as an Abandoned 
Structure without first obtaining approval for occupancy of said building. 
 
 (b) An Abandoned Structure may be occupied if: 
 

(1) An application is submitted indicating the owner of the property, if the property is to be owner 
occupied or a rental property, and any other pertinent data sought by the code official. 

 
(2) All related inspection service fees are paid based on a fee schedule as adopted by the City Council. 

The fees shall be a debt to the city, which may be enforced by the City against the property owner. 
The City may place such charges on the tax roll to be added to the taxes for the property for the   
next year. 

 
(3) If an inspection is performed on the property based on a fee schedule as adopted by the City, and 

all violations disclosed thereby are either corrected or waived by the Housing Board of Appeals. 
 
 (6) Section 104.7 is hereby added to read as follows: 
 
 Sec. 104.7 LIABILITY.   
 
 The code official, member of the board of appeals or employee charged with the enforcement of 
this code, while acting for the jurisdiction, in good faith and without malice in the discharge of the duties 
required by this code or other pertinent law or ordinance, shall not thereby be rendered liable personally, 
and is hereby relieved from all personal liability for any damage accruing to persons or property as a 
result of an act or by reason of an act or omission in the discharge of official  duties.  Any suit instituted 
against any officer or employee because of an act performed by that officer or employee in the lawful 
discharge of duties and under the provisions of this code shall be defended by the legal representative of 
the jurisdiction until the final termination of the proceedings.  The code official or any subordinate shall 
not be liable for costs in an action, suit or proceeding that is instituted in pursuance of the provisions of 
this code. 
 
 (7) Section 104.8 is hereby added to read as follows: 
 
 Sec. 104.8 FEES.   
 
 The fees for activities and services performed by the department carrying out its responsibilities 
under this code shall be as established by resolution of the City Council. 
 



 (8) Section 106.2 is hereby amended to read as follows: 
 
 Sec. 106.2 PENALTY.  
 
 Violation of any provision of this Article shall be a “municipal civil infraction” with civil fines as 
provided in Sec. 1-27 of the City Code. 
 
 (9) Section 106.4.1 is hereby added to read as follows: 
 
 Sec. 106.4.1 CLEAN UP/DEMOLITION COSTS.  
 
 Should it become necessary for the City to either perform or hire, weed cutting, clean up or 
demolition on any property, all costs shall be assessed against said property as follows: 
 
 1. Clean up/Weed Abatement: cost plus 100% 
 2. Demolition: cost plus 50% 
 
 (10) Section 106.5 is hereby amended to read as follows: 
 
 Sec. 106.5 RIGHT OF ENTRY.   
 
 At any time after written notice of violation is provided to a property owner and/or properly posted 
on the property, an employee of the City or any contractor employed by the City shall have the right to 
enter onto private property to perform any clean up, removal, demolition or any other action reasonably 
necessary to bring the property into compliance with the provisions of this code. 
 
 (11) Section 107.1 is hereby amended to read as follows. 
 
 Sec. 107.1 NOTICE. 
 
 (a) General.  Unless specifically provided herein, notice shall be given in accordance with Section 
1-25 of the City Code. 
 
 (b) Dangerous Buildings.  Notice of dangerous buildings and/or structure unfit for human 
occupancy shall be as follows: 
 
 1. Delivery in accordance with provisions of City Code Section 1-25. 
 
 2. If reasonable efforts under subsection (1) of this section have not been successful, then by 
posting a copy of the notice, for 24 hours in poster or letter form in a conspicuous place on the premises to 
be repaired or demolished. 
 
 (12) Section 107.2 is hereby amended to read as follows: 
 
 Sec. 107.2 UNAUTHORIZED TAMPERING.  
 
 Signs, tags or seals posted or affixed by the code official shall not be mutilated, destroyed or 



tampered with, or removed without authorization from the code official. 
 
 (13) Section 107.3 is hereby amended to read as follows: 
 
 Sec. 107.3 PENALTIES.  
 
 Penalties for noncompliance with orders and notices shall be as set forth in Section 106.2. 
 
 (14) Section 107.4 is hereby amended to read as follows: 
 
 Sec. 107.4 TRANSFER OF OWNERSHIP.  
 
 It shall be unlawful for the owner of any dwelling unit or structure who has received a compliance 
order or upon whom a notice of violation has been served to sell, transfer, mortgage, lease or otherwise dis-
pose of such dwelling unit or structure to another until the provisions of the compliance order or notice of 
violation have been complied with, or until such owner shall first furnish the grantee, transferee, mortgagee 
or lessee a true copy of any compliance order or notice of violation issued by the code official and shall 
furnish to the code official a signed and notarized statement from the grantee, transferee, mortgagee or 
lessee, acknowledging the receipt of such compliance order or notice of violation and fully accepting the 
responsibility without condition for making the corrections or repairs required by such compliance order or 
notice of violation. 
 
 (15) Section 108.1.5 is hereby amended to read as follows: 
 
 Sec. 108.1.5 DANGEROUS STRUCTURE OR PREMISES.  
 
 For the purpose of this code, any structure or a premise that has any or all of the conditions or 
defects described below shall be considered dangerous: 
 
 1. Any door, aisle, passageway, stairway, exit or other means of egress that does not conform 
to the approved building or fire code of the jurisdiction related to the requirements for existing buildings. 
 
 2. The walking surface of any aisle, passageway, stairway, exit or other means of egress is so 
warped, worn loose, torn or otherwise unsafe as to not provide safe and adequate means of egress. 
 
 3. Any portion of a building, structure or appurtenance that has been damaged by fire, 
earthquake, wind, flood, deterioration, neglect, abandonment, vandalism or by any other cause to such an 
extent that it is likely to partially or completely collapse, or to become detached or dislodged. 
 
 4. Any portion of a building, or any member, appurtenance or ornamentation on the exterior 
thereof that is not of sufficient strength or stability, or is not so anchored, attached or fastened in place so 
as to be capable of resisting natural or artificial loads of one and one-half the original designed value. 
 
 5. The building or structure, or part of the building or structure, because of dilapidation, 
deterioration, decay, faulty construction, the removal or movement of some portion of the ground necessary 
for the support, or for any other reason, is likely to partially or completely collapse, or some portion of the 
foundation or underpinning of the building or structure is likely to fail or give way. 



 
 6. The building or structure, or any portion thereof, is clearly unsafe for its use and 
occupancy. 
 
 7. The building or structure is neglected, damaged, dilapidated, unsecured or abandoned so as 
to become an attractive nuisance to children who might play in the building or structure to their danger, 
becomes a harbor for vagrants, criminals or immoral persons, or enables persons to resort to the building 
or structure for committing a nuisance or an unlawful act. 
 
 8. Any building or structure has been constructed, exists or is maintained in violation of any 
specific requirement or prohibition applicable to such building or structure provided by the approved 
building or fire code of the jurisdiction, or of any law or ordinance to such an extent as to present either a 
substantial risk of fire, building collapse or any other threat to life and safety. 
 
 9. A building or structure, used or intended to be used for dwelling purposes, because of 
inadequate maintenance, dilapidation, decay, damage, faulty construction or arrangement, inadequate 
light, ventilation, mechanical or plumbing system, or otherwise, is determined by the code official to be 
unsanitary, unfit for human habitation or in such a condition that is likely to cause sickness or disease. 
 
 10. Any building or structure, because of a lack of sufficient or proper fire-resistance-rated 
construction, fire protection systems, electrical system, fuel construction, mechanical system, plumbing 
system or other cause, is determined by the code official to be a threat to life or health. 
 
 11. Any portion of a building remains on a site after the demolition or destruction of the 
building or structure or whenever any building or structure is abandoned so as to constitute such building 
or portion thereof as an attractive nuisance, hazard or blighting influence to the public, as determined by 
the Planning Department, Building Inspections Department and Housing Board of Appeals. 
 
 12. Whenever the Code Official estimates the cost of placing the building in safe and sanitary 
condition exceeds 50% of real value as determined by the City Assessor. 
 
 13.  Any natural structure, because of dilapidation, deterioration, decay or removal of some 
portion of the structure or ground necessary for the support is likely to collapse, fail or give way. 
 

 (16) Section 108.1.6 is hereby added to read as follows: 
 
 Sec. 108.1.6 NOTICE OF DANGEROUS AND UNSAFE CONDITION.   
 
 Whenever the Code Official has declared a building as dangerous, he shall give a written notice of 
such declaration and the required repairs or demolition of the building to the owner of the building.  Such 
notice shall include the following: 
 

1. A description or address for the real estate. 
 
2. A statement of the violations, referring to the sections of this article or any other section of the 

City Code. 
 



3. A statement obligating the owner to bring the building into complete compliance with this code 
and all other applicable sections of the City Code, or to demolish and remove the building. 

 
4. A reasonable time limit for the completion of the repair or demolition, not to exceed 90 days. 
 
5. A statement requiring the owner to state his intentions as to the repair or demolition order within 

ten days.  The owner shall so state his intentions in writing to the City within such ten-day period. 
 Failure to respond shall be considered a negative response which may result in the City 
implementing accelerated compliance measures. 

 
 (17) Section 108.3 is hereby amended to read as follows: 
 
 Sec. 108.3 NOTICE.  
 
 Whenever the code official has condemned a structure or equipment under the provisions of this 
section, notice shall be posted in a conspicuous place in or about the structure affected by such notice and 
served on the owner or the person or persons responsible for the structure or equipment in accordance with 
Section 107.1. The notice shall be in the form prescribed in Section 108.1.6 
 
 (18) Section 110.2 is hereby deleted. 
 
 (19) Section 111.1 is hereby amended to read as follows: 
 
 Sec. 111.1 HOUSING BOARD OF APPEALS CREATION.  
 
 The Housing Board of Appeals is hereby created and is referred to in this article as the Housing 
Board. 
 
 (20) Section 111.2 is hereby amended to read as follows: 
 
 Sec. 111.2 MEMBERSHIP.  
 
 The housing board shall consist of five persons appointed by the city council who shall be 
experienced in the building and housing field by having a background as a professional engineer, 
architect, member of a building construction trade, industry, banking and finances, with experience in 
home mortgages, real estate sales or such other persons as the city council may deem able to serve the 
best interests of the city. 
 
 (21) Section 111.3 is hereby amended to read as follows: 
 
 Sec. 111.3 APPOINTMENT; TERMS, VACANCIES.  
 
 Each member of the housing board shall be appointed for a term of five years, except that for the 
first appointments members shall be appointed for one, two, three, four and five years, respectively. All 
vacancies shall be filled for the unexpired term. 
 
 (22) Section 111.4 is hereby amended to read as follows: 



 
 Sec. 111.4 PROCEDURAL RULES; OFFICERS; MINUTES.  
 
 The housing board shall adopt its own procedural rules. There shall be a chairman, vice-chairman 
and secretary. The secretary shall keep minutes of each meeting, and a copy shall be given to the city 
clerk. 
 
 (23) Section 111.4.1 is hereby deleted. 
 
 (24) Section 111.5 is hereby amended to read as follows: 
 
 Sec. 111.5 APPEALS PROCEDURE. 
 
 Any person who is aggrieved with the ruling or decision of any city official which relates to the 
interpretation or enforcement of any of the provisions of this code may appeal such ruling or decision to 
the housing board. Such appeal shall be in writing on the form supplied by the city and shall be filed 
within ten days of such ruling or decision. 
 
 (25) Section 111.6 is hereby amended to read as follows: 
 
 Sec. 111.6 POWERS AND DUTIES. 
 
 The housing board shall hear, review and decide appeals from any order, requirement, decision or 
determination made by any city official charged with the enforcement of this code. The housing board 
may grant variances from the terms of the housing code as will not be contrary to the public interest, 
where owing to special conditions, as demonstrated by facts presented to or obtained by the housing 
board, a literal enforcement of the provisions of this code would result in unnecessary hardship. In 
exercising its powers, the housing board may reverse, modify or affirm, wholly or in part, the order 
requirement, decision or determination appealed from, and to that extent shall have all the powers of the 
city official from whom the appeal was taken. 
 
 (26) Section 111.7 is hereby amended to read as follows: 
 
 Sec. 111.7 CONDITIONS TO BE MET FOR VARIATIONS, REVERSALS OR 
MODIFICATIONS. 
 
 No variation, reversal or modification of provisions of this code shall be made by the housing 
board unless all of the following conditions are met: 
 
1. There are exceptional or extraordinary circumstances or conditions related to the property or to the 
intended use which would cause unreasonable hardship by the strict enforcement of the terms of the 
housing code, or that the appellant would be deprived of a substantial property right. 
 
2. Property values in the near vicinity will not be adversely affected. 
 
3. The public health, safety or welfare of any person or any property will not be jeopardized. 
 



 (27) Section 111.8 is hereby amended to read as follows: 
 
 Sec. 111.8 FINDING OF FACTS.  
 
 The housing board in granting or denying an appeal shall make findings of facts to each part of 
section 111.7 of this code and such findings shall be recorded in the minutes. Any appeal granted without 
such finding shall be void. If there is doubt as to whether an appeal should be granted, then such doubt 
shall be resolved in denying of the appeal. 
 
 (28) Section 111.9 is hereby added to read as follows: 
 
 Sec. 111.9 BINDING CLAUSE.  
 
 Where an appeal has been granted by the housing board, the variations or modifications allowed 
shall apply to any similar requirements in other sections of this Code. 
 
 (29) Section 111.10 is hereby added to read as follows. 
 
 Sec. 111.10 COURT REVIEW.  
 
 Any person, whether or not a previous party to the appeal, shall have the right to apply to the 
appropriate court for a review to correct errors of law. Application for review shall be made in the manner 
and time required by law following the filing of the decision of office of the Code Official. 
 
 (30) Section 112.4 is hereby amended to read as follows: 
 
 Sec. 112.4 FAILURE TO COMPLY.  
 
 Any person who shall continue any work after having been served with a stop work order, except 
such work as that person is directed to perform to remove a violation or unsafe condition, shall be subject 
to a civil infraction citation and the penalties prescribed by this code. 
 

 (31) Section 201.3 is hereby amended to read as follows: 
 
 Sec. 201.3 TERMS DEFINED IN OTHER CODES.  
 
 Where terms are not defined in this code and are defined in the Michigan Building Code,  
Michigan Residential Code, Michigan Rehabilitation Code for Existing Buildings, Michigan Electrical 
Code, Michigan Mechanical Code, Michigan Plumbing Code or International Fire Code, such terms 
shall have the meanings ascribed to them as stated in those codes. 
 
 (32) The following definitions are hereby added to Section 202: 
 
ABANDONED STRUCTURE.  A structure that has been vacant for 30 or more days and meets any of 
the following criteria: 
 

1. Provides a location for loitering, vagrancy, unauthorized entry or other criminal activity. 



 
2. Has been boarded for at least 60 days. 
 
3. Has taxes in arrears for a period of time exceeding 365 days. 
 
4. Has a utility or utilities disconnected. 
 
5. Is not maintained in compliance with the Property Maintenance Code. 

 
BLIGHT Any deteriorated condition of land or structure that contributes to a decrease in the aesthetics or 
overall desirability of the property. 
 
BOARDING HOUSE, LODGING HOUSE, TOURIST HOUSE. A building having one kitchen and 
used for the purpose of providing meals or lodging, or both meals and lodging, to persons other than 
members of the family occupying such dwelling. In the case of single-family and two-family dwellings, 
the number of roomers or boarders shall not exceed one per dwelling unit. 
 
CODE ENFORCEMENT ACTIVITY. – All activities performed by city staff or designee to locate, 
identify and abate violations of city code. 
 
NATURAL STRUCTURE. Any structure that is created or grown from natural sources. 
 
NOXIOUS WEEDS.  Means an annual, biennial or perennial plant designated by the Michigan 
Commissioner of Agriculture as injurious to public health, the environment, public roads or other 
property. 
 
ONE-FAMILY DWELLING. A building containing one (1) dwelling unit with not more than one 
lodger or boarder. 
 
PUBLIC NUISANCE.  Includes any of the following: 
 

1. The physical condition or occupancy of any premises regarded as a public nuisance at common 
law; 

 
2. Any physical condition or occupancy of a premises or its appurtenances considered an attractive 

nuisance to children, including, but not limited to, abandoned wells, shafts, basements, 
excavations and unsafe fences or structures; 

 
3. Any premises that has unsanitary sewerage or plumbing facilities; 
 
4. Any premises designated as unsafe for human habitation; 
 
5. Any premises that is manifestly capable of being a fire hazard, or is manifestly unsafe or 

unsecured so as to endanger life, limb or property; 
 
6. Any premises from which the plumbing, heating or facilities required by this code have been 

removed, or from which utilities have been disconnected, destroyed, removed or rendered 
ineffective, or the required precautions against trespassers have not been provided; 



 
7. Any premises that is unsanitary, or that is littered with rubbish or garbage, or that has uncontrolled 

growth of weeds; or 
 
8. Any natural or man-made structure that is in a state of dilapidation, deterioration or decay; faulty 

construction; overcrowded; open, vacant or abandoned; damaged by fire to the extent so as not 
provide shelter; in danger of collapse or failure; and dangerous to anyone on or near the premises. 

 
RANK VEGETATION. Means uncultivated plants growing at a rapid rate due to unplanned, 
unintentional, or accidental circumstances. 
 
VACANT STRUCTURE.  A structure that is vacant and does not meet the definition of the Abandoned 
Structure or Dangerous Building. 
 

 (33) Section 301.4 is hereby added to read as follows: 
 
 Sec. 301.4 ANIMALS AND BEES.   
 
 No horse, cow, calf, swine, sheep, goat, chickens, bees, pigeons, geese, ducks, rabbits, or any 
protected wild animal shall be kept in any dwelling, nor shall any such animals or bees be kept on the 
same lot or premises with a dwelling, except under conditions prescribed by the code official so as not to 
constitute a nuisance to any neighbors or property and so as not to constitute any nuisance, health or 
safety hazard. 
 
 (34) Section 302.4 is hereby amended to read as follows: 
 
 Sec. 302.4 WEEDS.  
 
 All premises and exterior property shall be maintained free from weeds in excess of twelve (12) 
inches in height.  All noxious weeds and rank vegetation shall be prohibited.  
Upon failure of the owner or agent having charge of a property to cut and destroy weeds after service of a 
notice of violation, they shall be subject to prosecution in accordance with Section 106.2 and as 
prescribed by the City. Upon failure to comply with the notice of violation, any duly authorized employee 
of the City or contractor hired by the City shall be authorized to enter upon the property in violation and 
cut and destroy the weeds growing thereon, and the costs of such removal shall be paid by the owner or 
agent responsible for the property.  Fees for such action shall be charged in accordance with section 
106.4.1 
 
 (35) Section 302.8 is hereby amended to read as follows: 
 
 Sec. 302.8 MOTOR VEHICLES.  
 
 Except as provided for in other regulations, no inoperative or unlicensed motor vehicle shall be 
parked, kept or stored outdoors on any premises, and no vehicle shall at any time be in a state of major 
disassembly, disrepair, or in the process of being stripped or dismantled. Painting of vehicles is 
prohibited unless conducted inside an approved spray booth. 
Exception: A vehicle of any type is permitted to undergo major overhaul, including body work, 



provided that such work is performed inside a structure or similarly enclosed area designed and 
approved for such purposes. 
 
 (36) Section 304.1.1 is hereby amended to read as follows: 
 
 Sec. 304.1.1 UNSAFE CONDITIONS. 
 
 The following conditions shall be determined as unsafe and shall be repaired or replaced to 
comply with the Michigan Building Code or the Michigan Existing Building Code as required for 
existing buildings: 
 

1. The nominal strength of any structural member is exceeded by nominal loads, the load effects or 
the required strength; 

 
2. The anchorage of the floor or roof to walls or columns, and of walls and columns to foundations is 

not capable of resisting all nominal loads or load effects; 
 
3. Structures or components thereof that have reached their limit state; 
 
4. Siding and masonry joints including joints between the building envelope and the perimeter of 

windows, doors and skylights are not maintained, weather resistant or water tight; 
 
5. Structural members that have evidence of deterioration or that are not capable of safely supporting 

all nominal loads and load effects; 
 
6. Foundation systems that are not firmly supported by footings, are not plumb and free from open 

cracks and breaks, are not properly anchored or are not capable of supporting all nominal loads 
and resisting all load effects; 

 
7. Exterior walls that are not anchored to supporting and supported elements or are not plumb and 

free of holes, cracks or breaks and loose or rotting materials, are not properly anchored or are not 
capable of supporting all nominal loads and resisting all load effects; 

 
8. Roofing or roofing components that have defects that admit rain, roof surfaces with inadequate 

drainage, or any portion of the roof framing that is not in good repair with signs of deterioration, 
fatigue or without proper anchorage and incapable of supporting all nominal loads and resisting all 
load effects; 

 
9. Flooring and flooring components with defects that affect serviceability or flooring components 

that show signs of deterioration or fatigue, are not properly anchored or are incapable of 
supporting all nominal loads and resisting all load effects; 

 
10. Veneer, cornices, belt courses, corbels, trim, wall facings and similar decorative features not 

properly anchored or that are anchored with connections not capable of supporting all nominal 
loads and resisting all load effects; 

 
11. Overhang extensions or projections including, but not limited to, trash chutes, canopies, marquees, 

signs, awnings, fire escapes, standpipes and exhaust ducts not properly anchored or that are 



anchored with connections not capable of supporting all nominal loads and resisting all load 
effects; 

 
12. Exterior stairs, decks, porches, balconies and all similar appurtenances attached thereto, 

including guards and handrails, are not structurally sound, not properly anchored or that are 
anchored with connections not capable of supporting all nominal loads and resisting all load 
effects; or 

 
13. Chimneys, cooling towers, smokestacks and similar appurtenances not structurally sound or not 

properly anchored, or that are anchored with connections not capable of supporting all nominal 
loads and resisting all load effects. 

Exceptions: 
1. When substantiated otherwise by an approved method. 
2. Demolition of unsafe conditions shall be permitted when approved by the code official. 

 
 (37) Section 304.13.1 is hereby amended to read as follows: 
 
 Sec. 304.13.1 GLAZING.   
 
 Every window sash shall be fully supplied with approved glazing. 
 
 (38) Section 304.14 is hereby amended to read as follows: 
 
 Sec. 304.14 INSECT SCREENS. 
 
 During the period from April 1st  to October 31st every door, window and other outside opening 
required for ventilation of habitable rooms, food preparation areas, food service areas or any areas where 
products to be included or utilized in food for human consumption are processed, manufactured, 
packaged or stored shall be supplied with approved tightly fitting screens of minimum 16 mesh per inch 
(16 mesh per 25 mm), and every screen door used for insect control shall have a self-closing device in 
good working condition. 
 
Exception: Screens shall not be required where other approved means, such as air curtains or insect 
repellent fans, are employed. 
 
 (39) Section 305.1.1 is hereby amended to read as follows: 
 
 Sec 305.1.1 UNSAFE CONDITIONS. 
 
 The following conditions shall be determined as unsafe and shall be repaired or replaced to 
comply with the Michigan Building Code, the Michigan Residential Code or the Michigan 
Rehabilitation Code as required for existing buildings: 
 

1. The nominal strength of any structural member is exceeded by nominal loads, the load effects or 
the required strength; 

 
2. The anchorage of the floor or roof to walls or columns, and of walls and columns to foundations 

is not capable of resisting all nominal loads or load effects; 



 
3. Structures or components thereof that have reached their limit state; 
 
4. Structural members are incapable of supporting nominal loads and load effects; 
 
5. Stairs, landings, balconies and all similar walking surfaces, including guards and handrails, are 

not structurally sound, not properly anchored or are anchored with connections not capable of 
supporting all nominal loads and resisting all load effects; 

 
6. Foundation systems that are not firmly supported by footings are not plumb and free from open 

cracks and breaks, are not properly anchored or are not capable of supporting all nominal loads 
and resisting all load effects. 

 
Exceptions: 

1. When substantiated otherwise by an approved method. 
2. Demolition of unsafe conditions shall be permitted when approved by the code official. 

 
 (40) Section 305.7 is hereby added to read as follows: 
 
 Sec. 305.7 FLOORS. 
 
 Every toilet, bathroom and kitchen floor surface shall be constructed and maintained so as to be 
substantially impervious to water and so as to permit such floor to be easily kept in a clean and sanitary 
condition. All floor surfaces throughout a dwelling unit shall be maintained in a sound condition, 
securely fastened, free of holes, tears or open areas, and kept in such a manner so as not to contribute to 
unsafe or unsanitary conditions. 
 
 (41) Section 305.8 is hereby added to read as follows: 
 
 Sec. 305.8 FREE FROM DAMPNESS. 
 
 Every building, basement and crawl space shall be maintained to prevent conditions conducive to 
decay or deterioration of the structure. 
 
 (42) Section 306.1.1 is hereby amended as follows: 
 
 Sec. 306.1.1 UNSAFE CONDITIONS. 
 
 Where any of the following conditions cause the component or system to be beyond its limit 
state, the component or system shall be determined as unsafe and shall be repaired or replaced to comply 
with the Michigan Building Code, Michigan Residential Code, Michigan Rehabilitation Code as 
required for existing buildings: 
 

1. Soils that have been subjected to any of the following conditions: 
1.1 Collapse of footing or foundation system; 
1.2 Damage to footing, foundation, concrete or other structural element due to soil 

expansion; 
1.3 Adverse effects to the design strength of footing, foundation, concrete or other structural 



element due to a chemical reaction from the soil; 
1.4 Inadequate soil as determined by a geotechnical investigation; 
1.5 Where the allowable bearing capacity of the soil is in doubt; or 
1.6 Adverse effects to the footing, foundation, concrete or other structural element due to the 

ground water table. 
2. Concrete that has been subjected to any of the following conditions: 

2.1 Deterioration; 
2.2 Ultimate deformation; 
2.3 Fractures; 
2.4 Fissures; 
2.5 Spalling; 
2.6 Exposed reinforcement; or 
2.7 Detached, dislodged or failing connections. 

3. Aluminum that has been subjected to any of the following conditions: 
3.1 Deterioration; 
3.2 Corrosion; 
3.3 Elastic deformation; 
3.4 Ultimate deformation; 
3.5 Stress or strain cracks; 
3.6 Joint fatigue; or 
3.7 Detached, dislodged or failing connections. 

4. Masonry that has been subjected to any of the following conditions: 
4.1 Deterioration; 
4.2 Ultimate deformation; 
4.3 Fractures in masonry or mortar joints; 
4.4 Fissures in masonry or mortar joints; 
4.5 Spalling; 
4.6 Exposed reinforcement; or 
4.7 Detached, dislodged or failing connections. 

5. Steel that has been subjected to any of the following conditions: 
5.1 Deterioration; 
5.2 Elastic deformation; 
5.3 Ultimate deformation; 
5.4 Metal fatigue; or 
5.5 Detached, dislodged or failing connections. 

6. Wood that has been subjected to any of the following conditions: 
6.1 Ultimate deformation;  
6.2 Deterioration; 
6.3 Damage from insects, rodents and other vermin; 
6.4 Fire damage beyond charring;  
6.5 Significant splits and checks; 
6.6 Horizontal shear cracks; 
6.7 Vertical shear cracks; 
6.8 Inadequate support; 
6.9 Detached, dislodged or failing connections; or 

6.10 Excessive cutting and notching.  
Exceptions: 

1. When substantiated otherwise by an approved method. 



2. Demolition of unsafe conditions shall be permitted when approved by the code official. 
 
 (43) Section 308.3.1 is hereby deleted 
 

 (44) Section 308.3.2 is hereby deleted



1 

 

 

 (45) Section 401.3 is hereby amended to read as follows: 
 
 Sec. 401.3 ALTERNATIVE DEVICES. 
 
 In lieu of the means for natural light and ventilation herein prescribed, artificial light or 
mechanical ventilation complying with the Michigan Building Code, and Michigan Residential 
Code, shall be permitted. 
 
 (46) Section 502.5 is hereby amended to read as follows: 
 
 Sec. 502.5 PUBLIC TOILET FACILITIES. 
 
 Public toilet facilities shall be maintained in a safe, sanitary and working condition in 
accordance with the Michigan Plumbing Code.  Except for periodic maintenance or cleaning, public 
access and use shall be provided to the toilet facilities at all times during occupancy of the premises. 
 
 (47) Section 505.1 is hereby amended to read as follows: 
 
 Sec. 505.1 GENERAL 
 
 Every sink, lavatory, bathtub or shower, drinking fountain, water closet or 
other plumbing fixture shall be properly connected to either a public water system or 
to an approved private water system.  All kitchen sinks, lavatories, laundry facilities, 
bathtubs and showers shall be supplied with hot or tempered and cold running water 
in accordance with the Michigan Plumbing Code. 
 
 (48) Section 602.2 is hereby amended to read as follows: 
 
 Sec. 602.2 RESIDENTIAL OCCUPANCIES. 
 
 Dwellings shall be provided with heating facilities capable of maintaining a room 
temperature of 68°F (20°C) in all habitable rooms, bathrooms and toilet rooms based on the 
winter outdoor design temperature for the locality indicated in Appendix D of the Michigan 
Building Code or the Michigan Residential Code or the Michigan Plumbing Code. Cooking 
appliances shall not be used, nor shall portable unvented fuel-burning space heaters be used, as a 
means to provide required heating. 
 
 (49) Section 602.3 is hereby amended to read as follows: 
 
 Sec. 602.3 HEAT SUPPLY. 
 
 Every owner and operator of any building who rents, leases or lets one or more 
dwelling units or sleeping units on terms, either expressed or implied, to furnish heat to the 
occupants thereof shall supply heat to maintain the room temperatures specified in Section 
602.2 in this code. 
 



 

  
 

Exceptions: 
1. When the outdoor temperature is below the winter outdoor design temperature for 

the locality, maintenance of the minimum room temperature shall not be required 
provided that the heating system is operating at its full design capacity. The 
winter outdoor design temperature for the locality shall be as indicated in 
Appendix D of the Michigan Plumbing Code. 

 
2. In areas where the average monthly temperature is above 30°F (-1°C) a minimum 

temperature of 65°F (18°C) shall be maintained. 
 
 (50) Section 602.3.1 is hereby added to read as follows: 
 
 Sec. 602.3.1 NONRESIDENTIAL STRUCTURES.  
 
 Every enclosed occupied work space shall be supplied with sufficient heat to maintain a 
temperature of not less than 65 degrees F. (18 degrees C.) during all working hours. 
 
 (51) Section 602.4 is hereby amended to read as follows: 
 
 Sec. 602.4 ROOM TEMPERATURE MEASUREMENT. 
 
 The required room temperatures shall be measured 3 feet (914 mm) above the floor near 
the center of the room and 2 feet (610 mm) inward from the center of each exterior wall. 
 
 (52) Section 602.5 is hereby deleted. 
 
 (53) Section 604.2 is hereby amended to read as follows: 
 
 Sec. 604.2 SERVICE. 
 
 The size and usage of appliances and equipment shall serve as a basis for determining the 
need for additional facilities in accordance with Michigan Building Code, the Michigan 
Residential Code and/or Michigan Electrical Code. Dwelling units shall be served by a three-
wire, 120/240 volt, single-phase electrical service having a minimum rating of 60 amperes. 
 
  (54) Section 604.3.1.1 is hereby amended to read as follows: 
 
 Sec. 604.3.1.1 ELECTRICAL EQUIPMENT. 
 
 Electrical distribution equipment, motor circuits, power equipment, transformers, wire, 
cable, flexible cords, wiring devices, ground fault circuit interrupters, surge protectors, molded 
case circuit breakers, low-voltage fuses, luminaires, ballasts, motors and electronic control, 
signaling and communication equipment that have been exposed to water shall be replaced in 
accordance with the provisions of the Michigan Building Code and/or the Michigan Residential 
Code or the Michigan Electrical Code. 
 
Exception: The following equipment shall be allowed to be repaired where an inspection report 



 

  
 

from the equipment manufacturer or approved manufacturer's representative indicates that the 
equipment has not sustained damage that requires replacement: 
 

1. Enclosed switches, rated a maximum of 600 volts or less; 
2. Busway, rated a maximum of 600 volts; 
3. Panelboards, rated a maximum of 600 volts; 
4. Switchboards, rated a maximum of 600 volts; 
5. Fire pump controllers, rated a maximum of 600 volts; 
6. Manual and magnetic motor controllers; 
7. Motor control centers; 
8. Alternating current high-voltage circuit breakers; 
9. Low-voltage power circuit breakers; 
10. Protective relays, meters and current transformers; 
11. Low- and medium-voltage switchgear; 
12. Liquid-filled transformers; 
13. Cast-resin transformers; 
14. Wire or cable that is suitable for wet locations and whose ends have not been 

exposed to water; 
15. Wire or cable, not containing fillers, that is suitable for wet locations and whose 

ends have not been exposed to water; 
16. Luminaires that are listed as submersible; 
17. Motors; 
18. Electronic control, signaling and communication equipment. 

 
  (55) Section 604.3.2.1 is hereby amended to read as follows: 
 
 Sec. 604.3.2.1 ELECTRICAL EQUIPMENT. 
 
 Electrical switches, receptacles and fixtures, including furnace, water heating, security 
system and power distribution circuits that have been exposed to fire, shall be replaced in 
accordance with the provisions of the Michigan Electrical Code and or the Michigan Building 
Code and Michigan Residential Code 
 
Exception: Electrical switches, receptacles and fixtures that shall be allowed to be repaired 
where an inspection report from the equipment manufacturer or approved manufacturer's 
representative indicates that the equipment has not sustained damage that requires replacement. 
 
 (56) Section 702.3 is hereby amended to read as follows: 
 
 Sec. 702.3 LOCKED DOORS 
 
 All means of egress doors shall be readily openable from the side from which egress is to 
be made without the need for keys, special knowledge or effort, except where the door hardware 
conforms to that permitted by the Michigan Residential Code and the Michigan Building Code. 
 
 

 (57) Section 704.1 is hereby amended to read as follows. 



 

  
 

 
 Sec. 704.1 GENERAL. 
 
  All systems, devices and equipment to detect a fire, actuate an alarm, or 
suppress or control a fire or any combination thereof shall be maintained in an openable 
condition at all times in accordance with the  International Fire Code,  the Michigan 
Building Code, the Michigan Residential Code and the Michigan Mechanical Code. 
 
 (58) Section 704.1.1 is hereby amended to read as follows: 
 
 Sec. 704.1.1 AUTOMATIC SPRINKLER SYSTEMS. 
 
 Inspection, testing and maintenance of automatic sprinkler systems shall be in accordance 
with NFPA 25, the Michigan Building Code and Michigan Residential Code. 
 

 (59) Section 704.2 is hereby amended to read as follows. 
 
 Sec. 704.2 SMOKE ALARMS. 
 
 Single- or multiple-station smoke alarms shall be installed and maintained in Group R-2, 
R-3 or R-4 and in dwellings not regulated in Group R occupancies, regardless of occupant load 
at all of the following locations: 
 

1. On the ceiling or wall outside of each separate sleeping area in the immediate 
vicinity of bedrooms. 

 
2. In each room used for sleeping purposes. 
 
3. In each story within a dwelling unit, including basements and cellars but not 

including crawl spaces and uninhabitable attics. In dwellings or dwelling units 
with split levels and without an intervening door between the adjacent levels, a 
smoke alarm installed on the upper level shall suffice for the adjacent lower level 
provided that the lower level is less than one full story below the upper level. 

 
Single- or multiple-station smoke alarms shall be installed in other groups in accordance with the 
International Fire Code. Michigan Building Code and Michigan Residential Code. 
 

 (60) Section 704.3. is hereby amended to read as follows. 
 
 Sec. 704.3 POWER SOURCE. 
 
 In Group R occupancies and in dwellings not regulated as Group R occupancies, single-
station smoke alarms shall receive their primary power from the building wiring provided that 
such wiring is served from a commercial source and shall be equipped with a batter backup. 
Smoke alarms shall emit a signal when the batteries are low. Wiring shall be permanent and 
without a disconnecting switch other than as required for overcurrent protection. 
 
 Exception: Smoke alarms are permitted to be solely battery operated in buildings where 



 

  
 

no construction is taking place, buildings that are not served from a commercial power source 
and in existing areas of buildings undergoing alterations or repairs that do not result in the 
removal of interior wall or ceiling finishes exposing the structure, unless there is an attic, crawl 
space or basement available which could provide access for building wiring without the removal 
of interior finishes. Where allowed, battery powered smoke detectors shall be energized with not 
less than a five year battery. 

 

Section 2.  This ordinance shall be in full force and effect on the ______ day of 

_______________, 2015. 

 
 I hereby certify that the above-entitled Ordinance was adopted by the City of Wyoming at a 

________________ session of the City Council held on the ______ day of _______________, 2015. 

 
                                                                  
                                    Kelli A. VandenBerg               
                                                                  Wyoming City Clerk 
 
 
 
Ordinance No. 5-15 



5/4/15 
Clerk/RG 

ORDINANCE NO. 6-15 

 
AN ORDINANCE TO AMEND SECTION 90-32 OF THE CODE OF THE  

CITY OF WYOMING BY ADDING SUBSECTION (100) THERETO  
 
THE CITY OF WYOMING ORDAINS: 
 
 Section 1.  That Section 90-32 of the Code of the City of Wyoming is hereby amended by 
adding Subsection (100) thereto, to read as follows: 
 
 (100) To rezone 0.4 acres from RO-1 Restricted Office to B-1 Local Business (4992 Wilson 

Avenue) 
 
LEGAL DESCRIPTION: 
 
THE WEST 183 FEET OF THE SOUTH 140 FEET OF THE NORTH 1/2 OF THE 
SOUTHWEST 1/4 OF SECTION 29, TOWN 6 NORTH, RANGE 12 WEST; CITY OF 
WYOMING, KENT COUNTY, MICHIGAN.  SUBJECT TO AN EASEMENT FOR HIGHWAY 
PURPOSES OVER THE WEST 33 FEET THEREOF. 
 
 Section 2.  This ordinance shall be in full force and effect on the ____ day of June, 2015. 

 
 I hereby certify that the above-entitled Ordinance was adopted by the City of Wyoming at a 
regular session of the City Council held on the ______ day of June, 2015. 
 
                                                                  
                                    Kelli A. VandenBerg 
                                                                  Wyoming City Clerk 
 
Ordinance No. 6-15 























JRS/sak 
6/1/15 
 

ORDINANCE NO. 7-15 

 
AN ORDINANCE TO AMEND SUBSECTIONS (3)b, (3)c  

AND (3)d OF SECTION 90-50 OF THE CODE OF  
THE CITY OF WYOMING 

 
 THE CITY OF WYOMING ORDAINS: 

 Section 1.  That Section 90-50(3)b of the Code of the City of Wyoming is hereby amended 

to read as follows: 

b.  No more than one recreational vehicle, and one utility trailer, may be kept or stored 

outdoors at any one time. 

 Section 2.  That Section 90-50(3)c of the Code of the City of Wyoming is hereby amended to 

read as follows: 

c.  Storage of recreational vehicles and trailers shall be in the rear yard only.  Where there 

is no access available to the rear yard, such vehicles may be located on the side yard, provided 

that they are parked or stored at least three feet from the side lot line, that such vehicles are 

parked and stored at least 12 feet from the residential dwelling on the adjoining property, and 

that such vehicles shall not exceed 32 feet in length or 12 feet in total height. 

 Section 3.  That Section 90-50(3)d of the Code of the City of Wyoming is hereby amended 

to read as follows: 

d.  The recreational vehicles and trailers shall be in good repair. 

Section 4.  This ordinance shall be in full force and effect on the ______ day of 

_______________, 2015. 

 
 I hereby certify that the above-entitled Ordinance was adopted by the City of Wyoming at a 

________________ session of the City Council held on the ______ day of _______________, 2015. 

 
                                                                  
                                     Kelli A. VandenBerg               
                                                                  Wyoming City Clerk 
 
 
 
Ordinance No. 7-15 






	Agenda Page 1
	Agenda Page 2
	  1)  Call to Order
	  2)  Invocation
	  3)  Pledge of Allegiance
	  4)  Roll Call
	  5)  Student Recognition
	  6)  Approval of Minutes
	From the regular meeting of May 18, 2015

	  7)  Approval of Agenda
	  8)  Public Hearings
	7:01 p.m. To Consider Amendments to the Wyoming Recreation Plan, 2013-17
	7:02 p.m. To Consider the Amendment of IDD 231 for Jasper Weller, LLC 
	7:03 p.m. To Consider the Use of the 2015 Edward Byrne Memorial Justice Grant Funds for Program Activities

	  9)  Public Comment on Agenda Items
	10)  Presentations and Proclamations
	a)  Presentations
	1.  Kent County Land Bank	

	b)  Proclamations

	11)  Petitions and Communications
	a)  Petitions
	b) Communications

	12) Reports from City Officers
	a) From City Council
	b) From City Manager

	13)  Budget Amendments
	BA 56
	BA 57
	BA 58

	14) Consent Agenda
	a) To Set Meeting Day and Time for the Retirement Board
	b) To Appoint Jackie Moore
	c) To Authorize the Streetlighting Contract with Consumers Energy
	d) To Set a PH for an IDD for Huizenga Properties

	15) Resolutions
	e) To Amend IDD 231 for Jasper Weller
	f) To Approve an Application by the CEC for Fireworks Permit
	g) To Adopt Amendments to the Recreation Plan
	h) To Authorize Employment Agreement with the Deputy Fire Chief

	16) Award of Bids, Contracts, Purchases and Renewal of Bids and Contracts  
	i) To Authorize Amendment to License Agreement with Consumers Energy for Trail Rehab Project
	j) To Extend the Contract with Multi Serve
	To Authorize the Purchase of a 2015 Ford SUV

	17)  Ordinances
	05-15: To Amend Article VII of the Code (Property Maintenance Code) (Final Reading)
	06-15: To Amend Section 90-32 of the Code by adding Subsection (100) Thereto (rezoning 4992 Wilson Avenue) (Final Reading)
	07-15: To Amend Subsections 3(b), 3(c) and 3(d) of Section 90-50 of the Code (Recreational Vehicles) (First Reading)

	18)  Informational Material
	19) Acknowledgement of Visitors
	20) Closed Session (as necessary)
	21) Adjournment



