1)
2)
3)
4)
5)
6)

7)
8)

9)
10)

11)

12)

13)
14)

15)

AGENDA
WYOMING CITY COUNCIL MEETING
CITY COUNCIL CHAMBERS
MONDAY, MAY 4, 2015, 7:00 P.M.

Call to Order

Invocation — Elder Dean DeHoog, Newhall Christian Fellowship Church

Pledge of Allegiance

Roll Call

Student Recognition

Approval of Minutes

From the Regular Meeting of April 20, 2015

Approval of Agenda

Public Hearings

7:01 p.m. Proposed City of Wyoming Budget for 2015-2016

7:02 p.m. To Consider the Establishment of an Industrial Development District for

Jasper Weller, LLC in the City of Wyoming

Public Comment on Agenda Items (3 minute limit per person)

Presentations and Proclamations

a) Presentations
1. Wyoming’s Official Re-Accreditation from the Commission on Accreditation for

Law Enforcement Agencies (CALEA)

2. Wyoming Department of Public Safety Annual Report

b) Proclamations
1. Police Week

Petitions and Communications

a) Petitions

b) Communications

Reports from City Officers

a) From City Council

b) From City Manager

Budget Amendments

Consent Agenda

(All items under this section are considered to be routine and will be enacted by one

motion with no discussion. If discussion is desired by a Council member, that member may

request removal from the Consent Agenda.)

a) Of Appreciation to Eric Hartfield for His Service as a Member of the Parks and
Recreation Commission for the City of Wyoming

b) To Appoint Robert Brenzing as a Member of the WKTV Commission for the City of
Wyoming

Resolutions

c) To Consider an Application from Damir Duratovic (d/b/a Bosna Express) for a New
Tavern Licensed Business to be Located at 128 Twenty Eighth Street SW, Wyoming
49548, Kent County, Michigan



16)

17)

18)
19)
20)
21)

d)
e)
f)

To Authorize the City Manager to Execute an Employment Agreement with the Deputy
Finance Director

To Authorize the City Manager to Execute an Employment Agreement with the
Administrative Assistant — HR

To Authorize the Mayor and City Clerk to Execute an Agreement Between the City of
Wyoming and the Salvation Army Social Services of Kent County

Award of Bids, Contracts, Purchases, and Renewal of Bids and Contracts

g) To Award a Bid for Watermain Replacement on Wyoming Avenue from Porter Street
to 28" Street, Wrenwood Street from Wyoming Avenue to Avon Avenue and
Boulevard Drive from Wrenwood Street to Porter Street (Budget Amendment No. 50)

h) To Authorize the Replacement of the Poured In Place Safety Surfacing and Related Site
Restoration Work within Frog Hollow Park

i) To Accept a Quotation from Rapiscan Systems for the Purchase and Installation of a
Security X-Ray System

J) To Authorize the Purchase of Ammunition

k) For Award of Bid
1. Work Uniforms & Carhartt Clothing Items

Ordinances

5-15 To Amend Article VII of Chapter 10 of the Code of the City of Wyoming (Property

Maintenance Code) (First Reading)

6-15 To Amend Section 90-32 of the Code of the City of Wyoming by Adding

Subsection (100) Thereto to Rezone 0.4 Acres from RO-1 Restricted Office to B-1
Local Business (4992 Wilson Avenue) (First Reading)

Informational Material
Acknowledgment of Visitors
Closed Session (as necessary)
Adjournment



PROCLAMATION

POLICE WEEK
May 10 - 16, 2015

WHEREAS, the Congress and President of the United States have
designated May 15 as Peace Officers Memorial Day, and the week in which it
falls as Police Week; and

WHEREAS, the police department of Wyoming has grown to be a
modern and scientific law enforcement agency which unceasingly provides a
vital public service; and

WHEREAS, it is important that all citizens know and understand the
problems, duties and responsibilities of their police department, and that
members of our police department recognize their duty to serve the people by
safeguarding life and property, by protecting them against violence or
disorder, and by protecting the innocent against deception and the weak
against oppression or intimidation; and

NOW, THEREFORE, I, JACK A. POLL, Mayor of the City of
Wyoming, do hereby proclaim May 10 - 16, 2015, as

POLICE WEEK

in the City of Wyoming. | call upon all citizens to observe this week with
appropriate ceremonies in commemorating police officers, past and present,
who by their faithful and loyal devotion to their responsibilities have rendered
a dedicated service to their communities and have established an enviable and
enduring reputation for preserving the rights and security of all citizens.

JACK A. POLL, MAYOR
City of Wyoming, Michigan



05/04/15
Clerk/1J

RESOLUTION NO.

RESOLUTION OF APPRECIATION TO ERIC HARTFIELD FOR HIS SERVICE
AS A MEMBER OF THE PARKS AND RECREATION COMMISSION
FOR THE CITY OF WYOMING

WHEREAS:

1. Eric Hartfield has served faithfully and effectively as a member of the Parks and
Recreation Commission since February 20, 2006.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED:

1. Council Members and citizens of the City of Wyoming wish to express their deep
appreciation to Eric Hartfield for his dedicated service as a member of the Parks and
Recreation Commission.

Moved by Councilmember:
Seconded by Councilmember:
Motion Carried Yes

No

I hereby certify that the foregoing Resolution was adopted by the City Council for the City of
Wyoming, Michigan at a regular session held on May 4, 2015.

Kelli A. VandenBerg, Wyoming City Clerk

Resolution No.




05/04/15
Clerk/1J

RESOLUTION NO.

RESOLUTION TO APPOINT ROBERT BRENZING AS A MEMBER OF
THE WKTV COMMISSION FOR THE CITY OF WYOMING

WHEREAS:

1. Robert Brenzing has submitted an application requesting appointment to the WKTV
Commission for the City of Wyoming.

2. A vacancy exists in a regular term ending June 30, 2017 on the WKTV Commission.

3. City Council wishes to appoint Robert Brenzing as a member to the WKTV Commission.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED:

1. The City Council for the City of Wyoming, Michigan, does hereby confirm the
appointment of Robert Brenzing as a member of the WKTV Commission for the regular
term ending June 30, 2017.

Moved by Councilmember:
Seconded by Councilmember:
Motion Carried Yes

No

I hereby certify that the foregoing Resolution was adopted by the City Council for the City of
Wyoming, Michigan at a regular session held on May 4, 2015.

Kelli A. VandenBerg, Wyoming City Clerk

Resolution No.




STATE OF MICHIGAN
DEPARTMENT OF LABOR & ECONOMIC GROWTH
LIQUOR CONTROL COMMISSION

RESOLUTION NO.

Ata Regular meeting of the Wyoming City Council
(Regular or Special) (Township Board, City or Village Council)
called to order by __Mayor Poll on __May 4, 2015 at_ 7:00 P.M.

The following resolution was offered:

Moved by and supported by

That the request from:

Damir Duratovic (d/b/a Bosha Express) for a new Tavern licensed business to be located at 128 Twenty Eighth
Street SW, Wyoming 49548, Kent County

be considered for Approval “above all others™
(Approval or Disapproval)
APPROVAL DISAPPROVAL
Yeas: Yeas:
Nays: Nays:
Absent: Absent:

It is the consensus of this legislative body that the application be:

Recommended for issuance
(Recommended or not Recommended)

State of Michigan )
County of Kent )

I hereby certify that the foregoing is a true and complete copy of a resolution offered and

adopted by the __Wyoming City Council ata Regular
(Township Board, City or Village Council) (Regular or Special)
meeting held on May 4, 2015
(Date)
SEAL (Signed)

(Township, City or Village Clerk)

Kelli A. VandenBerg, City Clerk
City of Wyoming, Michigan
1155 28" Street SW
Wyoming, Ml 49509-0905
Resolution No.




TO:

CC:

FROM:

DATE:

RE:

Damir Duratovic (d/b/a Bosna Express) has applied for a new Tavern liquor license for an
existing business at 128 28" Street SW. Mr. Duratovic has operated Bosna Express in this
location for 14 years and wishes to secure a Tavern license in order to serve beer and wine to his
patrons.

A review of the application was requested from the Police Department, City Treasurer, Chief
Building Official and the City’s Development Review Team. All entities have reviewed the

MEMORANDUM
City of Wyoming, Michigan
Curtis L. Holt, City Manager

Heidi Isakson, Deputy City Manager
Jack Sluiter, City Attorney

Kelli A. VandenBerg, City Clerk
April 29, 2015

Application for Tavern Liquor License
Bosna Express, 128 28" Street SW

application and have indicated approval.

I have drafted a resolution to approve the application in the required Liquor Control Commission

format for Council consideration.



CITY OF WYOMING, MICHIGAN
APPLICATION FOR LIQUOR LICENSE

APPLICANT.
Damir DU ratovic

(Same name on application to the Liguor Control Commission.)

= SOLE PROPRIETOR
[ PARTNERSHIP
O CORPORATION

BUSINESS LOCATION ADDRESS!
128 287" Street Sl

BUSINESS MAILING ADDRESS:!
128 7g™ Streets Sw

49548 Wyorming, Mi

£954K  Wyeming, M

prone:  Glb- 249 -9%95

@R " % - .
ALTERNATE PHONE: &16-€33 1707

ducsctovi ¢ @07 2 (& sroil Con
—J

Fax:

LICENSE REQUESTED!
TAVERN
O CLass C
0O CLASS B HOTEL

D/B/A/ (name used to advertise/market)
Besna Express

WILL THE PROPOSED BUSINESS
occupy A(N): '

B EXISTING BUILDING

O NEW BUILDING

DO YOU:
M OWN BUILDING
[0 iEASE BUILDING

BUILDING OWNER:

AREEQRNITURE & FIXTURES:
i~ OWNED
0O LEASED

FURNITURE & FIXTURE OWNER:
Damir Durahosic

NAME OF PERSON RESPONSIBLE FOR DAILY OPERATION OF BUSINESS!

D&m: s )um Vi C

NAME OF BANK FOR BUSINESS ACCOUNT!

F it Thid Rank

FIRM, ACCOUNTANT OR PERSON RESPONSIBLE FOR FINANCIAL RECORDS:

-

NaME:  Mire’s Tox dServvice
ADDRESS. (350 Dunbarton ST s&  Ada, Mi

NAME OF PERS corygj TING TITLE OF PERSON COMPLETING
APPLICATION mn’ AtV ¢ APPLICATION: OWher™
S]GNATURE: cw- ///c~\ DATE:. ©b-o4%- /"

ATTACH.:

1.

A SCALED ENGINEER'S OR ARCHITECT'S DRAWING WHICH SHOWS THE TOTAL
SQUARE FOOTAGE, DINING SQUARE FOOTAGE, KITCHEN SQUARE FOOTAGE, TOTAL

TABLE SEATING, AND TOTAL COUNTER SEATING.

OFFICER OR MANAGER.

A PERSOMNAL INFORMATION SHEET FOR EACH OWNER, PARTNER, CORPORATE

3. APPLICATION FEE OF $300 PAYARLE TO THE CiTY OF WYOMING.



PERSONAL INFORMATION SHEET — COPY AND COMPLETE THIS PAGE
FOR EACH OWNER, PARTNER, CORPORATE OFFICER OR MANAGER

. - TITLE _
FNAME' Do\m W Dkl EfC’L’LOLff C A/ TE.
RESIDENT ADDRESS! PHONE:
v Avodom Av. SE e 2% T T T
ESGo A fét:»f@afbmrc—. 7 YG3/E G (5)'
SOCIAL SECURITY NUMBER: DATE OF BIRTH:
RESIDENT OF THE STATE OF MICHIGAN? |
YES 27T  YEARS
O NO

Describe similar business ventures or related experience:

ouncE  BCSTAUCAM T FOR /¢ Wears

Do you, a member of your family or your corporation hold a license for the sale of alcoholic

beverages at the present time:
O Yes - List type and Jocation of each

H No

Have you, a member of your family or your cotporation previously held a license for the sale of

alcoholic beverages in the State of Michigan?
[0 Yes - List type and location of each

7 No

Have you ever been convicted of any ctiminal act?
O] . Yes - desctibe state, county and date of conviction

P
No

I hereby authorize City officials to investigate any or all information supplied, related to, or
implied by this application. I further authorize City officials to secure additional information
necessary to complete this application. Iunderstand that this mformation will be considered by

the Wyoming City Council in review of this application, and that the information containe
herein may be subject to public disclosure under the Freedom of Informationy” Ac{t/;

i y /gwe

Signature of owner, partner, corporate officer or manager: X s

State of Michigan
I
5.0 -{- County

Subseribed and sworn to before me on this LKM day of H & Fc;jq ,204 5.

X 4t deat s ,:’/77 e

. =

Signature of Notary
—_ Y

A A

P T

DY LA
o AT

—tm

Printed Name My commission expires:



LIQUOR LICENSE APPLICATION ~ DEPARTMENT REVIEW

APPLICANT(S): D PROPOSED LICENSE LOCATION:
(@Mﬁﬂ' Exﬂfes:) ‘
izl D TP ViEL SZ2% Zs7h =i
LICGENSE TYPE! 7 i g ¥

POLICE DEPARTMENT .
I have investigated the application and the applicant(s) Listed above and make the following
recommendation as ptovided in Section 14-182 of the City Code.

1. Is the applicant qualified to conduct this business in the City of Wyoming if licensed?

K Yes ___ No
2. Is the proposed location satisfactory ctory for this business?
K Y ____No
3. Should this request be considered for approval by the City Council?
K~ Yes __ No

WWM? Date: 4i7/is

g@/v James Carmody, Police Chief



LIQUOR LICENSE APPLICATION ~ DEPARTMENT REVIEW

APPLICANT(S): PROPOSED LICENSE LOCATION:
Damir Duratouics 28 28y sud

LICENSE TYPE. Ot -Bremseya | audrin
-

DEVELOPMENT REVIEW TEAM

The Development Review Team has reviewed the application for the proposed liquor license and
recommend

:Q: approval
O denial

of the license application by the City Council.

Comments:

(Explain recommendation for denial)

W A CQVL” Date‘: 5/25 [1s—

Development Review Team




LIQUOR LICENSE APPLICATION ~ DEPARTMENT REVIEW

APPLICANT(S): PROPOSED LICENSE LOCATION.:
v uratevie 2 - R&BN . @U)
@M” D S >/ B/~ Podna ergrers 1 <t
LICENSE TYPE. | eevering
CITY TREASURER :

[ have reviewed the financial records of the City of Wyoming as provided in Section 14-182 of the
City Code and find the application(s) are in good standing with the City.

_ " Yes _ No
The applicant(s) have the following outstanding obligations with the City of Wyoming (lst)

I

conentl usaler il - aee FUBTNA0T  FA0.X]  oteee HIAI0IT

Abiers ot Date: 5// /r// /5

Artdrea Boot, Treasurer



LIQUOR LICENSE APPLICATION ~ DEPARTMENT REVIEW

APPLICANT(S): PROPOSED LICENSE LOCATION:

Damiv QW&WSI}:/@&@MB@ : 122 2e5thGt . sw

55
LICENSE TYPE. “Tavevin

Bosna, Lapeess

BUILDING INSPECTOR
1 have inspected the location of the proposed liquor license or reviewed plans for the proposed
location and have determined that the location IS_ L~ IS NOT in compliance with

Section 14-177 through 14-179 gf the City Code.
. é —
ﬁé)m-% Lo h, Date: Sfféf/s

]ar_rv DeLange, Chief Bujldiné Insﬂ%ctor

D Kigped 4fas)is




05/04/15
Human Resources/KRO

RESOLUTION NO.

RESOLUTION TO AUTHORIZE THE CITY MANAGER TO EXECUTE
AN EMPLOYMENT AGREEMENT WITH THE DEPUTY FINANCE DIRECTOR

WHEREAS:

1. The City Manager desires to enter into employment agreements with officers and
employees in administrative service for the City.

2. Section 4.7 of the City Charter allows the City Manager to “...exercise his judgment
in the appointment or employment of officers and employees in the administrative
service.”

3. The City Manager has negotiated an employment agreement with the Deputy Finance
Director.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED:

1. The City Manager is authorized to execute an employment agreement with the
Deputy Finance Director.

2. The City Manager is authorized to approve future amendments to the agreement that
are generally equivalent to the existing City of Wyoming bargaining agreements.

Moved by Councilmember:
Seconded by Councilmember:
Motion Carried Yes

No

I hereby certify that the foregoing Resolution was adopted by the City Council for the City of
Wyoming, Michigan at a regular session held on May 4, 2015.

ATTACHMENTS: Kelli A. VandenBerg, Wyoming City Clerk
Employment Agreement

Resolution No.




CITY OF WYOMING

EMPLOYMENT AGREEMENT - DEPUTY FINANCE DIRECTOR

THIS AGREEMENT between Rosa Rae Ooms, 5421 Sand Dune Ct. SW, Wyoming
MI 49418 (“Employee”), and the City of Wyoming, a municipal corporation, of 1155 — 28"
Street SW, Wyoming, Michigan 49509 (“City”), is made on the following terms:

1. TERM. The City hereby employs the Employee as Deputy Finance
Director of the City. This appointment shall be effective May 4, 2015. The Employee
understands that as Deputy Finance Director, she serves at the pleasure of the City
Manager, who may terminate the Employee for any reason at any time as provided by the
City Charter and City Code.

2. PERFORMANCE. The Employee agrees to perform the duties of Deputy
Finance Director in a competent and professional manner and as set forth in the City
Charter, City Code, established policies and regulations of the City and the laws of the State
of Michigan. A job description has been provided to the Employee that the City may
periodically revise with notice to the Employee. The Employee shall report to and be
supervised by the City Manager.

3. SERVICE DATE. The Employee’s date of service with the City shall be
October 1, 2012. The Employee shall be credited with all earned benefits from her service
date and shall accumulate benefits uninterrupted after the effective date of this Agreement.

4. COMPENSATION. The Employee’s salary shall be established by the
City Manager in accordance with the annual budget authorization, the City Charter, and the

City Code. The salary shall be paid in accordance with City payroll procedures.



5. BENEFITS. The Employee shall be provided the same health insurance,
health insurance opt-out, pension, holidays, vacation, sick leave, sick leave incentive,
bereavement leave, educational benefits, longevity pay, and payout of accrued benefits
upon separation from employment as provided to department head employees in the
Administrative and Supervisory Association unless otherwise stated herein. Benefits shall
be based on a hire date of October 1, 2012. The Employee shall contribute 20% of the
premium cost for health insurance as an active employee. The health insurance premium
shall be based on the premium recommended by the City’s insurer or, if applicable, third-
party administrator.

In addition to the above stated benefits the Employee shall be credited with an
additional 24 hours of vacation effective May 4, 2015 for the 2015 calendar year.

6. TERMINATION. This Agreement and the Employee’s employment
pursuant to it may be terminated as follows:

a. By the Employee’s resignation. The Employee shall give written
notice of the Employee’s resignation at least thirty (30) days prior to its effective
date. If the Employee fails to do so, any other provision of this Agreement
notwithstanding, the City shall have no obligation to pay the Employee for
accumulated sick leave or vacation time or any other accrued benefits, the amount
of which the City shall be entitled to retain as liquidated damages for the costs it
will incur as a result of such sudden resignation.

b. By the City Manager for the reason that the Employee 1) failed to
substantially perform the Employee’s job duties; 2) committed misfeasance,

malfeasance or nonfeasance in the Employee’s position; 3) engaged in criminal



misconduct; 4) is convicted of any felony; 5) is convicted of a misdemeanor
involving bodily harm or dishonesty; or 6) performed a deliberate and wrongful act.
In such circumstances, any other provision of this Agreement notwithstanding, the
City shall have no obligation to pay the Employee for accumulated sick leave or
vacation time or any other accrued benefits.

C. By the City Manager, other than as provided in subsection (b) of this
Section. If such action is taken, the City shall pay the Employee, in addition to any
other amounts to which the Employee is entitled under this Agreement, an amount
equal to six months of the Employee’s base salary. Such severance pay will be paid
to the Employee over a six-month period by checks issued on regular City paydays
and will have appropriate amounts withheld. The Employee’s insurance (health,
dental, vision and life) shall continue to be paid by the City for the same period.
However, if the Employee secures another position of equal or greater pay during
the six-month period, the City’s obligation to make severance payments and
continue insurance will cease. If the Employee takes another position at less pay
during the six-month period, the City*s obligation will be limited to the difference in
pay for the balance of said six-month period. For purposes of this section, “another
position” shall include employment, self-employment, independent contracting, or
compensation from any source. The aforesaid severance pay and benefits shall be
paid to the Employee contingent upon the Employee executing a waiver and release
of all claims satisfactory to the City.

d. Upon termination of the Employee’s employment, the Employee

shall arrange for the immediate and orderly transfer of the Employee’s office and



the City-owned personal property, records, documents and other items in the

Employee’s possession.

e. Nothing in this Agreement shall prevent, limit, or otherwise interfere
with the right of the City to terminate the services of the Employee at any time and
for any reason, subject only to the provisions set forth in this Section. Nothing in
this Agreement shall prevent, limit, or otherwise interfere with the right of the
Employee to resign at any time from the Employee’s position with the City, subject
only to the provisions set forth in this Section.

7. SCOPE AND AMENDMENTS. This Agreement is made in accordance
with the provisions of the City Charter and City Code and shall be the sole agreement of
the parties, any written or oral contracts to the contrary notwithstanding. By way of
illustration and not limitation, any prior agreement or promises, and any collective
bargaining agreements, have no application to the Employee or to the employment
relationship between the Employee and the City. This agreement may not be modified
orally, but only by an agreement in writing signed by the parties.

8. SEVERABILITY. The invalidity or unenforceability of any term in this
Agreement shall not affect the validity or enforceability of any other term in this
Agreement. If any term in this Agreement is determined to be invalid, unenforceable or
over broad in any respect, that term shall nevertheless be enforceable to the fullest extent
permitted by law.

9. APPLICABLE LAW. The terms of this agreement are to be interpreted,

construed, enforced, and performed under the laws of the State of Michigan.



10.  ASSIGNMENT. Neither party may assign its rights, duties or interests in
this Agreement without the prior written consent of the other party.

11. JURISDICTION AND VENUE. To the extent permitted by law, the
parties agree that the jurisdiction and venue of any action brought pursuant to or to
enforce this Agreement shall be solely in state court in Kent County, Michigan.

12. BINDING. This Agreement shall be binding upon the parties and their
heirs, subrogates, successors and assigns.

13. RETURN OF CITY PROPERTY. The Employee agrees that when the
Employee’s employment ends, the Employee is responsible for returning any City-owned
property in the Employee’s possession and for paying any expenses or other amounts that
the Employee may owe to the City at that time. The Employee authorizes the City to
deduct any amount owed from any wage or benefit payments that may be due to the
Employee.

14.  SHORTENED LIMITATIONS PERIOD. The Employee agrees that any
lawsuit or claim against the City arising out of the Employee’s employment or
termination of employment (including, but not limited to, claims arising under state,
federal or local civil rights laws) must be brought within the following time limits or be
forever barred: (a) for lawsuits requiring a Notice of Right to Sue from the Equal
Employment Opportunity Commission, within 90 days after the EEOC issues that Notice;
or (b) for all other lawsuits, within (i) 180 days of the event(s) giving rise to the claim, or
(ii) the time limits specified by statute, whichever is shorter. The Employee waives any

statute of limitations that exceeds this time limit.



Dated:

Dated:

CITY OF WYOMING

Curtis Holt
City Manager

Rosa R. Ooms
Deputy Finance Director



05/04/15
Human Resources/KRO

RESOLUTION NO.

RESOLUTION TO AUTHORIZE THE CITY MANAGER TO EXECUTE
AN EMPLOYMENT AGREEMENT WITH THE ADMINISTRATIVE ASSISTANT - HR

WHEREAS:

1. The City Manager desires to enter into employment agreements with officers and
employees in administrative service for the City.

2. Section 4.7 of the City Charter allows the City Manager to “...exercise his judgment
in the appointment or employment of officers and employees in the administrative
service.”

3. The City Manager has negotiated an employment agreement with the Administrative
Assistant - HR.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED:

1. The City Manager is authorized to execute an employment agreement with the
Administrative Assistant - HR.

2. The City Manager is authorized to approve future amendments to the agreement that
are generally equivalent to the existing City of Wyoming bargaining agreements.

Moved by Councilmember:
Seconded by Councilmember:
Motion Carried Yes

No

I hereby certify that the foregoing Resolution was adopted by the City Council for the City of
Wyoming, Michigan at a regular session held on May 4, 2015.

ATTACHMENTS: Kelli A. VandenBerg, Wyoming City Clerk
Employment Agreement

Resolution No.




CITY OF WYOMING

EMPLOYMENT AGREEMENT - ADMINISTRATIVE ASSISTANT - HR

THIS AGREEMENT between Emily Christina VandeGriend, of 4060 Sun Chase
Drive, Apt. 2, Hudsonville, Ml 49426 (“Employee”), and the City of Wyoming, a
municipal corporation, of 1155 — 28" Street SW, Wyoming, Michigan 49509 (“City”), is
made on the following terms:

1. TERM. The City hereby employs the Employee as Administrative
Assistant - HR. This appointment shall be effective May 19, 2015. The Employee
understands that as Administrative Assistant - HR, she serves at the pleasure of the City
Manager, who may terminate the Employee for any reason at any time as provided by the
City Charter and City Code.

2. PERFORMANCE. The Employee agrees to perform the duties of
Administrative Assistant - HR in a competent and professional manner and as set forth in
the City Charter, City Code, established policies and regulations of the City and the laws of
the State of Michigan. A job description has been provided to the Employee that the City
may periodically revise with notice to the Employee. The Employee shall report to and be
supervised by the Director of Human Resources.

3. SERVICE DATE. The Employee’s date of service with the City shall be
May 19, 2015. The Employee shall be credited with all earned benefits from her service
date and shall accumulate benefits uninterrupted after the effective date of this Agreement.

4, COMPENSATION. Employee’s position is non-exempt. Employee’s

hourly rate of pay shall be established by the City Manager in accordance with the annual



budget authorization, the City Charter, and the City Code. The wages shall be paid in
accordance with City payroll procedures.

5. BENEFITS. The Employee shall be provided the same health insurance,
health insurance opt-out, pension, holidays, vacation, sick leave, sick leave incentive,
bereavement leave, educational benefits, longevity pay, and payout of accrued benefits
upon separation from employment as provided to regular employees in the Administrative
and Supervisory Association unless otherwise stated herein. Benefits shall be based on a
hire date of May 19, 2015. The Employee shall contribute 20% of the premium cost for
health insurance as an active employee. The health insurance premium shall be based on
the premium recommended by the City’s insurer or, if applicable, third-party administrator.

6. TERMINATION. This Agreement and the Employee’s employment
pursuant to it may be terminated as follows:

a. By the Employee’s resignation. The Employee shall give written
notice of the Employee’s resignation at least thirty (30) days prior to its effective
date. If the Employee fails to do so and/or resigns prior to one full year of
employment, any other provision of this Agreement notwithstanding, the City shall
have no obligation to pay the Employee for accumulated sick leave or vacation time
or any other accrued benefits, the amount of which the City shall be entitled to
retain as liquidated damages for the costs it will incur as a result of such sudden
resignation.

b. By the City Manager for the reason that the Employee 1) failed to
substantially perform the Employee’s job duties; 2) committed misfeasance,

malfeasance or nonfeasance in the Employee’s position; 3) engaged in criminal



misconduct; 4) is convicted of any felony; 5) is convicted of a misdemeanor
involving bodily harm or dishonesty; or 6) performed a deliberate and wrongful act.
In such circumstances, any other provision of this Agreement notwithstanding, the
City shall have no obligation to pay the Employee for accumulated sick leave or
vacation time or any other accrued benefits.

C. By the City Manager, other than as provided in subsection (b) of this
Section. If such action is taken, the City shall pay the Employee, in addition to any
other amounts to which the Employee is entitled under this Agreement, an amount
equal to three months of the Employee’s base salary. Such severance pay will be
paid to the Employee over a three-month period by checks issued on regular City
paydays and will have appropriate amounts withheld. The Employee’s insurance
(health, dental, vision and life) shall continue to be paid by the City for the same
period. However, if the Employee secures another position of equal or greater pay
during the three-month period, the City’s obligation to make severance payments
and continue insurance will cease. If the Employee takes another position at less
pay during the three-month period, the City‘s obligation will be limited to the
difference in pay for the balance of said three-month period. For purposes of this
section, “another position” shall include employment, self-employment,
independent contracting, or compensation from any source. The aforesaid
severance pay and benefits shall be paid to the Employee contingent upon the
Employee executing a waiver and release of all claims satisfactory to the City.

d. Upon termination of the Employee’s employment, the Employee

shall arrange for the immediate and orderly transfer of the Employee’s office and



the City-owned personal property, records, documents and other items in the

Employee’s possession.

e. Nothing in this Agreement shall prevent, limit, or otherwise interfere
with the right of the City to terminate the services of the Employee at any time and
for any reason, subject only to the provisions set forth in this Section. Nothing in
this Agreement shall prevent, limit, or otherwise interfere with the right of the
Employee to resign at any time from the Employee’s position with the City, subject
only to the provisions set forth in this Section.

7. SCOPE AND AMENDMENTS. This Agreement is made in accordance
with the provisions of the City Charter and City Code and shall be the sole agreement of
the parties, any written or oral contracts to the contrary notwithstanding. By way of
illustration and not limitation, any prior agreement or promises, and any collective
bargaining agreements, have no application to the Employee or to the employment
relationship between the Employee and the City. This agreement may not be modified
orally, but only by an agreement in writing signed by the parties.

8. SEVERABILITY. The invalidity or unenforceability of any term in this
Agreement shall not affect the validity or enforceability of any other term in this
Agreement. If any term in this Agreement is determined to be invalid, unenforceable or
over broad in any respect, that term shall nevertheless be enforceable to the fullest extent
permitted by law.

9. APPLICABLE LAW. The terms of this agreement are to be interpreted,

construed, enforced, and performed under the laws of the State of Michigan.



10.  ASSIGNMENT. Neither party may assign its rights, duties or interests in
this Agreement without the prior written consent of the other party.

11. JURISDICTION AND VENUE. To the extent permitted by law, the
parties agree that the jurisdiction and venue of any action brought pursuant to or to
enforce this Agreement shall be solely in state court in Kent County, Michigan.

12. BINDING. This Agreement shall be binding upon the parties and their
heirs, subrogates, successors and assigns.

13. RETURN OF CITY PROPERTY. The Employee agrees that when the
Employee’s employment ends, the Employee is responsible for returning any City-owned
property in the Employee’s possession and for paying any expenses or other amounts that
the Employee may owe to the City at that time. The Employee authorizes the City to
deduct any amount owed from any wage or benefit payments that may be due to the
Employee.

14.  SHORTENED LIMITATIONS PERIOD. The Employee agrees that any
lawsuit or claim against the City arising out of the Employee’s employment or
termination of employment (including, but not limited to, claims arising under state,
federal or local civil rights laws) must be brought within the following time limits or be
forever barred: (a) for lawsuits requiring a Notice of Right to Sue from the Equal
Employment Opportunity Commission, within 90 days after the EEOC issues that Notice;
or (b) for all other lawsuits, within (i) 180 days of the event(s) giving rise to the claim, or
(ii) the time limits specified by statute, whichever is shorter. The Employee waives any

statute of limitations that exceeds this time limit.



Dated:

Dated:

CITY OF WYOMING

Curtis Holt
City Manager

Emily Christina VandeGriend
Administrative Assistant - HR



05/04/15
RLR/KI

RESOLUTION NO.

RESOLUTION TO AUTHORIZE THE MAYOR AND CITY CLERK TO EXECUTE AN
AGREEMENT BETWEEN THE CITY OF WYOMING AND THE SALVATION ARMY
SOCIAL SERVICES OF KENT COUNTY

WHEREAS:

1. The City, as a recipient of Community Development Block Grant (CDBG) funds through
the U.S. Department of Housing and Urban Development (HUD), supports the
administration of various activities intended to alleviate and reduce the problems of
homelessness and the need for affordable housing in the city of Wyoming.

2. The City has identified as a high priority in its Consolidated Housing and Community
Development Plan the problems of homelessness and the need for affordable housing.

3. The City desires to provide funding to The Salvation Army Social Services of Kent
County to provide low-income families residing in the city of Wyoming, at risk of
housing loss through a pending eviction, with short-term rental assistance.

4. Inits 2015-2016 budget, the City of Wyoming has approved funding The Salvation Army
Social Services of Kent County in an amount not to exceed $16,000.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED:

1. The Wyoming City Council does herby approve the Agreement between the City of
Wyoming and The Salvation Army Social Services of Kent County.

2. The Wyoming City Council authorizes the Mayor and/or City Manager to
sign the Agreement and all necessary legal documents as may be required.

Moved by Councilmember:
Seconded by Councilmember:
Motion carried: Yes

No

I hereby certify that the foregoing Resolution was adopted by the City Council for the City of
Wyoming, Michigan at a regular session held on May 4, 2015.

Kelli A. VandenBerg, Wyoming City Clerk
ATTACHMENTS:

Staff Report
Agreement

Resolution No.




STAFF REPORT

Date: April 27, 2015

Subject: The Salvation Army Social Services of Kent County — CDBG
Funding 2015-2016

Cc: Betty Zylstra, Executive Director - The Salvation Army Social
Services

Meeting Date: May 4, 2015

RECOMMENDATION:

It is recommended that the City Council enter into an agreement with The Salvation
Army Social Services of Kent County to provide low-income families residing in the city
of Wyoming, at risk of housing loss through a pending eviction, with short-term rental
assistance.

SUSTAINABILITY CRITERIA:

Environmental Quality — The Salvation Army Social Services of Kent County supports
the administration of various activities intended to alleviate and reduce the problems of
homelessness in the Kent County area, which includes the City of Wyoming. The City
desires to provide funding to The Salvation Army Social Services of Kent County to
provide homeless prevention assistance for low-income families living in the City of
Wyoming to allow households to remain in their rental unit and maintain housing
stability.

Social Equity — The City has identified as a high priority in its Consolidated Housing and
Community Development Plan the problems of homelessness and the need for
affordable housing. Providing funding for short-term rental assistance to Wyoming
families pending eviction helps to address these priorities.

Economic Strength — The Salvation Army Social Services of Kent County shall use
CDBG funds allocated by the City for the cost of providing eight (8) low-income
Wyoming families pending eviction with short-term rental assistance. These funds
assist families who are at risk of becoming homeless.

DISCUSSION:

The federal government, recognizing the growing trend of homelessness and the need
for affordable housing, has emphasized Community Development Block Grant (CDBG)
funds as a means of addressing such needs at the local level. The Wyoming City

Council approved the CDBG Action Plan 2015-2015, which identifies these needs as a



high priority, and approved $16,000 in the 2015-2016 budget to support The Salvation
Army Social Services of Kent County.

BUDGET IMPACT:
Per HUD regulation, a subrecipient agreement is required between the City and The
Salvation Army Social Services of Kent County for these purposes. Council has

approved funding in the 2015-2016 CDBG budget, not to exceed $16,000, for this
purpose.

ATTACHMENTS:

Resolution
Agreement



CONTRACT BETWEEN
THE CITY OF WYOMING
AND
THE SALVATION ARMY SOCIAL SERVICES OF KENT COUNTY
JULY 1, 2015 THROUGH JUNE 30, 2016

THIS CONTRACT, entered into this day of , 2015, effective from July 1, 2015
through June 30, 2016 and by and between the City of Wyoming (hereinafter called the "City"), located at
1155 — 28" Street, SW, Wyoming, MI 49509, a Michigan municipal corporation organized and existing
under the laws of the State of Michigan, and The Salvation Army Social Services of Kent County, a Not-
for-Profit Corporation, located at 1215 E. Fulton Street, Grand Rapids Michigan, 49503 (hereinafter called
the “Subrecipient”).

WITNESSETH THAT:

WHEREAS, the City, as a recipient of Community Development Block Grant (CDBG) funds through the
U.S. Department of Housing and Urban Development (HUD), supports the administration of various
activities intended to alleviate and reduce the problems of homelessness in the Kent County area, which
includes the City of Wyoming; and

WHEREAS, the City has identified as a high priority in its Consolidated Housing and Community
Development Plan the problems of homelessness and the need for affordable housing; and

WHEREAS, the City desires to provide funding to the Subrecipient to provide homeless prevention
assistance for low-income families living in the city of Wyoming to allow households to remain in their
rental unit and maintain housing stability;

NOW, THEREFORE, the City and the Subrecipient do mutually agree as follows:

1. Project Objective.

The project objective of this Contract is herein established as the standard to be used by the City
to determine the impact and effectiveness of the services and activities to be performed by the
Subrecipient under Section 2 below. The objective of said services and activities is to provide
low-income families residing in the city of Wyoming at risk of housing loss through a pending
eviction with short-term rental assistance for the purpose of preventing homelessness and
providing a suitable living environment.

2. Scope of Services.

In order to accomplish the project objective defined in Section 1 above, the Subrecipient shall
perform in a lawful, satisfactory and proper manner, the following services and activities:

a. The Subrecipient shall use CDBG funds allocated by the City for the cost of providing
approximately eight (8) low-income Wyoming families pending eviction with short-term
rental assistance. A maximum of TWO THOUSAND AND NO/DOLLARS ($2,000.00)
per household may be provided for short-term rental assistance for not more than three



Page 2

(3) months, with the total amount expended not to exceed SIXTEEN THOUSAND AND
NO/DOLLARS ($16,000.00).

The Subrecipient shall determine eligible households to be at or below 40% of the Area
Median Income and be at-risk of homelessness. These households will be identified by
Housing Assessment Program (HAP) intake staff and referred to a housing resource
specialist on staff. The housing resource specialist must verify eligibility for the program
based upon 24 CFR, Part 570.208(a)(2) Criteria for National Objectives - Limited
Clientele Activities, determine the appropriate level of assistance for the household, and
ensure the housing unit meets lawful property maintenance standards, including current
rental certification by the City of Wyoming.

The Subrecipient will invoice and collect from the City a maximum total of SIXTEEN
THOUSAND and NO/100 DOLLARS ($16,000.00) to be used to reimburse the
Subrecipient the cost of providing short-term rental assistance to low-income Wyoming
families pending eviction.

The Subrecipient, with each invoice it submits to the City, shall provide a written status
report on the progress being made in providing this assistance.

3. Time of Performance.

a.

On July 1, 2015, the Subrecipient shall commence performance of the services and
activities required under this Contract.

The Subrecipient shall continue to perform such services and activities until the
expiration of this Contract on June 30, 2016, unless otherwise terminated pursuant to the
terms of this Contract.

4, Compensation and Method of Payment.

a.

As full compensation for the Subrecipient's satisfactory performance under this Contract,
the City hereby agrees to pay the Subrecipient the amount of SIXTEEN THOUSAND
and NO/100 DOLLARS ($16,000.00) in accordance with the following schedule:

1) The Subrecipient agrees to expend the funds on a monthly reimbursable basis, or
as mutually agreeable between the City and the Subrecipient, but not less that
quarterly.

2) Reimbursement invoices, with all necessary supporting documentation, shall be

submitted to the City of Wyoming within 30 days of the period end with the
exception of the period end of June 30, 2016, which shall be limited to 31 days
(July 31, 2016).

3) If no expenses are incurred by the Subrecipient for the period, written
documentation of such is to be provided to the City of Wyoming within 30 days
of the period end.



Page 3

4) Failure to submit a final invoice for any and all unreimbursed expenses incurred
through June 30, 2016 by July 31, 2016 shall result in loss of funding for said
expenses.

b. It is expressly understood by and between the City and the Subrecipient that in no event

shall the total compensation and reimbursement, if any, to be paid to the Subrecipient
pursuant to this Contract, exceed the maximum sum of SIXTEEN THOUSAND and
NO/100 DOLLARS ($16,000).

Financial Transparency.

The parties hereby agree that transparency and full disclosure relating to the sources and uses of
public funds are important objectives and goals to be accomplished by way of this agreement.
The Subrecipient agrees that it will maintain an operational internet website accessible to the
general public.

Continued Funding.

The City makes no implied or explicit guarantee, offer or representation of future funding from
the City beyond the termination of this Contract. The City further makes no implied or expressed
guarantee that it will not terminate this Contract and the funding supplied with this Contract
pursuant to the terms and conditions of Section 28.

Finance Procedures.

The City, in its sole discretion, has the authority to suspend, reduce or disallow any payment(s) of
funds to The Subrecipient under Section 4 herein, notwithstanding any other provision of this
Contract, upon written notice to The Subrecipient when the internal fiscal controls and records
are changed without the City's approval, or when, in the opinion of the City, there is a reasonable
likelihood that funds may be misused, misappropriated or spent for an ineligible purpose as
defined within this Contract.

a. Any unearned payments under this Contract may be suspended by the City upon The
Subrecipient's refusal to accept and comply with any additional conditions or
requirements of the City.

b. Any unearned payments under this Contract may be suspended or reduced if the funding
sources for this Contract are reduced or suspended or terminated for any reason.

Donations and Fees.

Donations and fees which are received by The Subrecipient in connection with provision of
services under this Contract shall be included in its financial reports in a balance sheet and
operating statement presentation showing disposition of such donations and fees.

Contract Modifications.

The City, from time to time, may expand, diminish or otherwise modify the project objective,
scope of services, or any other contract provision related thereto, which the Subrecipient is



Page 4

10.

required to perform pursuant to Sections 1 and 2 of this Contract; provided, however, that such
modifications are mutually agreed upon by the City and the Subrecipient, and incorporated into
written amendments to this Contract after approval by the City.

The Subrecipient’s Failure of Performance.

a.

Breach of Contract. The failure of the Subrecipient to provide any work or services
required by this Contract in a satisfactory and timely manner shall be a material breach of
this Contract.

1) The City shall determine in its sole discretion whether the work is satisfactorily
completed.
2) In the event the City determines the services provided pursuant to this Contract

have not been performed in a timely or satisfactory manner, the City shall notify
the Subrecipient and allow the Subrecipient ten (10) days to cure any such failure
to perform services in a timely manner.

3) In the event the Subrecipient fails to cure the unsatisfactory or untimely work or
performance pursuant to the requirement of subsection (2) above, the City may
take any other action permitted by law or this Contract, including but not limited
to termination or reduction in compensation to the Subrecipient.

Reduction of Compensation by the City. In the event the Subrecipient fails to perform, in
a timely and proper manner, any of the services or activities required under this Contract,
the City may reduce or modify the compensation payable hereunder to the Subrecipient
in a manner which appropriately reflects such reduction or diminution of services or
activities.

Termination by the City. In the event the Subrecipient fails to fulfill in a timely and
proper manner, any of the terms, conditions, or obligations of this Contract, or if the
Subrecipient violates any of the covenants, agreements, or stipulations of this Contract,
the City with sixty (60) days written notice to the Subrecipient, may terminate this
Contract with no further liability to the Subrecipient beyond that expressly provided for
in this Contract.

1) In the event this Contract is terminated:

a) All data, documents, drawings, maps, models, photographs, reports,
studies, and surveys which have been or were prepared by the
Subrecipient with City funds pursuant to the Contract, shall become the
property of the City; and

b) The Subrecipient shall receive just and equitable compensation for any
work which the Subrecipient satisfactorily completed pursuant to this
Contract, subject to subsection 2) b) below.

2) It is agreed that nothing contained herein shall:



Page 5

11.

a) Deprive the City of any additional rights or remedies, either at law or in
equity or under the terms, conditions, obligations, covenants,
agreements, and stipulations of this Contract, which it may respectively
assert against the Subrecipient upon failure to fulfill any of the terms,
conditions, obligations, covenants, agreements, or stipulations of this
Contract; or

b) Relieve the Subrecipient of any liability to the City for any damages
sustained by the City as a result of any breach of this Contract by the
Subrecipient; and if it sustains such damages, the City may withhold as a
set off any payments due the Subrecipient, until such time as an exact
amount of damages sustained by the City is properly and legally
determined unless otherwise terminated pursuant to the terms of this
Contract.

3) Nothing contained herein shall prohibit the City and the Subrecipient from
mutually agreeing to terminate this Contract.

Reports and Information.

a.

Financial Records and Reports. The Subrecipient agrees to make and maintain adequate
financial records in a form satisfactory to the City. Such financial records and reports
shall reflect all costs and expenses incurred in performing this Contract and records of the
use of all consideration received pursuant to this Contract. Financial records and reports
of the Subrecipient shall conform to the regulations found at 2 CFR Part 200 entitled
“Uniform Administrative Requirements, Cost Principles, and Audit Requirements for
Federal Awards, Final Guidance.”

Administrative Practices and Policies. The Subrecipient shall follow and conform to the
administrative practices and policies established for its operation by the Subrecipient. The
Subrecipient hereby assures the City that said administrative practices and policies
include, but are not limited to, a statement concerning employment, salary, wage rates,
working hours, holidays, fringe benefits (health, hospitalization, retirement, etc.).

Equal Opportunity Employment. The Subrecipient shall implement and adhere to all
pertinent Equal Opportunity Compliance Procedures, as adopted by the City and all other
applicable Federal, State, civil rights and equal opportunity laws and regulations.

Community Development Program Reports. The Subrecipient shall maintain case files
on each household served which include name, address, income eligibility, size of
household, sex, race, handicap status, and age of head of household; attestation of
property rental certification compliance. The Subrecipient shall submit an Annual
Performance Report, which includes a demographic report, in formats approved by the
City, by July 31, 2016.

Annual Performance Report. This report must detail levels of service given and include a
full description of each activity to be assisted (or being assisted) with City CDBG funds,
including its location (if the activity has a geographical locus), and the amount of CDBG
funds budgeted for the activity. At the conclusion of the contract period, a report will be



Page 6

12.

13.

required affirming how the funds were obligated and expended in comparison to budget
and projected geographical impact.

Demographic Report. An annual and unduplicated demographic report containing data
on the extent to which each racial and ethnic group and single headed households (by
gender and household head) have applied for, participated in, or benefitted from, any
program or activity funded in whole or in part with CDBG funds.

In addition, the Subrecipient agrees to submit special reports when requested.

Catalog of Federal Domestic Assistance (CDFA). The City, as a pass-through entity for
Federal awards, is providing the following CDFA information to the CDBG Subrecipient
to be used for their single audit and any reporting to the federal government required by
the non-profit organization:

CDFA Program Title — Community Development Block Grants/Entitlement Grants
CDFA Number — 14.218

Agency Office — Department of Housing & Urban Development/Office of Community
Planning & Development

Type of Assistance — A-Formula Grants

Organizational Unit — City of Wyoming

Organizational DUNS — 07928-3982

Award Year — 2015/2016 (July 1, 2015 - June 30, 2016)

Subrecipient Name — The Salvation Army Social Services

Project — Subsistence Payments, administered by The Salvation Army Social Services
Project Description — City of Wyoming low-income persons pending eviction have the
benefit of short-term rental assistance for the purpose of preventing homelessness and
providing a suitable living environment.

Project Funding - $16,000

Eligible Costs of the Subrecipient.

Under this Contract, a cost incurred or expenditure made by or pursuant to this Contract shall be
fully documented and shall be in conformance with any limitations or exclusions of applicable
Federal, State and local laws, rules and regulations and conditions mandated by the City,
including the regulations found at 2 CFR Part 200 entitled, “Uniform Administrative
Requirements, Cost Principles, and Audit Requirements for Federal Awards, Final Guidance.”

Records and Documentation.

a.

Establishment and Maintenance of Records. The Subrecipient shall establish and
maintain all necessary records concerning any matter covered by this Contract which,
from time to time, may be required by the City.

Unless otherwise expressly authorized by the City, the Subrecipient shall maintain all
records related to this Contract, including financial records and accounts, for a period of
three (3) years after receipt of final payment under this Contract.



Page 7
C. If any litigation, claim, or audit is started before the expiration of the three (3) year
period, the records shall be retained by the Subrecipient until all litigation, claims or audit
findings involving the records have been resolved.

14, Audits and Inspections.

a. At any time during normal business hours and as often as the City may deem necessary to
ensure proper accounting for all project funds, the Subrecipient shall:

1) Make available to the City all checks, payrolls, time records, invoices, contracts,
vouchers, orders and other data, information, and material concerning any matter
covered by this Contract; and

2) Permit the City, or its designee, to audit, examine, excerpt, or transcribe all
checks, payrolls, time records, invoices, contracts, vouchers, orders or other data,
information and material concerning any matter covered by this Contract; and

3) Allow the City, or its designee, to review such documents pertaining to this
Contract that are considered as backup to the operation of the Subrecipient,
regardless of funding source.

b. Within one hundred eighty (180) days after the end of its fiscal year, the Subrecipient
shall provide to the City an audit meeting the requirements of the regulations found at 2
CFR Part 200 entitled, “Uniform Administrative Requirements, Cost Principles, and
Audit Requirements for Federal Awards, Final Guidance.”

C. The Contractor is required to compare the amounts reported on their audited financial
statements to the City’s records to ensure accuracy in reporting the correct amounts of
expended federal awards.

15. Conflict of Interest.

a. The Subrecipient covenants that no conflict of interest exists and no person having any
conflicting interest in this Contract shall be employed for the purpose of performing the
services and activities set forth in the scope of services (Section 2) of this Contract or
fulfilling the terms, conditions, obligations, covenants, agreements, or stipulations herein.

b. The Subrecipient shall establish safeguards to prohibit employees from using positions for a
purpose that is or gives the appearance of being motivated by a desire for private gain for
themselves or others, particularly those with whom they have family, business or other ties.

16. Assignment and Transfer of Interest; Subcontracting.

The Subrecipient shall not assign or transfer, whether by assignment or notation, any interest in
this Contract, or subcontract any performance or portion hereof pursuant to this Contract without
the prior written consent of the City; provided, however, that claims for money due or to become
due the Subrecipient from the City pursuant to this Contract may be assigned or transferred to a
bank, trust company, or other financial institution without such consent, and the Subrecipient shall
promptly notify the City of any such assignment or transfer.



Page 8

17.

18.

19.

20.

Lobbying and Political Activities.

None of the money, compensation, reimbursement, funds, property or services provided, directly
or indirectly, under, by or pursuant to this Contract shall be used for any partisan political activity
or to further the election or defeat of any candidate for any public office, or for propaganda
designed to support or defeat any legislation pending before the Congress of the United States,
the Michigan State Legislature or the City.

Save Harmless Clause.

The Subrecipient shall indemnify and save harmless the City, its officers, agents and employees
against any and all damages to property or injuries to or death of any person or persons, including
the property and employees or agents of the City, and the Subrecipient shall defend, indemnify
and save harmless the City from any and all claims, demands, suits, liabilities and/or payments,
actions, or proceedings of any kind or nature, including workers' compensation claims, of or by
anyone whomsoever, in any way resulting from or arising out of the operations in connection
with this Contract, including the operations of subcontractors, and the acts or omissions of
employees or agents of the Subrecipient or its subcontractors. Any insurance coverage specified
herein and in any special conditions constitutes the minimum requirements, and said requirements
shall in no way lessen or limit the liability of the Subrecipient under the terms and conditions of
this Contract. The Subrecipient shall procure and maintain, at its own costs and expense, any
additional kinds and amounts of insurance that, in its own judgment, may be necessary for its
proper protection in performing its obligations under this Contract.

Debarred or Ineligible Contractors.

The Subrecipient agrees to abide by the provisions of 24 CFR Part 24, which include but are
limited to the following:

HUD funds may not be used to directly or indirectly to employ, award contracts to, or otherwise
engage the services of any contractor or subrecipient during any period of debarment, suspension,
or placement or ineligibility status.

Subrecipients should check all contractors, subcontracts, and vendors against the Federal
publication that lists debarred and ineligible contractors. The Excluded Parties List of debarred
contractors can be found at https://www.sam.gov.

Subrecipients shall confirm and document rental housing as registered certified for occupancy by
the City of Wyoming. Property compliance can be confirmed by visiting
http://www.wyomingmi.gov/Building/building.asp (Permit and Complaint Lookup).

Federal Uniform Administrative Requirements.

This section lists certain administrative standards required by the federal government, as City
expenditures for these contracted services are funded through the City’s Community
Development Block Grant program using Department of Housing and Urban Development
(HUD) funds. The Subrecipient will comply with the requirements and standards specified in the
following federal regulations:


https://www.sam.gov/
http://www.wyomingmi.gov/Building/building.asp

Page 9

21.

2 CFR Part 200 entitled, “Uniform Administrative Requirements, Cost Principles, and Audit
Requirements for Federal Awards, Final Guidance.”

Subpart K of 24CFR570, “Other Program Requirements”, except that the Subrecipient does not
assume the City’s environmental responsibilities or the responsibility for initiating the
environmental review process.

Subpart J of 24CFR570.504, “Program Income.”

Subpart J of 24CFR570.502, “Applicability of Uniform Administrative Requirements.”

Insurance.

The Subrecipient shall purchase and maintain, at its sole expense and as long as it is providing
services to City, the following insurance coverage:

a.

Commercial General Liability — Occurrence form, including coverage for bodily injury,
personal injury, property damage (broad form), premises/operations, blanket contractual,
and products/completed operations. Coverage shall be endorsed to include City as an
additional insured for work performed by the Subrecipient in accordance with this
Agreement.

Minimum Limits:

Bodily Injury - $1,000,000 per person/$1,000,000 per occurrence
Property Damage - $1,000,000 per occurrence

Automobile - Michigan no-fault coverage, and residual automobile liability,
comprehensive form, covering owned, hired, and non-owned automobiles. Coverage
shall be endorsed to include the City as an additional insured for work performed by the
Subrecipient in accordance with this Agreement.

Minimum Limits:

No-fault coverage — statutory

Bodily Injury - $1,000,000 per person/$1,000,000 per occurrence
Property Damage - $1,000,000 per occurrence

Workers' Compensation and Employer's Liability — Statutory coverage or proof
acceptable to the City of approval as a self-insurer by the State of Michigan.

Minimum Limits:

Workers' Compensation — statutory
$500,000 per occurrence

Professional Liability — Covering acts, errors or omissions of a professional nature
committed or alleged to have been committed by the Subrecipient or any of its
subcontractors. Coverage shall be effective upon the date of this Agreement and shall




Page 10

remain effective for a period of three (3) years after the date of final payment hereunder.
Such coverage shall be endorsed to include any subcontractors hired by the Subrecipient.

Minimum Limits:
$1,000,000 per occurrence/$1,000,000 annual aggregate

Insurance coverage shall cover all claims against the City, its officials and employees,
arising out of the work performed by the Subrecipient or any of its subcontractors under
this Agreement. Should any work be subcontracted, it shall be the responsibility of the
Subrecipient to maintain Independent Contractor's Protective Liability Insurance with
limits equal to those specified above for Commercial General Liability Insurance. In
addition, the Subrecipient shall provide proof of Workers' Compensation Insurance for all
subcontractors in compliance with the required statutory limits of the State of Michigan.

Said policies of insurance shall be with companies licensed to do business in the State of
Michigan and in a form satisfactory to the City. All insurance companies must maintain
a rating of B+, VIII or better from A.M. Best Company. Certificates of insurance with a
thirty (30) day cancellation clause shall be filed with and approved by the City at least
five (5) days in advance of commencing work under this Agreement. Upon request, the
Subrecipient shall provide the City with a complete certified copy of the policies for the
above coverage’s. Cancellation, material restriction, nonrenewal or lapse of any of the
required policies shall be grounds for immediate termination of this Agreement by City.
Any reduction or exhaustion in the limits of required insurance coverage shall not be
deemed to limit the indemnification afforded in accordance with this Agreement or any
amendments thereto. Depending on the subject matter of the transaction, the City may
require other insurance coverage in addition to the coverage’s contained herein.

22. Civil Rights.

a.

The Subrecipient agrees that it will not discriminate as to provision of services pursuant
to this Contract or as to hiring or terms or conditions of employment based on race, creed,
color, religion, national origin, sex, marital status, height, weight, age, or disability
unrelated to an individual's ability to perform the duties of a particular job or position.

The Subrecipient will, in all solicitations or advertisements for employees placed by or on
behalf of the Subrecipient, state that all qualified applicants will receive consideration for
employment without regard to race, color, religion, height, weight, marital status, sex,
age, national origin, or disability unrelated to an individual's ability to perform the duties
of a particular job or position.

The Subrecipient will send to each labor union or representative of workers with which
the Subrecipient has a collective bargaining agreement or other contract or understanding,
a notice, to be provided by the City, advising the labor union or workers' representative of
the Subrecipient’s commitments under this nondiscrimination clause and shall post copies
of this notice in conspicuous places available to employees and applicants for
employment under this Contract.

10



Page 11

23.

24,

25.

26.

27.

28.

d. In the event of the Subrecipient’s noncompliance with the nondiscrimination clauses of
this Contract or with any of such rules, regulations or orders, this Contract may be
canceled, terminated, or suspended in whole or in part.

Compliance with the Law.

In performing the Services and Activities required under this Contract and in fulfilling the terms,
conditions, obligations, covenants, agreements and stipulations of this Contract, the Subrecipient
shall comply with all applicable Federal, State and local laws including but not limited to the
following: the Architectural Barrier Act of 1968, as amended, 42 USC § 4151 et seq.; the Barrier
Free Design Act, 1966 PA 1, as amended, MCL 125.1351 et seq.; the Davis—Bacon Act, as
amended, 40 USC § 3141 et seq.; the Copeland Anti-Kickback Act, as amended, 18 USC § 874,
40 USC § 3145, and as supplemented by 29 CFR Part 3; and the Federal Fair Labor Standards
Act of 1938, as amended, 29 USC § 201 et seq.

Severability of Provisions.

If any clauses, sections, provisions or parts of this Contract are held invalid, or if any portion of
any clause, section, provision, or part of this Contract is held invalid, the remainder of this
Contract shall not be affected thereby, if such remainder of this Contract would then continue to
conform to the terms and requirements of applicable law. Unless otherwise specified in this
Contract, all notices, duties or rights of the City shall be exercised by and through this Contract as
specified herein.

Waiver.
The failure of the City to demand compliance with any term of this Contract or to take action
when this Contract is breached in any way shall not be considered a waiver of that contractual

requirement thereafter nor of the City's right of action for the breach of that term.

Disclosure of Confidential Material.

All reports, data, information, forecasts, records and so forth assembled, constructed, or prepared
pursuant to or as a consequence of this Contract are subject to all Federal and Michigan laws and
regulations governing the disclosure of public and medical records, subject to certain exemptions
from disclosure under the circumstances expressly authorized by the above laws and regulations.

City Department or Office.

It is agreed by the parties hereto that the City's Community Development Office shall be
responsible for the administration of this Contract on behalf of the City.

Termination at City's Election.

Either party may, upon sixty (60) days written notice to the Contractor, terminate this Contract and
all of the City's obligations hereunder, including any obligations to provide financial assistance.
The City may exercise its rights pursuant to this provision regardless of whether the Subrecipient is
in default of any condition or obligation under this Contract. Once the City has provided written
notice to the Subrecipient, the City shall not be obligated to supply financial assistance over the

11



Page 12

29.

proceeding months of this Contract in an amount greater than the average monthly payment to the
Subrecipient. Average monthly payment, for the purpose of this section, shall be determined by
totaling the City’s contribution from the inception of the Contract until the time notice is provided
and dividing the amount of monies expended over such period by the number of funded months (or
any fraction thereof). The City shall also compensate the Subrecipient for any required expenses in
excess of the average monthly payment in an amount not to exceed the total amount of this Contract
as specified in Section 4 hereof.

Certifications.

The Subrecipient must comply with the requirements and standards specified in federal regulation
2 CFR 200.415 addressing certifications, which are required to be included as a part thereof and
submitted with all annual and final fiscal reports and vouchers for payment. The following is the
specific certification language to be used:

“By signing this report, | certify to the best of my knowledge and belief that the report is true,
complete and accurate, and the expenditures, disbursements and cash receipts are for the purposes
and objectives set forth in the terms and conditions of the federal award. | am aware that any
false, fictitious or fraudulent information, or the omission of any material fact, may subject me to
criminal, civil or administrative penalties for fraud, false statements, false claims or otherwise.”

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, the City and the Subrecipient have executed this Contract as of the

date first above written.

Witness: CITY OF WYOMING,

a Michigan municipal corporation

By:

Jack A. Poll, Mayor Date

By:

Kelli A. VandenBerg, City Clerk Date

12



Page 13

Approved as to form:

! / . -

. s P ,/
bl
Jaqkﬁ. Sluiter, City of Wyoming

;

THE SALVATION ARMY OF KENT COUNTY,
a not-for-profit corporation

By:

Betty Zylstra, Executive Director Date
The Salvation Army of Kent County

By:

Bramwell E. Higgins, Secretary  Date
The Salvation Army Central Territory

13



5/4/15
Engineering/JJO:nll

RESOLUTION NO.

RESOLUTION TO AWARD THE BID FOR WATERMAIN REPLACEMENT
ON WYOMING AVENUE FROM PORTER STREET TO 28™ STREET, WRENWOOD
STREET FROM WYOMING AVENUE TO AVON AVENUE AND BOULEVARD DRIVE
FROM WRENWOOD STREET TO PORTER STREET

WHEREAS:

1. Due to their age and condition, the existing watermains in Wyoming Avenue,
Wrenwood Street and Boulevard Drive require frequent maintenance to repair
broken watermains and water services.

2. The existing watermains have reached the end of their useful life and require
replacement to minimize impacts to residents.

3. On April 28, 2015, the City received five (5) bids for the proposed watermain
reconstruction with Kamminga & Roodvoets, Inc. submitting the low bid of
$1,437,113.98.

4. The bid is $42,110.40, or 2.8% below the Engineer’s estimate and is in the best
interest of the City to perform the aforementioned work.

5. The total cost for this project will be financed out of the Water Fund, but a Budget
Amendment is necessary:

Capital Outlay Watermain 591-441-57300-972.573

Construction $1,437,113.98
Engineering & Contingencies $257,886.02
Total Project Cost $1,695,000.00

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED:

1. The City Council hereby awards the Wyoming, Wrenwood, Boulevard
Watermain project contract to Kamminga & Roodvoets, Inc., in the amount of
$1,437,113.98.

2. The attached Budget Amendment is hereby approved.

Moved by Councilmember:
Seconded by Councilmember:
Motion Carried Yes

No

I hereby certify that the foregoing Resolution was adopted by the City Council for the City of
Wyoming, Michigan at a regular session held on May 4, 2015.

Kelli A. VandenBerg, Wyoming City Clerk

Resolution No.




CITY OF WYOMING BUDGET AMENDMENT

Date: May 4, 2015 Budget Amendment No. 050

To the Wyoming City Council:

A budget amendment is requested for the following reason: To appropriate $900,000 of budgetary authority
to provide funding for the Wyoming, Boulevard, Wrenwood watermain project scheduled for construction in the
summer months of 2015.

Description/Account Code Current Increase Decrease Amended

Water Fund

Public Works - Capital Outlay - Capital Outlay Watermains
591-441-57300-972.573 $2,139,730 $900,000 $3,039,730

Working Capital (591) - $ 900,000

$
Recommended: %WW (7/ M,:b {'—\Dk

7" Accountant \_”" City Manager

Motion by Councilmember , seconded by Councilmember
that the General Appropriations Act for Fiscal Year 2014-2015 be amended by adoption of the foregoing budget
amendment.

Motion carried: yeas, nays

| hereby certify that at a meeting of the Wyoming City Council duly held on
the foregoing budget amendment was approved.

City Clerk

Page 1 of 1



Staff Report

Date: April 29, 2015
Subject: Wyoming, Wrenwood, Boulevard Watermain Reconstruction - Award of Bid
From: William D. Dooley, Director of Public Works

Meeting Date: May 4, 2015

Recommendation:

Staff recommends awarding the Wyoming, Wrenwood, Boulevard Watermain
Reconstruction project to Kamminga & Roodvoets, Inc. for the low bid of $1,437,113.98,
2.8% below the Engineer’s estimate.

Sustainability Criteria:

Environmental Quality — Reliable watermains provide safe, potable water to residents and
businesses for use, consumption, and emergency response.

Social Equity — The watermain replacement project has little or no impact on Social
Equity.

Economic Strength — Providing safe and reliable drinking water is beneficial for residents
and businesses in Wyoming and adds to the economic strength of a community.

Discussion:

On April 28, 2015, the City of Wyoming received five (5) bids for the Wyoming,
Wrenwood, Boulevard Watermain Reconstruction project with Kamminga & Roodvoets,
Inc. submitting a low bid of $1,437,113.98 which is 2.8% below the Engineer’s estimate.
The existing watermains in Wyoming Avenue between Porter Street and 28™ Street,
Wrenwood Street between Wyoming Avenue and Avon Avenue and Boulevard Drive
between Wrenwood Street and Porter Street create frequent maintenance calls in the City
of Wyoming. There have been a number of main breaks on the existing watermains and
they have reached the end of their useful life. This project will replace the existing mains
and the water services within the street right-of-way.

The total project cost is $1,695,000.00 including Engineering and Contingencies.
It is recommended that the City Council award the Wyoming, Wrenwood, Boulevard

Watermain Reconstruction project to Kamminga & Roodvoets, Inc., in the amount of
$1,437,113.98.

Budget Impact:

Funds are available in the Water Fund, but a Budget Amendment is necessary.

Attachments: Bid Tabulation

Contract



INd 0E:457ZL SLOTIST/Y
L3o 193y

0°€s 143N

(WORONUSUOOY UTBULINEBM S10T) S1°89T # I0BAUCD

%LELT %E6' T 8O'COP'G6.L' 1S Ul 0D Uononsuo) 0osIBNA (Z) 6
%P9 %6401 G598Z'Z65'1$ '0u| 'siojeAeox3 BuoAm (KL ) ¥
%289 %S56°6 £8'Z9L'085°'LS ONI ‘SNOS B uIDOgIW ez ) ¢
%.E'E %019 Z0LLL'B25° LS uoponnsuc) eEeN () 2
%8 T %000 26°CLL'ZEP LS ou| ‘'sjponpooy g eBulwweM (67) 1
%000 %E6'T QEVZZ'6.1'LS AIVYNILSI SHIINIONT 0
1S3 BAD % MOT I3A0 % pigl 1e30L Jappig Muey

Slgol {s)syosloay

UCHONIISUCIS Y UIBLLIBIBA SLOZ uoyEso]

1S POOMUSIAA PUB “I(] pieAs|neg ‘aay BuluoAps Jo) uleuuSiEpn :uonduasag

G189l :al oenuod

wostiedwio)y pig



INd 0€°.5°ZL S1L0T/8CH

€S 1IN

L3o ¢ sdeg {uononnsucoyy UreUHS®M S10T) S1°891 # 10BnUo)D
INVHOAH .G d 2 4

00°00Z°SHS 00°00L'Z$ 00°00¥'0¥$ 00'5Z8'2$ 00°000°0¥3$ 00'00S'2$ e3 O 0¥0S 9100
sbuisen aimonng sbeurel(

00°004'82% 00°00.$ 00°GLO'LLS 00°GLYS 00°'509'91L$ 00°50r$ el 1y Le0F  SLOO
(NISYE HOLvD) .80 VIA & THNLONYLS FOVYNIVEA

00005'0L% 00°005°'€$ 00°6ZL'v$ 00'625'L$ 00°008'v$ 00°009°1$ vd € 9L0¥ ¥L00
«& - INTINIAVC ONLLSIXT ONITIWN d7100

00°5£6'8c$ 00'Z$ 88°LOB'EPS joTATA 28 108'erS gz'es AS §lev'sl oLZL €100
NIYINEZ YA X3 SA0ONTA

00°009°t$ 00°02$ 00°008°L$ 00'0L$ 00°002°L$ 000L$ 471 08l 0L1L  TLOO
INVHUAH SACNIY

00°00Z'S$ 00'00¥$ 00°066°¢$ 00°0g2s 00°GZ6'C$ 00's2e$ el ¢l 89LL 1100
STANLIONYLS JOVNIVIA XI IA0NWIH

00002 LS 00°00v$ 00°G9.% posseEs 00°0G.$ 00'062$ vd ¢ SkllL 0100
¥X04g ANV IATVA DNLLSIXZ IAONTY

00°052'c$ 00°'051% 00°00g'0% 00°081L$ 00'6ZL'es 00'GLLS B3 &6¢ £PLL 6000
SONILSYD NV H3A0D X3 IAONWIA

00°000°'6$ 00'002% 00°002'L$ 00°091% 00'08.'9% 000SL$ va st kLl 8000
INIFWIAYC IAONIY

00°++8°Z$ 00'v$ [ AR A or'es 05°88%'¢S 05°cs AS  LLL Sk0L L1000
HIWMIAIS IA0NEY

00'90L'7LS 003 01°005'Z1% or'es GLLo8'TLE 0SS AS  §9.9¢ Se0lL 9000
HIALLNO ¥ 9N IAONIY

06°901'vZ$ 00'c$ 0.L°02¢'L2$ ov'es GZvZ1'8e$ 05'¢€$ H  g'gg0's 8001 S000
HIDYUYT YO .98 STdL IAOWIY

00°002'v$ 00°00¥'1$ 00°002'v$ 00'00¥'L$ 00°00.'2% 00°006% vl ¢ ¥00L  +000
92 OL 81 §33YL IAOWTY

QU 0Ov'eS 00'068% 00°005'c$ 00'6/83% 00'005'CS 00°6.8% ed ¥ €00l €000
«81 OL .8 S33¢ L INOWIH

00°058'1$ 00'681$ 00059'c$ 00°69t$ 00°059'¢$ 00°59E$ g3 0L 2001 2000
NOLLYZIaonN

00°000'06% 00°000°05% 00°000'08% 00°000°08% 00°000°0.L% 00"000'02% S1 | 000L  LOOO

ejol 2dl.d pig 1ol 20U4 pIg eyl aJld pig uonduasag

uononsuo) [ebeN (7) 2u| '$180APOOY B ebunuwey (1) JLVINILSTE SHIANIONT (0) | spun Anuenp apoo way Aed  aur




INd 0E:25:21 SL0C/8E/

0°€°S THIAW

L0 €93eg {uoponusuosMy wewnslem S10T) S1°891 #108nU0D
W8 MIVAMIAIS FLFHONOD

00°002'1$ 00'+3 00°059'L$ 0564 Co002' 1S 00'7$ s 00¢ 2.79  LEOO
W MIYMIAIS TLIHONOD

0£'2.5'65% 01'2$ 56°9Z1'0L% 59'7% 00'68£'6.9 00'e$ ds  £ov'er 0/79 Q00
W02 HILLND ANY g9ND ILIHONOD

GLZL0'L8S 0G6°0L% 0Z2.9'G6% or'zis 00'08G'Z6% 00ZLS ¥ SGLLL O¥Z9 6200
V42! 1330 - 93LLN9D 3LIHINOD

00'0¥8% CoOPLS 00°0Z0'1L$ 00°L1$ 00°0Z.% 00ZLS 4 09 0229 8Z00
sBuiueAA 2qeo9leq

00°008'9L$ 00°02% 00°00Z'cL$ 00°65$ 00°008'9L$ 00°0.% 4 0¥ L1Z9  LzZ00
WF dINYY MTYMIAIS

00°126'8LS 05°¢S 09'852'013 01'€$ 00°0€0°L2$ 00's$ 48  oob's 0LZ9 9200
JAvHO 13341S

00'09.'76% 00'51L% 00'802'v.$ 00ZLS 00°80Z'%/% 00ZLS 41 8L ¥LLG  S200

SNOLLYOOT- SOORIVA-.
1V 3AIS LYOHS dNOD'SIDINEIS H3LYM WL 184

00°008'7$ 00°008% 00°008'+r$ 00°008% 00°000'95$ 00°000'1$ e3 9% 9096  ¥Z00

SNOLLYOOT-SACRIVA-
1V 3AIS ONOT JWOD'STIDIAYIS HILYM .1 T84

00°009'S.$ 00°00¥ 1S 00°019'26% 00'GLL'LS 00°00%'98% 00°009'1$ 23 5 G09S €200

{013-83A3FIS--
‘SH3IONAIY 'SON1d 'SANIG 'SFZL) SVIDILS 19, 8

00°0S0'21$ 00°065% 00°629'L 14 00'S.e$ 00°00£'6$ 00°00¢£% va 1€ 2025 2200

(243-SAAITS--
‘SYIONATY 'SONTd 'SAN3E ‘'S33 L) STVIOTLS 1D . 9

00°00¥'8E$ 00°00%$ 00°095°22$ 00'62Z$ 00°000°'%2% 00'05Z% vd 96 102 1200
.8 3did YIFLVYM €5 1D 1'd

00°095°5¥T$ 00028 00°9L¥'221% 00°25% 00°9L¥'28LS 00'25% 41 80S8€ 20Ls 0200
49 3dId H3AYAM €S 1D 1A

00'291'961% 00°29% 00'200'CrLS SZTH$ 00Z/8'L51$ 00°8Y$ 41 ¥9l'e LOLS  BL00
2 SIATVYA

00°009'82% 00°002'1L$ 00°0£2'2e% 00'S9r'L$ 00°009'82S 00°00g' LS va 22 2205 8100
@ SIATYA

00°002'+t$ 00°056% 00°09L' 13 0008L'L$ 0O009'68% 00'00L'L$ vd ge 9/0§ /100
1ejol aolg pig leyol aoud pig 1e30], 20Ld P9 uonduosag
uononnsuo) jabeN (z) U] ‘s}e0ApoCY p ebuiwey (1) JLVINILST SHIINIONT (0) | syun Auenp apog way Aed  our]




Wd 0£:2521 SLOZ/8T/Y

0°ES8 TH43N

LJo ¥ odeq {uogonnsuoday UrRUUAEA SEOT) S1°89] 4 3Wenuo)

20 LLL6ZS LS 26'CLL LSV 18 8eYZL6LP LS ‘Sejel pig
A3LVHILO - GILHDIT [ AL IAVOIEEYE

00°05¢2$ 0001$ 00°052$ 0001% 00°05¢$ 00°01$ vad g2 LLL8  £r00
GIHSINGNS - GILHOIT I 3dAL FAVYIIYEYE

00°000'L$ 00°0v$ 00'000'2$ 00°08% 00°006'2$ 00°00L$ va &2 L8 ZHO0
@31vH3dO - GILHDI [| IdAL 3AVOIHHve

00°091$ 00°1$ 00091.$ 00'LS 00°091% 00'1$ Y3 09k 1018 P00
Q3HSINYNG - AILHOIT 1 AdAL FAVYOIHEYS

00 0v'eS 05°12% 00°02E'v$ 00°22$ 00°008'7$ 00°0¢$ v3d 091 00lg  OF00
$ADIAZA TOULINOD D1d4vHL HONIN

00'616'21$ 00'G.5'ZLS 00°00£'823 00°00£'82$ 00°000'0L$ 00°000'01$ S1 I 0L08  6E00
HOINW-OHUAAH 0338 ¥ SSY10

GZ'06E'GS 05°1$ GL'OBLLS 0508 00°281'L$ 00°Z$ AS GE6GC GLOL 8200
gaNIIHOS ¥ 0SS dOL

00°195'12$ 00°9$ €5'61EL1S GLes 00'vLE'PLS 00'¥% AS §'ges't S00L  LE00
Ot - QUNLXIW SNONINNLIE

8.°8¥9'9Z1$ 98'69$ 00°816'921% 00°09% 00°62Z'¥rLS 00°6/% NOL €26k GEEY  9E00
2¢ - JUNLXIA SNONIWNLIG

LCE A AR 80'v9$ 00°92Z'6L1$ 00'C9$ 00°0L9'VELS 00°0.$ NOL €761 €€€9  GEO0
ONIHO1Vd ONVH

09°0¥6'Z$ €O LPiS 00°000'Z$ 00°00L$ 00°000'Z$ 00°00L$ NOL 0¢ S0E9 €00
SONILSYD 1SNray

00°002'€2$ 00°00¥$ 00 ¥¥E'¥es 00°'8Lv$ 00°089'vZ$ 00'GZTYS vd 8§ G629 £T00
W 'AIDHOANITY NON INTFWIAYA F1IHONOD

00°055'vL$ 00°02$ 88°05E'LLS sg'ees 00°09%'LLS 00'¥2$ AS  §lTL 0829 ZE€00

feyol 901d pig lejol 2oUd pIg [ejoy a0l pig uonduosaq

uogonusuo) [ebeN (z) au| 's)poApooy 3§ ebuliwey (1) JLVINLLSE SHIANIONS (0) | spun fAnuenp apop way Aed  aur|




Wd L2485 CL SLOT/8TY

Q'€ T3

L3I0 g o8eg (uononIsuooy UrLSEM S10T) S1'8S1 #102nTU0])
INYHOAH .S d% 4

00'920'ch$ 00°€69'2% 00°095'2c% 00'0L¥'23 D0°009'cES 00°00L'2% e3 gl 0r0s 9100
sBunsen ampanng sbeueig

00°005°02$ 00°005% 00°60.°02% 00°S05$ 00°0SE'¥L$ 00°05£$ 3 b LEOY  SLOO
(NISYg HOLYD) .8-0 VIa & IHNLONHLS FOYNIVHE]

00°6£5'3$ 00'6v8'Z$ 00 ¥rr'TLS 008t L'¥$ 00°001'G$ 00°00L'1$ vd ¢ 9L0Y  ¥100
«£ - INIFWIAY DNILSIX3 ONITTIN 3100

2Cere'8LS S0'P$ 05 /9v'61% 00'L$ 00871 LES 09'LS AS  GLOV'6L oLeL €100
NIVINGSLVAA X3 IAONES

00°029'L$ 00'6$ 00°0PE'ZS 00°¢ls 00°09L'2$ 00'ZL$ 471 081 0LLL  ZLOO
INVYQAH 3AONTY

00'0.0°G$ 00°06¢% 00°621'9% 00°SLrS 00°0v9'c$ 00°082$ B3 €l 89LL 1100
SIUNLONYLS IDOVNIVHA X3 JAOWIH

00°085'L$ 00°015% 00'€eZ' 1S 00 LIFs 00°05.% 00°052$ vd ¢ S¥LL  0LO0
X009 NV IATYA ONILSIXT IAONIY

00°052°Z1$ 00'05¢$ 00°G6S5'L$ 00°2L2$ 00°059'9% 00°06L$ e3 &t Syl 6000
SONILSYD ANV J3A00 X3 IAONIY

00°6EL2LS 00°£9Z$ 00°69.'6$ 00°212% 00°009'21$ 00°082$ v3a &b Zrll 2000
LINIWIAYI IAOWIY

ST B6L'YS GL 9% 00°0L1'2% 00°0L$ 00'992'v$ 00'gs AS  LLL SPOL L0000
MIVAMIAIS SAOWTY

05Z8e’sLs 00'5$ 06'6£.'6Z$ 0028 ST PYS'oLs 05'v$ AS  §9.9'¢C g0l 9000
¥ILLND B GHUNO IAONIY

00'ELZ Sk 00°9% 0G'LLL'0V$ 00°6$ STA AN T4 05°e$ 14 g'ge0's 8001  S000
¥3D¥VYT ¥O .9¢ SITHL AW

00°068'6$ 00°066°L$ 00°0€2'v% 00 0LP' 1S 00°0E2'V$ cooLr'Ls va € +00L 000
49€ 0L .61 S3341 JAONWEH

00°00¥'9% 00°009'L$ 00'0Z0'E$ 00°SS.L$ 00'0Z0'e$ 006548 e3 ¥ €00l €000
W81 OL .8 STIYL INOWTYH

00'000FS 00°00v$ 00°006°L$ 00'061% 00'098°L$ 00'281L% ed o0l 2001 2000
NOILYZITISOW

00°000°98% 00'000'98% 05'1L05'8.$ 05'105'8.$ 00°000'08$ 00°000°08% $1 L 000l  LOOD

1210 aoud pIg 1e3o] 2aud pig [e30), aoud pig uonduosaq

QU] "0D) uoONAIsuUeY 088N (G} "ou| ‘siopeneaxy BupuoAma (¥) ONI 'SNOS % Y009 (€) | spun Anuenp apon wayl Aed  aur




Wd LeLSZL SL02/8T/Y

0°€'s THaN

Lo 93ded (uononnsU0dsY WRULIEA, C10T) S1°§9T # WRIUOD
W8 MIVAIAIS FLITEDINOD

0001L1L°LS 0L€% 0002 L% 00'v$ 00°050'LS$ 0s'es ¥s  00g 229 1E00
& HMIVAMIAIS SLIHDINOD

06'+92'09% 0278 0£°2L5'65% 012% 0€'2/6°G5% 0128 48 eov'or 0L29  0S00
WOE "HILIND ANY 9HN2 2LIHEONOD

51'681'/8% SIS 05°0/8'%8% 00'LLS G1°69)'L8% 0gLls ¥ SSLLL OFe9 6200
V22l 130 - ¥31LN9 J1FHONOD

00°002'L$ 00028 00°0¥8% 00bLS 00°00Z'1L$ 00°02% H 09 02Zg 8zZ00
sBuiwiepn s1qePa1eg

00'002'2$ 00°0€$ 00°008'9L$ 00°0L% 00°002' L% 000gs I ove LV29 2200
JF dINYY MTYMIAIS

00'vZ9'12S 00¥S 00°1LZ6'3L% 0ses 00°126'81$ 05€$ 48 eoy's 0LZ9 9700
Havdo 13341

00°2/t'6vS 00°8$ 00°802'v.$ 00ZL$ 00'009°vS1$ 00524 41 819 ¥LLO  S2Z00

SNOLYIOT-SAOIMA -
1V 3018 LHOHS dWOD'SADIAYIS YILYAM .1 T8

00°0¥9'65% 00°590'1$ 00'¥9Z'19% 00'¥80'1$ 00°009'19% 00°001'1$ B3 g% 009§ 200

SNOYDOT-SRORIVA-
1¥ 3AIS ONOT dWOD'SIDIALTS HILYM L T84

00°0¥E'611% 00012'28 00'91£'68% 00'¥59' LS 00°000'L8$ 00°005°L$ B3 ¥§ 6095 €200

{:213-83A3FTS-
‘S¥IONATY ‘SO ‘SANAL 'SIID §IVIDIAS 1D . 8

00°591'Zes 00°SLL$ 00'212'02% 00°259% 00°00§'6L$ 00°005% v3 1E Z0Z8  2zZ0o

(A SIATTIS
‘SYIONAIY 'SONTd 'SANTE 's33AL) STIVIO3dS 1D . 9

00'080'85$ 005094 0025 'bPS 00'Zor$ 00°09€'653% 00°CLYS vd 96 L0ZS 1200
«8 3did H3LYM €6 10 1A

00°0LY'682% 05283 00°250'2¥28 00'69% 00°08¥'0LZ$ 00°09% 41 806t Z0lL5  0Z00
49 3did ¥AIYM ES 1D 1 a

00°00€°282$ 00°6.% 00°0¥8'681$ 00°09% 00'002'851LS 00°05% 41 ¥al'e LOLS 6L00
«8 SIATVA

00'05¥'ZES 00°SLY LS 00'825'c5% 0042518 0000L'vES 00°055'1L$ vi 22 1106 2100
8 SIATVA

00°085'Lv$ 00'551'1$ 00°07€'8ES 00'590'1$ 00°000'Gt$ 000521 va  eg 9.0 /100

1ejoL aoud pig [elo), aoud pig [eicl aoud pigd uonduasaqg

Ul "0 UORONNSUOY) 09sIBAIQ (G) "2U] ‘s10jeneoX3] BUIIOAAA (1) ONI ‘SNOS 3 Y3009 TN (€) | spun Anuenp apop wey Aed  aur




Wd LE/S 2L SLOZ/BEN

0°€'G "Td3IN

L30 1 98eg (UonONNSUCIYY UIRWLINEM S10T) S1°89T # 10BIUOD

89°COV‘S6.°1$ §5°98Z'765°1$ £8°2791°085°1$ -S|Ejol pig
Q31YY3d0 - G3LHOIT (I 3dAL 3AVDI¥Yve

00°'052% 000L% 00°52% 00'L$ 06°152% s00L$ vd &2 LLLg  €+00
QIHSINYNA - QALHOI [l IdAL IAVIIENYE

00°000'L$ 00°0F% 00'000°1$ 00 0¥$ G/'S00'L$ £Z°0r$ v3d &2 OLig 200
Q3LYH3dO - 31IHDM | 3dAL 3GYIIHHVE

00°09L$ 00'1$ 00°09L$ 00'L$ 09'L9L$ 10'1% v3 09l L0l  L¥00
Q3HSINGNG - 3 LHDIT I 3dAL AAYordyvd

00" 0rP'ES 05°'12% 00°025'c$ 00°22% 08°097'c$ £oL2s Y4 091 0oi8 OO0
$30IA30 TOULINOD D447y L YONIW

00°S.¥'0ES 00°'G/ P08 00066 LLS 00°066°LLS 00°000'82% 00°000'sZ$ s l 0L08 6E00
HOTNIN-OMUAH G338 V¥ SSV10

05°£6S'ES 0018 0G°€6G'ES 0o'LS 00728128 o[olray AS  §'g8S'S GL0L 8200
@3N3FHOS .7 08 401

€1'690'2L$ S1p8 05'296'21% 00°6$ 00'9v.'9Z$ 00'g$ AS  ©'E65'E SO0L  ZS00
I - IUNLXIW SNONINNLIG

CTLEH'OZLS 62698 STISK'9ZLS G698 05'6.8'/21$  0599% NOL €Z6'L GEE9 9200
2€ - IUNLXIW SNONINNLIG

05v9Z'8LLS  0S'19$ 0S¥9Z'8Ll$  05'19% 09°0196L1$  0Z'Z9% NOL €26'L £6£9  S£00
ONIHOLVYd ONVYH

00°0¥6'2% 00°2PLS 00°0068'C$ 00°SFLS 00°0£2°1% 05°88% NOL 0¢ g0e8  ¥E00
SONILSYD LSnray

00022’ LES 00'0FS$ 00 ¥¥9' LYS 00°812% 00°000'62% 00°00G% va 95 g6¢9  £E00
oF {A3DHOANITH NON LINIWIAYD EIHONOD

€1 220'PLS Ge'6lS 00085 1S 00'02$ S 220'%LS SE6LE AS  §LeL 0829 200

[ejol ?2Ld pig [ejoL aold pig 1ejol aold pig uondussaqg

"Ju} "0 uoaNIsUOY oosseA] (G) 'ou| ‘siojeneoxy BuruoApa (¥) ONI ‘SNOS 2 ¥IM00a1IW (€) | spun fAnuenp apon wiay Aed  auI




CONTRACT

THIS CONTRACT AWARDED on the 4th day of May 2015 by and between the CITY OF
WYOMING, Kent County, Michigan, party of the first part, hereinafter called the "' City" and

KAMMINGA & ROODVOETS, INC,
3435 BROADMOOR AVENUE, SE
GRAND RAPIDS, MI 49512

party of the second part, hereinafter called the "' Contractor.”

Witnesseth, that the City and the Contractor, for the considerations hereinafter mentioned,
agree as follows:

ARTICLE I - THE CONTRACT

The following shall be deemed to be part of this Contract:

A.

B.

C.

=

= o

)‘—1

Performance Bond, Payment Bond, and Resolution from Board of Directors
Information for Bidders

Bid Proposal Form

Award of Bid

Certificate of Insurance (per City of Wyoming’s Contractor Insurance Requirements)
Subcontract Provision

Letter of Credit (5% of Annual Contract Amount)

Equal Employment Opportunity Statement

All Provisions required by law to be inserted in this contract,
whether actually inserted or not,

Special Specifications as listed below:

SEE ATTACHED




ARTICLE 1I - SCOPE OF THE WORK - SUBJECT MATTER

The Contractor hereby agrees to furnish all of the materials and all of the equipment and
labor necessary to perform all of the work shown on the drawing and described in the
specifications for the project entitled:

2015 WATERMAIN RECONSTRUCTION

all in accordance with the requirements and provisions of the Contract. The Contractor
likewise agrees to do all incidental and appurtenant work in connection therewith.

ARTICLE 111 - TIME OF COMPLETION

The work to be performed under this contract shall be completed on or before October 2,
2015. Should the Contractor be obstructed or delayed in the prosecution or completion of
his work by any act, neglect or default of the City, then the time herein fixed for completion
of the work shall be extended for a period equivalent to the time lost by reason of such
delay for the causes herein mentioned, The duration of such extension shall be determined
by the City Manager or his authorized representative,

ARTICLE 1V - LIQUIDATED DAMAGES

Should the work under this Agreement not be finished within the time specified, the City is
hereby authorized to deduct out of the money which may be due or become due to the
Contractor under this Agreement, as damages for the noncompletion of the work aforesaid,
within the time hereinbefore stipulated for its completion, the sum of One Thousand Three
Hundred Dollars ($1,300.00) for each calendar day by which the Contractor shall fail to
complete the work or any part thereof in accordance with the provisions hereof, and such
liguidated damages shall not be considered as a penalty. It is understood that the City
shall not forfeit its right to liquidated damages in the event that delay is partly caused by it.
In this event, said damages shall be apportioned so that each day of delay attributable to
the City shall be subtracted from the total days of delay, and the Contractor shall pay
liguidated damages for the remainder.




ARTICLE V - THE CONTRACT SUM
The City agrees to pay and the Contractor agrees to accept the sum of:

ONE MILLION FOUR HUNDRED THIRTY-SEVEN THOUSAND ONE HUNDRED
THIRTEEN DOLLARS AND 98/100 CENTS (51,437,113.98)

the amount named in the Proposal, as full compensation for all laber, supervision,
equipment, materials, and incidental expense required in execufing all of the work
contemplated in this Contract, including also all loss or damage arising out of the nature of
the work or from the action of the elements or from any unforeseen obstruction or
difficulties which may be encountered in the prosecution of the same or from other causes
of every description connected with the work.

It is further agreed that the sum named may be increased or decreased in accordance with
the units of work actually completed at the Contract unit prices, and may be increased by
the addition of items of work not included in the proposal items.

ARTICLE VI - CITY CHARTER TO BE GOVERNING DOCUMENT

The City Charter of the City shall be the governing document in all contractual relations
with the City of Wyoming. In the prosecution of the work under this Contract, cight (8)
hours shall constitute a day's labor. The City retains the right to determine finally all
(uestions as to the proper performance under this Contract or any unfinished portion
thereof, and in case of improper, dilatory or imperfect performance thereof to suspend the
work at any time and to order the partial or entire reconstruction of the same. The City
likewise retains full power to determine all questions arising under this Contract according
to the true intent and meaning thereof,

ARTICLE VII - COMPLIANCE WITH LAWS, ORDINANCES AND REGULATIONS

The Contractor shall keep himself fully informed of and shall at all time comply with all
local, state, and federal Iaws, rules, and regulations applicable to this Contract and the
work to be done hereunder.




IN WITNESS WHEREOF, the parties hereto have executed this Contract as of the day and
year first above written.

Witnesses CITY OF WYOMING
By
Jack Poll Date
Its Mayor
By
Kelli A, VandenBerg Date
Its City Clerk
CONTRACTOR Date
By
Its

Correct in form:

City Attorney Date
Certification of funds:
City Comptroller Date
The Contract above was approved and ordered executed by the Council of the
City of Wyoming at a session held , 20
Attest:

City Clerk Date




05/04/15
Purchasing/KRO

RESOLUTION NO.

RESOLUTION TO AUTHORIZE THE REPLACEMENT OF THE
POURED IN PLACE SAFETY SURFACING AND RELATED SITE
RESTORATION WORK WITHIN FROG HOLLOW PARK

WHEREAS:

1. As detailed in the attached Staff Report the original poured in place safety surface at
Frog Hollow Park is approaching ten years of wear and exposure and is at the end of
its lifecycle.

2. GameTime c/o Sinclair Recreation, LLC has provided a quote in the amount of
$64,680.00 to complete the purchase and installation of poured in place unitary safety
surfacing replacement at Frog Hollow using the U.S. Communities pricing.

3. Funds for the playground resurfacing are available in account number 208-752-

75600-975182.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED:

1. The City Council does hereby authorize the replacement of the poured in place safety
surfacing and related site restoration work within Frog Hollow Park in the amount of
$64,680.00.

2. The Wyoming City Council does hereby waive the provisions of Sections 2-252, 2-
253, 2-254 and 2-256 of the City Code regarding publication and posting of bid
notices, notification of bidders and the bid opening procedure.

Moved by Councilmember:
Seconded by Councilmember:
Motion Carried Yes

No

I hereby certify that the foregoing Resolution was adopted by the City Council for the City of
Wyoming, Michigan at a regular session held on May 4, 2015.

ATTACHMENTS: Kelli A. VandenBerg, Wyoming City Clerk
U.S. Communities Price List
Quote

Resolution No.

s:\purchasing\resolutions\fy 14-15 resolutions\poured in place surfacing frog h 2015.docx




STAFF REPORT
Date: April 26, 2015

Subject: Frog Hollow Poured In Place (PIP) Unitary Safety Surfacing
Replacement

From: Rebecca Rynbrandt, Director of Community Services

Council Meeting Date: Monday, May 4, 2015

Recommendation: Staff recommends the City Council award the replacement of the Poured in
Place (PIP) safety surfacing and related site restoration work within Frog Hollow Park to Sinclair
Recreation, Inc. in the amount of $64,680.

Sustainability Criteria:

Environmental Quality — Frog Hollow was constructed in 2004 and 2005. As we approach 10
years of wear and exposure to the elements, the PIP is approaching the end of its reasonable
life cycle. In order to ensure participant fall and impact safety, replacement is needed.

Economic Strength — Frog Hollow Park significantly
expands the number and caliber of accessible recreation
facilities in Wyoming; giving area visitors and residents
reason to explore Wyoming’s exceptional park system
and chose to live work and play in Wyoming.

Social Equity — This project protects public health and
welfare by maintaining ADA, ASTM, CPSC approved
playground safety surfacing as well as maintaining the
integrity of universal accessibility for children and
families using supportlve equipment. Frog Hollow Park has been instrumental providing
Wyoming's first municipal universally accessible public park. Located within the Metropolitan
Hospital’s Health Village, the park is Wyoming’s #1 visited playground.

Discussion:

Working with Laura Jackson from our Purchasing Department, we are able to access US
Communities Pricing (a national bidding network) to obtain the work at the most cost effective
pricing.

The project scope includes the disassembly and disposal of the existing rubberized materials,
replacement of the unitary surfacing, including the imaginative play elements of the frog and
lily pads, and any site restoration. Due to constrained space and the need to protect unique
cement aesthetic details, much of the work will be completed by hand.

Work is planned to begin the day after Labor Day. In order to confirm our placement in the
Sinclair Recreation’s construction schedule, the project must be awarded prior to June 1, 2015.



Sent: Thursday, April 02, 2015 3:51 PM
To: Anderson, Jeff
Subject: Surfacing timeline

Good afternoon Jeff! The September installation will work great for us as long as we can get you guys to approve it and sign a quote prior to June 1st. This will
allow me to save your block of time as we get busy installing playgrounds. Let me know what my next step is!

Regards,

Kendall Vander Kolk
Sinclair Recreation
616-886-1726

Sent from my iPhone

Budget Impact: This work was planned for in the 2015 budget at an amount of $60,000.
An Administrative budget amendment transferring funds from the Ferrand Park project in the
amount of $11,400 (allowing for 10% contingency) is being processed. Funds from the
dedicated Parks and Recreation Operational Millage are available in account number 208-752-
75600-975.182.



- QUOTE

u . #61729

01722/2015
u.s.

COMMUNITIES

(Gamichime,

Enriching Childhood Through Play.

City of Wyoming - Frog Hollow - PIP Replacement and Site Work - US Communities

City of Wyoming Project #: P52687
Attn: Accounts Payable Ship To Zip: 48509
Parks & Recreation

1155 - 28th St. SW

Wyoming, MI 49509

Phone: 616-530-7296

Quantity  Part # Description
1 Add Sinclair Recreation - Supply and Installation of $53,410.00 $53,410.00
3514 SF Poured in Place -Installed -
This is for 100% Color with Blue and Green
Lily Pad Graphics. Includes an aliphatic
binder

Thic in~rhidase Aanv ranair woe mas noeod tn maks
AP BHICTHWECY Wiy TCRUIT WE IRUY rieeud (U Midae
Jor subbase.

1 INSTALL Installation - Removal of Existing PIP $6,150.00 $6,150.00

1 INSTALL Installation - Provision of Roll Off Disposal $950.00 $950.00
Containers Per CDR Disposal and all costs
associated with disposal

1 INSTALL Installation - Site Protection and Site Security $1,420.00 $1,420.00
1 INSTALL Installation - Site Restoration - $2,750.00 $2,750.00
Price is for restoration of site afier work is
completed.
SubTotal: $64,680.00

Total Amount: $64,680.00

THIS QUOTATION IS SUBJECT TO POLICES IN THE CURRENT GAMETIME PARK AND PLAYGROUND CATALOG AND THE
FOLLOWING TERMS AND CONDITIONS. OUR QUOTATION IS BASED ON SHIPMENT OF ALL ITEMS AT ONE TIME TO A
SINGLE DESTINATION, UNLESS NOTED, AND CHANGES ARE SUBJECT TO PRICE ADJUSTMENT. PURCHASES IN EXCESS OF
$1,000.00 TO BE SUPPORTED BY YOUR WRITTEN PURCHASE ORDER MADE OUT TO GAMETIME, C/ SINCLAIR RECREATION.

Pricing: f.o.b. factory, firm for 30 days from date of quotation.
Sales Tax will be added at time of invoicing unless a tax exempt certificate is provided at the time of order entry.

Payment terms: Net 30 days for tax supported governmental agencies. A 1.5% per month finance charge will be imposed on all past due
accounts. Equipment shall be invoiced separately from other services and shall be payable in advance of those services and project completion.
Retainage not accepted.

Shipment: Order shg]l ship wilh_in _3{)-45 (_iays after GameTime's receipt and acceptance of your purchase order, color selections, approved
submittals, and receipt of deposit, if required.

(GaimeTins. .

Enriching Childhood Through Play.

Page 1 of 2



S QUOTE

A PLAYCOED ComraNY m “ . #61729
(Gamelime: .@ *

Enriching Childhood Through Play. %'«z-;-:ryv 01722/2015

City of Wyoming - Frog Hollow - PIP Replacement and Site Work - US Communities

Shipment: Order shall ship within 30-45 days after GameTime's reczipt and acceptance of your purchase order, color selections, approved
submittals, and receipt of deposit, if required.

Installation: Shall be by a Certified GameTime Installer. Customer shall be responsible for scheduling coordination and site preparation. Site
should be level and permit installation equipment access. Purchaser shall be responsible for unknown conditions such as buried utilities, tree
stumps, bedrock or any concealed materials or conditions that may result in additional labor or material costs. Payment terms for installation is

Net 10 Days.

Acceptance of quotation:

Proposed By Richard Sinclair:

Accepted By (printed): P.O. No:

Sig Date:

Titie: Phone:

Facsimilie: Purchase Amount: 564,680.00

Order Information:

Bill To: Ship To:

Contact: Contact:

Address: Address:

Address: Address:
City, State, Zip: City, State, Zip:

Tel: Tel:

SALES TAX EXEMPTION CERTIFICATE #:

(PLEASE PROVIDE A COPY OF CERTIFICATE)

(Gamictime)

Enriching Childhood Through Play.

X

e
X Tt TH

Page 2 of 2




05/04/15

Purchasing/KRO

RESOLUTION NO.

RESOLUTION TO ACCEPT A QUOTATION FROM RAPISCAN SYSTEMS

FOR THE PURCHASE AND INSTALLATION OF A SECURITY X-RAY SYSTEM

WHEREAS:

1.

w

As detailed in the attached Staff Report, the Court’s security x-ray machine is failing
and is need of replacement.

Quotations were received from Rapiscan Systems (an OSI Systems Company) in the
total amount of $18,100.00 and Event Metal Detectors, LLC in the total amount of
$25,000.00.

It is recommended the low gquotation from Rapiscan Systems be accepted.

Funds for the purchase and installation are available in the Capital Outlay Account
number 101-136-13600-984000.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED:

1.

2.

The Wyoming City Council does hereby accept a quotation from Rapiscan Systems
(an OSI Systems Company) for the purchase and installation of a security x-ray system
in the total amount of $18,100.00.

The Wyoming City Council does hereby waive the provisions of Sections 2-252,
2-253, 2-254 and 2-256 of the City Code regarding publication and posting of bid
notices, notification of bidders and the bid opening procedure.

Moved by Councilmember:
Seconded by Councilmember:
Motion Carried Yes

No

I hereby certify that the foregoing Resolution was adopted by the City Council for the City of
Wyoming, Michigan at a regular session held on May 4, 2015.

ATTACHMENTS: Kelli A. VandenBerg, Wyoming City Clerk
Staff Report

Quotation

Resolution No.
s:\purchasing\resolutions\fy 14-15 resolutions\x-ray system.docx




STATE OF MICHIGAN

Higeans

WYOMING DISTRICT COURT

PABLO CORTES CHRISTOPHER KITTMANN
CHIEF JUDGE 62-A JUDICIAL DISTRICT COURT ADMINISTRATOR
STEVEN M. TIMMERS 2650 DEHOOP S.W. JANE LIND
CHIEF JUDGE PRO TEMPORE WYOMING, MI 49509._1893 DEPUTY COURT ADMINISTRATOR
STAFF REPORT

Date: 4/27/15

Subject: Security X-ray System

From: Christopher Kittmann, Court Administrator

Meeting Date: May 4", 2015

Recommendation:

I recommend that the City Council approve the purchase of a new Security X-ray System for the 62-A
District Court. The cost of the system is $18,100.

Sustainability Criteria:

Environmental Quality — There is no impact on Environmental Quality with the purchase of this system.

Social Equity — There is no impact on Social Equity with the purchase of this system.

Economic Strength — There is no impact on Economic Strength with the purchase of this system.

Discussion:

After nearly 16 years, the court’s security x-ray machine is failing and has become unreliable. Any sort
of repair on the system is somewhat futile due to its age, as well as the overall cost to have it repaired
[approximately $2000-$4000). As a result, the court must quickly purchase a new system.

As you may or may not know the court has a security check point area as you enter the court house.
We screen every individual as well as their property [purses, bags, briefcases, etc.], that enters the
courthouse. We screen for guns, knives, pepper spray, or similar weapons. Utilizing the security x-ray
equipment allows for a safe, efficient and cost effective way to ensure overall courthouse security.
Therefore it is imperative that a new system be purchased immediately.

Attached to this memorandum is a quote from Rapiscan to replace, install and program a new security
x-ray system. [As a point of reference Rapiscan is who provided the court’s original security equipment.]

CIVIL DIVISION 616-530-7382 CRIMINAL / TRAFFIC DIVISION 616-530-7385 FAX 616-249-3419



Budget Impact:

The cost of the system as quoted directly from the manufacturer [Rapiscan] is $18,100. Funds are
available for this purchase through the court’s capital outlay account [#101.136.13600.984.000]. The
court is not asking the council for additional funds. Once the system is purchased the court will
immediately apply for a RAP [Risk Avoidance Program] Grant via MMRMA [Michigan Municipal Risk
Management Authority, in an attempt to re-coup 50% of the purchase.



R

systems

iscan

An OSI Systems Company

Corporate Headquarters

2805 Columbia Street

Torrance, California, 90503, USA
Telephone +1 310 978 1457
Facsimile +1 310 349 2491

www.rapiscansystems.com

QUOTATION
Contact: Chris Kitimann Quote Number: 2015-12013
Customer: City of Wyoming Submitted Date: April 16, 2015
Address: 1155 28th St SW,, Expiration Date: June 15, 2015
Wyoming, Michigan 49509 USA
Telephone:  (616) 530-7226
End User: City of Wyoming
BPI
item Qty Product - - Description = S - NetEach . Ext. Price
1 1 618XRW140 RAPISCAN 618XRW, WBS, DUAL VOLT, 140KV $16,500.00  $16,500.00
2 1 92102877 MANUAL, OPERATOR'S, 600 SERIES, SV & DV $0.00 $0.00
3 1 21101502 VOLTAGE KIT,SV,TYPE $0.00 $0.00
B,115V,N.AMERICA/JAPAN 3-PIN
4 1 13109789 MONITOR, WLCD 19" 1440 x 900, COMMERCIAL $0.00 $0.00
5 1 SW930193 SOFTWARE, FEATURE, AUTOMATIC TARGET, $0.00 $0.00
08600
6 1  SW930195 SOFTWARE, FEATURE, AUTO ARCHIVE OS600 $0.00 $0.00
7 1 SW930194 SOFTWARE, FEATURE, DTA, OS600 $0.00 $0.00
8 1 1310901 KEY, USB DONGLE, WINDOWS BASED $0.00 $0.00
SYSTEM
9 1 23101573 ROLLER BED, W/POP OUT & BACK STOP, GS, $0.00 $0.00
0.5M,618XRW
10 1 2313956 KIT, FOOTMAT, 6XX SYSTEMS $0.00 $0.00
11 1 Freight Freight Charges $0.00 $0.00
12 1 Installation Installation and Basic Operator instruction. $1,600.00 $1,600.00

Infrastructure must meet all technical and
environmental specifications in order for installation

Page 1 of 3
Proprietary and Confidential



Corporate Headquarters
2805 Columbia Street

Torrance, California, 90503, USA

a scan Telephone +1 310 978 1457
Facsimile +1 310 349 2491

systems www.rapiscansystems.com

An 0S| Systems Company

Item Qty Product - Description - e e et B “ NetEach  Ext. Price
to occur, If 1hesa requnrarnents are nol mel pre or
post installation, this may resull in additional
charges.

13 1 Warranty-AS Two (2) years parls and labor on entire system from $0.00 $0.00
date of shipment (25 months total). Does not cover
any damages from misuse, abuse, tampering or acts
of God.

14 1 21101456 CABLE, UMBILICAL, EXTERNAL 4M, 6XX $0.00 $0.00

Sub Total $18,100.00

PROPOSAL TOTAL $18,100.00

Terms of Delivery: FOB - Origin Prepared By: Sean Bullock

Terms of Payment:  NET30 Payment 30 days after Phone: 917 287-1680
invoice date

Shipping Date: Email: sbullock@rapiscansystems.com

Notes:

Import duties not Included for International shipments

This quotation and any sale of the equipment or provision of services described on this quotation is and shall be
subject fo the Sales Terms and Conditions G201 and Sofiware License Agreement G306, both of which are

available at hilp:/fwww.rapiscansystems.com/termsandconditions.

Page 2 of
Propnolary and Conﬂden!ra.‘



Corporate Headquarters
2805 Columbia Street

= ® Torrance, California, 90503, USA
a ,scan Telephone +1 310 978 1457
Facsimile +1 310 349 2491
systems www.rapiscansystems.com
An OSI Systems Company

The Sales Terms and Conditions G201 and Software License Agreement G306 are part of and included by
reference in every quotation and order acknowledgement. By accepting this quotation and/or performing hereunder,
the buyer agrees to be bound by and to comply with the Sales Terms and Conditions G201 and Software License
Agreement G306. Other Terms and conditions, including, without limitation, buyer's terms and condilions are nol
binding upon Rapiscan unless accepted in writing.

Freight rates are based on details provided at time of quotation. Any changes may result in revised charges.

Page 3 of 3 i
Proprietary and Confidential



05/04/15
Purchasing/KRO

RESOLUTION NO.

RESOLUTION TO AUTHORIZE
THE PURCHASE OF AMMUNITION

WHEREAS:

1. As detailed in the attached Staff Report, the Department of Public Safety purchases
ammunition for duty purposes and firearms training.

2. Itis recommended that the City Council authorize the purchase of the ammunition
using the State of Michigan (MiDEAL) extended purchasing program.

3. Funds for the purchase of the ammunition are available in account number 101-305-
31500-740000.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED:

1. The City Council does hereby authorize the purchase of ammunition through the State
of Michigan (MiDEAL) extended purchasing program.

2. The Wyoming City Council does hereby waive the provisions of Sections 2-252, 2-253,
2-254 and 2-256 of the City Code regarding publication and posting of bid notices,
notification of builders, and the bid opening procedures.

Moved by Councilmember:
Seconded by Councilmember:
Motion Carried Yes

No

I hereby certify that the foregoing Resolution was adopted by the City Council for the City of
Wyoming, Michigan at a regular session held on May 4, 2015.

ATTACHMENT: Kelli A. VandenBerg, Wyoming City Clerk
Staff Report

Resolution No.

s:\purchasing\resolutions\fy 14-15 resolutions\ammunition.docx




STAFF REPORT
DATE: April 27, 2015
SUBJECT: Ammunition Bid

FROM: Sgt. Brian Look

RECOMMENDATION:

It is recommended that the City Council use the State of Michigan bid that has been extended thru
2016 for the purchase price for ammunition. It is further recommended that it be approved that the
purchase of the ammunition be from the low bidders, Kiesler Police Supply Inc. and Vance
Outdoor Inc. The only exemption would be if a particular company cannot fulfill our ammunition
demands due to a shortage on ammunition. The ammunition will be used to equip officers for
duty purposes as well as being needed for firearms training.

SUSTAINABILITY CRITERIA:

Environmental Quality: Does not impact this criteria

Social Equity: Does not impact this area

Economic Strength: Recommend the use of the lowest bidder for financial reasons.
DISCUSSION:

There were three companies that submitted bids for ammunition; Kiesler Police Supply, Michigan
Police Equipment and Vance Outdoor Inc. Kiesler Police Supply is the only regional supplier for
Federal ammunition, which is the manufacturer of Speer and CCI ammunition. This was awarded
to them by ATK and thus no other company can distribute Speer ammunition for the State of
Michigan. The Wyoming Department of Public Safety-Police Division utilizes the Federal/Speer
brand ammunition as its duty ammunition.

Vance Outdoor Inc. was the lowest bid for both Hornady and Winchester brand for the requested
ammunition and can be used for practice ammunition due to the cost savings of going with the low
bid.

BUDGET IMPACT:

Funds for the purchase of ammunition are budgeted in account number: 101-305-31500-740000. It
is estimated that annual cost for the purchase of the ammunition will be approximately $15,000.00.



05/04/15
Purchasing/KRO

RESOLUTION NO.

RESOLUTION FOR AWARD OF BID
WHEREAS:

1. Formal bids have been obtained on the below listed item.
2. The bids received have been reviewed and evaluated as per the attached Staff Report.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED:

1. The City Council does hereby award the bid for the listed service as recommended in the
attached Staff Report and summarized below.

Item Recommended Bidders Cost
Work Uniforms & Carhartt | Cintas Location 301 Bid prices as shown on
Clothing Items the attached Staff
Report

Moved by Councilmember:
Seconded by Councilmember:
Motion Carried Yes

No

I hereby certify that the foregoing Resolution was adopted by the City Council for the City of Wyoming,
Michigan at a regular session held on May 4, 2015.

ATTACHMENT: Kelli A. VandenBerg, Wyoming City Clerk
Staff Report

Resolution No.
s:\purchasing\resolutions\fy 14-15 award resolutions\0504.15.docx




STAFF REPORT

Date: April 27, 2015
Subject: Work Uniforms & Carhartt Clothing Items
From: Laura Jackson, Purchasing Department

Meeting Date: May 4, 2015

RECOMMENDATION:

It is recommended the Wyoming City Council award the bid for work uniforms and Carhartt clothing
items to the low bidder Cintas Location 301.

SUSTAINABILITY CRITERIA:

Environmental Quality — Does not significantly impact this criterion.

Social Equity — Does not significantly impact this criterion.

Economic Strength — The bid specifications as written requested each bidder to submit a percentage
discount from current standard published price lists from the Red Kap current standard published catalog
and Carhartt Workwear catalog.

DISCUSSION:

On April 21, 2015, two bids were received in answer to our invitation to bid on work uniforms and
Carhartt clothing items. Fifty-one invitations to bid were sent to prospective bidders. The bid
specifications requested a percentage discount from Red Kap Industries (owned by VF Imagewear, Inc.)
and Carhartt Workwear standard published price lists. The bids received are as shown below.

Work Uniforms Carhartts
Embroidery Embroidery
% Set Up %
Company Name of Catalog Discount Cost Charges | Discount Cost
Cintas Location 301 Red Kap Industries 15% $5.95
Cintas Source Book 30% $5.95 15% $7.40
Cintas Apparel Bags & Caps 15% $5.95
Tele-Rad, Inc. 5.11 20% | $15.00 | $35.00 | NoBid No Bid

A minimum of four work uniforms are to be provided by the City to each General Union Employee
required to wear a work uniform, in accordance with employment contract between the Wyoming City
Employees and the City of Wyoming.

Carhartt clothing items are provided to City employees who are required to wear work uniforms and
work outside in the winter months of the year. The Carhartt clothing items are purchased on an as
needed basis for new employees and as replacements for existing worn out items.

Work uniforms & Carhartt clothing items are purchased as required throughout the year and funds are
budgeted in the various departmental accounts. The estimated expenditure for work uniforms and
Carhartt clothing items during the coming year is expected to total approximately $22,000.00.



JRS/sak
3/2/15

ORDINANCE NO. 5-15

AN ORDINANCE TO AMEND ARTICLE VII
OF CHAPTER 10 OF THE CODE
OF THE CITY OF WYOMING

THE CITY OF WYOMING ORDAINS:
Section 1. That Article VII of Chapter 10 of the Code of the City of Wyoming entitled “Property
Maintenance Code” is hereby amended to read as follows:

ARTICLE VII
PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE

Sec. 10-176. Adoption of Code.

The International Property Maintenance Code/2012 as published by the International Code
Council, Inc. is adopted by reference as herein modified for the purposes of protecting the public health,
safety and welfare in all existing structures, residential and nonresidential, and on all existing premises by
establishing minimum maintenance standards for all structures and occupants of all structures; and
providing for administration, enforcement and penalties. The International Property Maintenance Code
2012 together with the provisions of this ordinance shall be known and may be cited as the Property
Maintenance Code of the City of Wyoming.

Sec. 10-177. References in Code.

References in the International Property Maintenance Code/2012 to “name of jurisdiction” shall
mean the City of Wyoming:

Sec. 10-178. Availability of code.

Complete copies of the code are available at the office of the city clerk for inspection and
distribution to the public.

Sec. 10-179. Changes in code.

The following sections and subsections of the International Property Maintenance Code 2012 are
hereby amended as provided herein and additional sections and subsections are added as indicated.
Section numbers used in this ordinance shall refer to the like numbered sections in International Property
Maintenance Code/2012.

1) Section 101.1 is hereby amended to read as follows:

Sec. 101.1 TITLE



These regulations shall be known as the Property Maintenance Code of Wyoming,
hereinafter referred to as “this code”.

2 Section PM-102.3 is hereby amended to read as follows:
Sec.102.3  APPLICATION OF OTHER CODES.

Repairs, additions or alterations to a structure, or changes of occupancy, shall be done in
accordance with the procedures and provisions of the Michigan Building Code, Michigan Residential
Code, Michigan Rehabilitation Code for Existing Buildings, Michigan Electrical Code, Michigan
Mechanical Code, Michigan Plumbing Code and International Fire Code. Nothing in this code shall be
construed to cancel, modify or set aside any provision of the Wyoming Zoning Code.

(3)  Section PM 102.6 is hereby deleted.
(4)  Section PM 103.1 is hereby amended to read as follows:
Sec. 103.1 RENTAL REGISTRATION AND INSPECTION.

@ No person shall rent, lease or offer for rent or lease any residential unit or
residential property without first registering said unit or property with the City.

(b) A residential unit or property may be rented, leased or offered for rent or lease if:

1. An application is submitted indicating the owner and manager, the number of units
and buildings for which application is sought, the type of units intended, any other pertinent data
sought by the Code Official.

2. All related program fees are paid based on a fee schedule as adopted by the City.
The fees shall be a debt to the City, which may be assessed as a lien against the property until
paid.

3. If an inspection is performed on the property based on any rental inspection
schedule as adopted by the City all violations disclosed thereby are either corrected or waived by
the Housing Board of Appeals.

(©) A registration for properties with four (4) or more units shall be in effect for two (2)
years from the date of issue unless revoked for cause by the City.

A certificate for properties with less than four (4) units shall be in effect for four (4) years
from the date of issue unless revoked for cause by the city.

Exceptions:

If a property with less than four (4) units is in violation of one or more of the following, the
property shall be issued a two (2) year certification.

Safety:

1) Smoke detector violations

(2 Work completed without a permit
3) Eminent electrical hazards

4) Eminent mechanical hazards

(5) Eminent building hazards



Cosmetic:
1) More than one window with broken or missing glazing
(2) Peeling paint on more than 25% of the building

3) Loose or damaged siding, facia or soffit materials on the house or garage.
Reasonable wear and minor maintenance concerns related to these items shall not
disqualify property owners from a four year certification.

4) Damaged exterior doors on the house or garage that prevents the door from opening
and/or closing, locking, or operating as designed or where more than 25% of the exterior
surface area is dented, peeling or otherwise in disrepair.

(5) Damaged or excessively worn roof/shingles
Other:

In addition to any one (1) of the above, if a property has more than four maintenance code
violations the property shall receive a two (2) year certification.

Failure to register and certify a rental unit in accordance with the provisions of this ordinance or
failure to pay the program fees is a violation of this code.

d. Suspension or Revocation of registration. Any registration issued by the City under this
ordinance may be suspended by the Code Official for cause, and any permit issued by the City
may be suspended or revoked by the Housing Board of Appeals for cause. The owner shall have
the right to a hearing before the Housing Board of Appeals on any such action of the Code
Official, provided a written request therefore is filed with the City Clerk within five (5) days after
receipt of notice of suspension. The Housing Board of Appeals may confirm the suspension or
revoke or reinstate the license. The action taken by the Housing Board of Appeals shall be final.

e. Cause defined. The term “cause”, as used in this article, shall include the doing or
omitting of any act, or permitting any condition to exist in connection with any registration
granted under the provisions of this ordinance, or upon any premises or facilities used in
connection therewith, which act, omission on condition is:

1) Contrary to the health, safety or welfare of the public.

2 Unlawful or fraudulent in nature.

3) Unauthorized or beyond the scope of the registration.

4) Forbidden by the provisions of this ordinance, or any duly established rule or
regulation of the City applicable to housing.

(5) A nuisance on the registered property.

f. Inspections. In order to safeguard the health and welfare and safety of the public, the Code
Official or his representative is authorized to enter any structure or premises at any reasonable
time for the purpose of making inspections and performing his duties under this Code. Inspections
may be made at any time on individual or multiple units as a result of a complaint or if a serious
health/safety problem is suspected. Scheduled Inspections will be based on any Rental Inspection
Schedule as adopted by the City.

g. Fees. Fees for such licenses and registration shall be set by resolution of the City Council.



Such fees may reflect the cost of processing, inspection, supervision and other related costs of
regulations. Fees for not complying with the rental program shall be established by resolution of
the City Council.

(5) Section 103.2 is hereby amended to read as follows:
Sec. 103.2 VACANT STRUCTURE AND ABANDONED STRUCTURE.

(a) No person shall occupy or allow to be occupied, any building that is posted as an Abandoned
Structure without first obtaining approval for occupancy of said building.

(b) An Abandoned Structure may be occupied if:

(1) An application is submitted indicating the owner of the property, if the property is to be owner
occupied or a rental property, and any other pertinent data sought by the code official.

(2) All related inspection service fees are paid based on a fee schedule as adopted by the City Council.
The fees shall be a debt to the city, which may be enforced by the City against the property owner.
The City may place such charges on the tax roll to be added to the taxes for the property for the
next year.

(3) If an inspection is performed on the property based on a fee schedule as adopted by the City, and
all violations disclosed thereby are either corrected or waived by the Housing Board of Appeals.

(6) Section 104.7 is hereby added to read as follows:
Sec. 104.7 LIABILITY.

The code official, member of the board of appeals or employee charged with the enforcement of
this code, while acting for the jurisdiction, in good faith and without malice in the discharge of the duties
required by this code or other pertinent law or ordinance, shall not thereby be rendered liable personally,
and is hereby relieved from all personal liability for any damage accruing to persons or property as a
result of an act or by reason of an act or omission in the discharge of official duties. Any suit instituted
against any officer or employee because of an act performed by that officer or employee in the lawful
discharge of duties and under the provisions of this code shall be defended by the legal representative of
the jurisdiction until the final termination of the proceedings. The code official or any subordinate shall
not be liable for costs in an action, suit or proceeding that is instituted in pursuance of the provisions of
this code.

(7 Section 104.8 is hereby added to read as follows:
Sec.104.8  FEES.

The fees for activities and services performed by the department carrying out its responsibilities
under this code shall be as established by resolution of the City Council.



(8) Section 106.2 is hereby amended to read as follows:
Sec. 106.2 PENALTY.

Violation of any provision of this Article shall be a “municipal civil infraction” with civil fines as
provided in Sec. 1-27 of the City Code.

9) Section 106.4.1 is hereby added to read as follows:
Sec. 106.4.1 CLEAN UP/DEMOLITION COSTS.

Should it become necessary for the City to either perform or hire, weed cutting, clean up or
demolition on any property, all costs shall be assessed against said property as follows:

1. Clean up/Weed Abatement: cost plus 100%
2. Demolition: cost plus 50%

(10)  Section 106.5 is hereby amended to read as follows:

Sec. 106.5 RIGHT OF ENTRY.

At any time after written notice of violation is provided to a property owner and/or properly posted
on the property, an employee of the City or any contractor employed by the City shall have the right to
enter onto private property to perform any clean up, removal, demolition or any other action reasonably
necessary to bring the property into compliance with the provisions of this code.

(11)  Section 107.1 is hereby amended to read as follows.

Sec. 107.1 NOTICE.

(a) General. Unless specifically provided herein, notice shall be given in accordance with Section
1-25 of the City Code.

(b) Dangerous Buildings. Notice of dangerous buildings and/or structure unfit for human
occupancy shall be as follows:

1. Delivery in accordance with provisions of City Code Section 1-25.

2. If reasonable efforts under subsection (1) of this section have not been successful, then by
posting a copy of the notice, for 24 hours in poster or letter form in a conspicuous place on the premises to
be repaired or demolished.

(12)  Section 107.2 is hereby amended to read as follows:

Sec. 107.2 UNAUTHORIZED TAMPERING.

Signs, tags or seals posted or affixed by the code official shall not be mutilated, destroyed or



tampered with, or removed without authorization from the code official.
(13) Section 107.3 is hereby amended to read as follows:
Sec. 107.3 PENALTIES.
Penalties for noncompliance with orders and notices shall be as set forth in Section 106.2.
(14)  Section 107.4 is hereby amended to read as follows:
Sec. 107.4 TRANSFER OF OWNERSHIP.

It shall be unlawful for the owner of any dwelling unit or structure who has received a compliance
order or upon whom a notice of violation has been served to sell, transfer, mortgage, lease or otherwise dis-
pose of such dwelling unit or structure to another until the provisions of the compliance order or notice of
violation have been complied with, or until such owner shall first furnish the grantee, transferee, mortgagee
or lessee a true copy of any compliance order or notice of violation issued by the code official and shall
furnish to the code official a signed and notarized statement from the grantee, transferee, mortgagee or
lessee, acknowledging the receipt of such compliance order or notice of violation and fully accepting the
responsibility without condition for making the corrections or repairs required by such compliance order or
notice of violation.

(15) Section 108.1.5 is hereby amended to read as follows:
Sec. 108.1.5 DANGEROUS STRUCTURE OR PREMISES.

For the purpose of this code, any structure or a premise that has any or all of the conditions or
defects described below shall be considered dangerous:

1. Any door, aisle, passageway, stairway, exit or other means of egress that does not conform
to the approved building or fire code of the jurisdiction related to the requirements for existing buildings.

2. The walking surface of any aisle, passageway, stairway, exit or other means of egress is so
warped, worn loose, torn or otherwise unsafe as to not provide safe and adequate means of egress.

3. Any portion of a building, structure or appurtenance that has been damaged by fire,
earthquake, wind, flood, deterioration, neglect, abandonment, vandalism or by any other cause to such an
extent that it is likely to partially or completely collapse, or to become detached or dislodged.

4. Any portion of a building, or any member, appurtenance or ornamentation on the exterior
thereof that is not of sufficient strength or stability, or is not so anchored, attached or fastened in place so
as to be capable of resisting natural or artificial loads of one and one-half the original designed value.

5. The building or structure, or part of the building or structure, because of dilapidation,
deterioration, decay, faulty construction, the removal or movement of some portion of the ground necessary
for the support, or for any other reason, is likely to partially or completely collapse, or some portion of the
foundation or underpinning of the building or structure is likely to fail or give way.



6. The building or structure, or any portion thereof, is clearly unsafe for its use and
occupancy.

7. The building or structure is neglected, damaged, dilapidated, unsecured or abandoned so as
to become an attractive nuisance to children who might play in the building or structure to their danger,
becomes a harbor for vagrants, criminals or immoral persons, or enables persons to resort to the building
or structure for committing a nuisance or an unlawful act.

8. Any building or structure has been constructed, exists or is maintained in violation of any
specific requirement or prohibition applicable to such building or structure provided by the approved
building or fire code of the jurisdiction, or of any law or ordinance to such an extent as to present either a
substantial risk of fire, building collapse or any other threat to life and safety.

9. A building or structure, used or intended to be used for dwelling purposes, because of
inadequate maintenance, dilapidation, decay, damage, faulty construction or arrangement, inadequate
light, ventilation, mechanical or plumbing system, or otherwise, is determined by the code official to be
unsanitary, unfit for human habitation or in such a condition that is likely to cause sickness or disease.

10.  Any building or structure, because of a lack of sufficient or proper fire-resistance-rated
construction, fire protection systems, electrical system, fuel construction, mechanical system, plumbing
system or other cause, is determined by the code official to be a threat to life or health.

11.  Any portion of a building remains on a site after the demolition or destruction of the
building or structure or whenever any building or structure is abandoned so as to constitute such building
or portion thereof as an attractive nuisance, hazard or blighting influence to the public, as determined by
the Planning Department, Building Inspections Department and Housing Board of Appeals.

12, Whenever the Code Official estimates the cost of placing the building in safe and sanitary
condition exceeds 50% of real value as determined by the City Assessor.

13. Any natural structure, because of dilapidation, deterioration, decay or removal of some
portion of the structure or ground necessary for the support is likely to collapse, fail or give way.

(16)  Section 108.1.6 is hereby added to read as follows:

Sec. 108.1.6 NOTICE OF DANGEROUS AND UNSAFE CONDITION.

Whenever the Code Official has declared a building as dangerous, he shall give a written notice of
such declaration and the required repairs or demolition of the building to the owner of the building. Such
notice shall include the following:

1. A description or address for the real estate.

2. A statement of the violations, referring to the sections of this article or any other section of the
City Code.



3. A statement obligating the owner to bring the building into complete compliance with this code
and all other applicable sections of the City Code, or to demolish and remove the building.

4. A reasonable time limit for the completion of the repair or demolition, not to exceed 90 days.

5. A statement requiring the owner to state his intentions as to the repair or demolition order within
ten days. The owner shall so state his intentions in writing to the City within such ten-day period.
Failure to respond shall be considered a negative response which may result in the City
implementing accelerated compliance measures.
(17)  Section 108.3 is hereby amended to read as follows:

Sec. 108.3 NOTICE.

Whenever the code official has condemned a structure or equipment under the provisions of this
section, notice shall be posted in a conspicuous place in or about the structure affected by such notice and
served on the owner or the person or persons responsible for the structure or equipment in accordance with
Section 107.1. The notice shall be in the form prescribed in Section 108.1.6

(18)  Section 110.2 is hereby deleted.

(19)  Section 111.1 is hereby amended to read as follows:

Sec. 111.1 HOUSING BOARD OF APPEALS CREATION.

The Housing Board of Appeals is hereby created and is referred to in this article as the Housing
Board.

(20)  Section 111.2 is hereby amended to read as follows:

Sec. 111.2 MEMBERSHIP.

The housing board shall consist of five persons appointed by the city council who shall be
experienced in the building and housing field by having a background as a professional engineer,
architect, member of a building construction trade, industry, banking and finances, with experience in
home mortgages, real estate sales or such other persons as the city council may deem able to serve the
best interests of the city.

(21)  Section 111.3 is hereby amended to read as follows:

Sec.111.3  APPOINTMENT; TERMS, VACANCIES.

Each member of the housing board shall be appointed for a term of five years, except that for the
first appointments members shall be appointed for one, two, three, four and five years, respectively. All

vacancies shall be filled for the unexpired term.

(22)  Section 111.4 is hereby amended to read as follows:



Sec. 111.4 PROCEDURAL RULES; OFFICERS; MINUTES.

The housing board shall adopt its own procedural rules. There shall be a chairman, vice-chairman
and secretary. The secretary shall keep minutes of each meeting, and a copy shall be given to the city
clerk.

(23)  Section 111.4.1 is hereby deleted.
(24)  Section 111.5 is hereby amended to read as follows:
Sec. 111.5 APPEALS PROCEDURE.

Any person who is aggrieved with the ruling or decision of any city official which relates to the
interpretation or enforcement of any of the provisions of this code may appeal such ruling or decision to
the housing board. Such appeal shall be in writing on the form supplied by the city and shall be filed
within ten days of such ruling or decision.

(25) Section 111.6 is hereby amended to read as follows:
Sec.111.6  POWERS AND DUTIES.

The housing board shall hear, review and decide appeals from any order, requirement, decision or
determination made by any city official charged with the enforcement of this code. The housing board
may grant variances from the terms of the housing code as will not be contrary to the public interest,
where owing to special conditions, as demonstrated by facts presented to or obtained by the housing
board, a literal enforcement of the provisions of this code would result in unnecessary hardship. In
exercising its powers, the housing board may reverse, modify or affirm, wholly or in part, the order
requirement, decision or determination appealed from, and to that extent shall have all the powers of the
city official from whom the appeal was taken.

(26)  Section 111.7 is hereby amended to read as follows:

Sec. 111.7 CONDITIONS TO BE MET FOR VARIATIONS, REVERSALS OR
MODIFICATIONS.

No variation, reversal or modification of provisions of this code shall be made by the housing
board unless all of the following conditions are met:

1. There are exceptional or extraordinary circumstances or conditions related to the property or to the
intended use which would cause unreasonable hardship by the strict enforcement of the terms of the
housing code, or that the appellant would be deprived of a substantial property right.

2. Property values in the near vicinity will not be adversely affected.

3. The public health, safety or welfare of any person or any property will not be jeopardized.



(27)  Section 111.8 is hereby amended to read as follows:

Sec.111.8  FINDING OF FACTS.

The housing board in granting or denying an appeal shall make findings of facts to each part of
section 111.7 of this code and such findings shall be recorded in the minutes. Any appeal granted without
such finding shall be void. If there is doubt as to whether an appeal should be granted, then such doubt
shall be resolved in denying of the appeal.

(28)  Section 111.9 is hereby added to read as follows:

Sec. 111.9 BINDING CLAUSE.

Where an appeal has been granted by the housing board, the variations or modifications allowed
shall apply to any similar requirements in other sections of this Code.

(29)  Section 111.10 is hereby added to read as follows.
Sec. 111.10 COURT REVIEW.

Any person, whether or not a previous party to the appeal, shall have the right to apply to the
appropriate court for a review to correct errors of law. Application for review shall be made in the manner
and time required by law following the filing of the decision of office of the Code Official.

(30)  Section 112.4 is hereby amended to read as follows:
Sec.112.4 FAILURE TO COMPLY.

Any person who shall continue any work after having been served with a stop work order, except
such work as that person is directed to perform to remove a violation or unsafe condition, shall be subject
to a civil infraction citation and the penalties prescribed by this code.

(31) Section 201.3 is hereby amended to read as follows:

Sec.201.3 TERMS DEFINED IN OTHER CODES.

Where terms are not defined in this code and are defined in the Michigan Building Code,
Michigan Residential Code, Michigan Rehabilitation Code for Existing Buildings, Michigan Electrical
Code, Michigan Mechanical Code, Michigan Plumbing Code or International Fire Code, such terms
shall have the meanings ascribed to them as stated in those codes.

(32) The following definitions are hereby added to Section 202:

ABANDONED STRUCTURE. A structure that has been vacant for 30 or more days and meets any of
the following criteria:

1. Provides a location for loitering, vagrancy, unauthorized entry or other criminal activity.



2. Has been boarded for at least 60 days.

3. Has taxes in arrears for a period of time exceeding 365 days.

4. Has a utility or utilities disconnected.

5. Is not maintained in compliance with the Property Maintenance Code.

BLIGHT Any deteriorated condition of land or structure that contributes to a decrease in the aesthetics or
overall desirability of the property.

BOARDING HOUSE, LODGING HOUSE, TOURIST HOUSE. A building having one kitchen and
used for the purpose of providing meals or lodging, or both meals and lodging, to persons other than
members of the family occupying such dwelling. In the case of single-family and two-family dwellings,
the number of roomers or boarders shall not exceed one per dwelling unit.

CODE ENFORCEMENT ACTIVITY. — All activities performed by city staff or designee to locate,
identify and abate violations of city code.

NATURAL STRUCTURE. Any structure that is created or grown from natural sources.

NOXIOUS WEEDS. Means an annual, biennial or perennial plant designated by the Michigan
Commissioner of Agriculture as injurious to public health, the environment, public roads or other

property.

ONE-FAMILY DWELLING. A building containing one (1) dwelling unit with not more than one
lodger or boarder.

PUBLIC NUISANCE. Includes any of the following:

1. The physical condition or occupancy of any premises regarded as a public nuisance at common
law;

2. Any physical condition or occupancy of a premises or its appurtenances considered an attractive
nuisance to children, including, but not limited to, abandoned wells, shafts, basements,
excavations and unsafe fences or structures;

3. Any premises that has unsanitary sewerage or plumbing facilities;

4. Any premises designated as unsafe for human habitation;

5. Any premises that is manifestly capable of being a fire hazard, or is manifestly unsafe or
unsecured so as to endanger life, limb or property;

6. Any premises from which the plumbing, heating or facilities required by this code have been
removed, or from which utilities have been disconnected, destroyed, removed or rendered
ineffective, or the required precautions against trespassers have not been provided;



7. Any premises that is unsanitary, or that is littered with rubbish or garbage, or that has uncontrolled
growth of weeds; or

8. Any natural or man-made structure that is in a state of dilapidation, deterioration or decay; faulty
construction; overcrowded; open, vacant or abandoned; damaged by fire to the extent so as not
provide shelter; in danger of collapse or failure; and dangerous to anyone on or near the premises.

RANK VEGETATION. Means uncultivated plants growing at a rapid rate due to unplanned,
unintentional, or accidental circumstances.

VACANT STRUCTURE. A structure that is vacant and does not meet the definition of the Abandoned
Structure or Dangerous Building.

(33) Section 301.4 is hereby added to read as follows:
Sec. 3014 ANIMALS AND BEES.

No horse, cow, calf, swine, sheep, goat, chickens, bees, pigeons, geese, ducks, rabbits, or any
protected wild animal shall be kept in any dwelling, nor shall any such animals or bees be kept on the
same lot or premises with a dwelling, except under conditions prescribed by the code official so as not to
constitute a nuisance to any neighbors or property and so as not to constitute any nuisance, health or
safety hazard.

(34) Section 302.4 is hereby amended to read as follows:
Sec. 302.4 WEEDS.

All premises and exterior property shall be maintained free from weeds in excess of twelve (12)
inches in height. All noxious weeds and rank vegetation shall be prohibited.
Upon failure of the owner or agent having charge of a property to cut and destroy weeds after service of a
notice of violation, they shall be subject to prosecution in accordance with Section 106.2 and as
prescribed by the City. Upon failure to comply with the notice of violation, any duly authorized employee
of the City or contractor hired by the City shall be authorized to enter upon the property in violation and
cut and destroy the weeds growing thereon, and the costs of such removal shall be paid by the owner or
agent responsible for the property. Fees for such action shall be charged in accordance with section
106.4.1

(35) Section 302.8 is hereby amended to read as follows:
Sec. 3028 MOTOR VEHICLES.

Except as provided for in other regulations, no inoperative or unlicensed motor vehicle shall be
parked, kept or stored outdoors on any premises, and no vehicle shall at any time be in a state of major
disassembly, disrepair, or in the process of being stripped or dismantled. Painting of vehicles is
prohibited unless conducted inside an approved spray booth.

Exception: A vehicle of any type is permitted to undergo major overhaul, including body work,



provided that such work is performed inside a structure or similarly enclosed area designed and
approved for such purposes.

(36)  Section 304.1.1 is hereby amended to read as follows:
Sec. 304.1.1 UNSAFE CONDITIONS.

The following conditions shall be determined as unsafe and shall be repaired or replaced to

comply with the Michigan Building Code or the Michigan Existing Building Code as required for
existing buildings:

1.

10.

11.

The nominal strength of any structural member is exceeded by nominal loads, the load effects or
the required strength;

The anchorage of the floor or roof to walls or columns, and of walls and columns to foundations is
not capable of resisting all nominal loads or load effects;

Structures or components thereof that have reached their limit state;

Siding and masonry joints including joints between the building envelope and the perimeter of
windows, doors and skylights are not maintained, weather resistant or water tight;

Structural members that have evidence of deterioration or that are not capable of safely supporting
all nominal loads and load effects;

Foundation systems that are not firmly supported by footings, are not plumb and free from open
cracks and breaks, are not properly anchored or are not capable of supporting all nominal loads
and resisting all load effects;

Exterior walls that are not anchored to supporting and supported elements or are not plumb and
free of holes, cracks or breaks and loose or rotting materials, are not properly anchored or are not
capable of supporting all nominal loads and resisting all load effects;

Roofing or roofing components that have defects that admit rain, roof surfaces with inadequate
drainage, or any portion of the roof framing that is not in good repair with signs of deterioration,
fatigue or without proper anchorage and incapable of supporting all nominal loads and resisting all
load effects;

Flooring and flooring components with defects that affect serviceability or flooring components
that show signs of deterioration or fatigue, are not properly anchored or are incapable of
supporting all nominal loads and resisting all load effects;

Veneer, cornices, belt courses, corbels, trim, wall facings and similar decorative features not
properly anchored or that are anchored with connections not capable of supporting all nominal
loads and resisting all load effects;

Overhang extensions or projections including, but not limited to, trash chutes, canopies, marquees,
signs, awnings, fire escapes, standpipes and exhaust ducts not properly anchored or that are



anchored with connections not capable of supporting all nominal loads and resisting all load
effects;

12. Exterior stairs, decks, porches, balconies and all similar appurtenances attached thereto,
including guards and handrails, are not structurally sound, not properly anchored or that are
anchored with connections not capable of supporting all nominal loads and resisting all load
effects; or

13. Chimneys, cooling towers, smokestacks and similar appurtenances not structurally sound or not
properly anchored, or that are anchored with connections not capable of supporting all nominal
loads and resisting all load effects.

Exceptions:
1. When substantiated otherwise by an approved method.
2. Demolition of unsafe conditions shall be permitted when approved by the code official.

(37) Section 304.13.1 is hereby amended to read as follows:
Sec. 304.13.1 GLAZING.

Every window sash shall be fully supplied with approved glazing.
(38) Section 304.14 is hereby amended to read as follows:

Sec. 304.14  INSECT SCREENS.

During the period from April 1% to October 31% every door, window and other outside opening
required for ventilation of habitable rooms, food preparation areas, food service areas or any areas where
products to be included or utilized in food for human consumption are processed, manufactured,
packaged or stored shall be supplied with approved tightly fitting screens of minimum 16 mesh per inch
(16 mesh per 25 mm), and every screen door used for insect control shall have a self-closing device in
good working condition.

Exception: Screens shall not be required where other approved means, such as air curtains or insect
repellent fans, are employed.

(39)  Section 305.1.1 is hereby amended to read as follows:

Sec 305.1.1 UNSAFE CONDITIONS.

The following conditions shall be determined as unsafe and shall be repaired or replaced to
comply with the Michigan Building Code, the Michigan Residential Code or the Michigan

Rehabilitation Code as required for existing buildings:

1. The nominal strength of any structural member is exceeded by nominal loads, the load effects or
the required strength;

2. The anchorage of the floor or roof to walls or columns, and of walls and columns to foundations
is not capable of resisting all nominal loads or load effects;



3. Structures or components thereof that have reached their limit state;
4. Structural members are incapable of supporting nominal loads and load effects;

5. Stairs, landings, balconies and all similar walking surfaces, including guards and handrails, are
not structurally sound, not properly anchored or are anchored with connections not capable of
supporting all nominal loads and resisting all load effects;

6. Foundation systems that are not firmly supported by footings are not plumb and free from open
cracks and breaks, are not properly anchored or are not capable of supporting all nominal loads
and resisting all load effects.

Exceptions:
1. When substantiated otherwise by an approved method.
2. Demolition of unsafe conditions shall be permitted when approved by the code official.

(40)  Section 305.7 is hereby added to read as follows:
Sec. 305.7  FLOORS.

Every toilet, bathroom and kitchen floor surface shall be constructed and maintained so as to be
substantially impervious to water and so as to permit such floor to be easily kept in a clean and sanitary
condition. All floor surfaces throughout a dwelling unit shall be maintained in a sound condition,
securely fastened, free of holes, tears or open areas, and kept in such a manner so as not to contribute to
unsafe or unsanitary conditions.

(41)  Section 305.8 is hereby added to read as follows:
Sec. 305.8 FREE FROM DAMPNESS.

Every building, basement and crawl space shall be maintained to prevent conditions conducive to
decay or deterioration of the structure.

(42) Section 306.1.1 is hereby amended as follows:
Sec. 306.1.1 UNSAFE CONDITIONS.

Where any of the following conditions cause the component or system to be beyond its limit
state, the component or system shall be determined as unsafe and shall be repaired or replaced to comply
with the Michigan Building Code, Michigan Residential Code, Michigan Rehabilitation Code as
required for existing buildings:

1. Soils that have been subjected to any of the following conditions:
1.1  Collapse of footing or foundation system;
1.2 Damage to footing, foundation, concrete or other structural element due to soil
expansion;
1.3 Adverse effects to the design strength of footing, foundation, concrete or other structural



element due to a chemical reaction from the soil;
1.4 Inadequate soil as determined by a geotechnical investigation;
1.5  Where the allowable bearing capacity of the soil is in doubt; or
1.6 Adverse effects to the footing, foundation, concrete or other structural element due to the
ground water table.
2. Concrete that has been subjected to any of the following conditions:
2.1  Deterioration;
2.2 Ultimate deformation;
2.3 Fractures;
2.4  Fissures;
2.5  Spalling;
2.6 Exposed reinforcement; or
2.7 Detached, dislodged or failing connections.
3. Aluminum that has been subjected to any of the following conditions:
3.1  Deterioration;
3.2  Corrosion;
3.3  Elastic deformation;
3.4 Ultimate deformation;
3.5  Stress or strain cracks;
3.6 Joint fatigue; or
3.7  Detached, dislodged or failing connections.
4. Masonry that has been subjected to any of the following conditions:
4.1  Deterioration;
4.2 Ultimate deformation;
4.3 Fractures in masonry or mortar joints;
4.4 Fissures in masonry or mortar joints;
45  Spalling;
4.6  Exposed reinforcement; or
4.7 Detached, dislodged or failing connections.
5. Steel that has been subjected to any of the following conditions:
5.1  Deterioration;
5.2  Elastic deformation;
5.3 Ultimate deformation;
54  Metal fatigue; or
5.5  Detached, dislodged or failing connections.
6. Wood that has been subjected to any of the following conditions:
6.1 Ultimate deformation;
6.2 Deterioration;
6.3  Damage from insects, rodents and other vermin;
6.4  Fire damage beyond charring;
6.5  Significant splits and checks;
6.6  Horizontal shear cracks;
6.7  Vertical shear cracks;
6.8 Inadequate support;
6.9  Detached, dislodged or failing connections; or
6.10  Excessive cutting and notching.
Exceptions:
1. When substantiated otherwise by an approved method.



2. Demolition of unsafe conditions shall be permitted when approved by the code official.
(43)  Section 308.3.1 is hereby deleted

(44)  Section 308.3.2 is hereby deleted



(45)  Section 401.3 is hereby amended to read as follows:
Sec.401.3  ALTERNATIVE DEVICES.

In lieu of the means for natural light and ventilation herein prescribed, artificial light or
mechanical ventilation complying with the Michigan Building Code, and Michigan Residential
Code, shall be permitted.

(46)  Section 502.5 is hereby amended to read as follows:
Sec. 502.5 PUBLIC TOILET FACILITIES.

Public toilet facilities shall be maintained in a safe, sanitary and working condition in
accordance with the Michigan Plumbing Code. Except for periodic maintenance or cleaning, public
access and use shall be provided to the toilet facilities at all times during occupancy of the premises.

(47) Section 505.1 is hereby amended to read as follows:
Sec. 505.1 GENERAL

Every sink, lavatory, bathtub or shower, drinking fountain, water closet or
other plumbing fixture shall be properly connected to either a public water system or
to an approved private water system. All kitchen sinks, lavatories, laundry facilities,
bathtubs and showers shall be supplied with hot or tempered and cold running water
in accordance with the Michigan Plumbing Code.

(48)  Section 602.2 is hereby amended to read as follows:
Sec. 602.2 RESIDENTIAL OCCUPANCIES.

Dwellings shall be provided with heating facilities capable of maintaining a room
temperature of 68°F (20°C) in all habitable rooms, bathrooms and toilet rooms based on the
winter outdoor design temperature for the locality indicated in Appendix D of the Michigan
Building Code or the Michigan Residential Code or the Michigan Plumbing Code. Cooking
appliances shall not be used, nor shall portable unvented fuel-burning space heaters be used, as a
means to provide required heating.

(49)  Section 602.3 is hereby amended to read as follows:

Sec. 602.3  HEAT SUPPLY.

Every owner and operator of any building who rents, leases or lets one or more
dwelling units or sleeping units on terms, either expressed or implied, to furnish heat to the

occupants thereof shall supply heat to maintain the room temperatures specified in Section
602.2 in this code.



Exceptions:

1. When the outdoor temperature is below the winter outdoor design temperature for
the locality, maintenance of the minimum room temperature shall not be required
provided that the heating system is operating at its full design capacity. The
winter outdoor design temperature for the locality shall be as indicated in
Appendix D of the Michigan Plumbing Code.

2. In areas where the average monthly temperature is above 30°F (-1°C) a minimum
temperature of 65°F (18°C) shall be maintained.

(50)  Section 602.3.1 is hereby added to read as follows:
Sec. 602.3.1 NONRESIDENTIAL STRUCTURES.

Every enclosed occupied work space shall be supplied with sufficient heat to maintain a
temperature of not less than 65 degrees F. (18 degrees C.) during all working hours.

(51) Section 602.4 is hereby amended to read as follows:
Sec. 602.4 ROOM TEMPERATURE MEASUREMENT.

The required room temperatures shall be measured 3 feet (914 mm) above the floor near
the center of the room and 2 feet (610 mm) inward from the center of each exterior wall.

(52) Section 602.5 is hereby deleted.
(53) Section 604.2 is hereby amended to read as follows:
Sec. 604.2  SERVICE.

The size and usage of appliances and equipment shall serve as a basis for determining the
need for additional facilities in accordance with Michigan Building Code, the Michigan
Residential Code and/or Michigan Electrical Code. Dwelling units shall be served by a three-
wire, 120/240 volt, single-phase electrical service having a minimum rating of 60 amperes.

(54)  Section 604.3.1.1 is hereby amended to read as follows:
Sec. 604.3.1.1 ELECTRICAL EQUIPMENT.

Electrical distribution equipment, motor circuits, power equipment, transformers, wire,
cable, flexible cords, wiring devices, ground fault circuit interrupters, surge protectors, molded
case circuit breakers, low-voltage fuses, luminaires, ballasts, motors and electronic control,
signaling and communication equipment that have been exposed to water shall be replaced in
accordance with the provisions of the Michigan Building Code and/or the Michigan Residential
Code or the Michigan Electrical Code.

Exception: The following equipment shall be allowed to be repaired where an inspection report



from the equipment manufacturer or approved manufacturer's representative indicates that the
equipment has not sustained damage that requires replacement:

Enclosed switches, rated a maximum of 600 volts or less;

Busway, rated a maximum of 600 volts;

Panelboards, rated a maximum of 600 volts;

Switchboards, rated a maximum of 600 volts;

Fire pump controllers, rated a maximum of 600 volts;

Manual and magnetic motor controllers;

Motor control centers;

Alternating current high-voltage circuit breakers;

Low-voltage power circuit breakers;

10. Protective relays, meters and current transformers;

11. Low- and medium-voltage switchgear;

12. Liquid-filled transformers;

13. Cast-resin transformers;

14. Wire or cable that is suitable for wet locations and whose ends have not been
exposed to water;

15. Wire or cable, not containing fillers, that is suitable for wet locations and whose
ends have not been exposed to water;

16. Luminaires that are listed as submersible;

17. Motors;

18. Electronic control, signaling and communication equipment.

CoNo~WNE

(55) Section 604.3.2.1 is hereby amended to read as follows:
Sec. 604.3.2.1 ELECTRICAL EQUIPMENT.

Electrical switches, receptacles and fixtures, including furnace, water heating, security
system and power distribution circuits that have been exposed to fire, shall be replaced in
accordance with the provisions of the Michigan Electrical Code and or the Michigan Building
Code and Michigan Residential Code

Exception: Electrical switches, receptacles and fixtures that shall be allowed to be repaired
where an inspection report from the equipment manufacturer or approved manufacturer's
representative indicates that the equipment has not sustained damage that requires replacement.

(56)  Section 702.3 is hereby amended to read as follows:

Sec. 702.3  LOCKED DOORS

All means of egress doors shall be readily openable from the side from which egress is to

be made without the need for keys, special knowledge or effort, except where the door hardware
conforms to that permitted by the Michigan Residential Code and the Michigan Building Code.

(57) Section 704.1 is hereby amended to read as follows.



Sec. 704.1 GENERAL.

All systems, devices and equipment to detect a fire, actuate an alarm, or
suppress or control a fire or any combination thereof shall be maintained in an openable
condition at all times in accordance with the International Fire Code, the Michigan
Building Code, the Michigan Residential Code and the Michigan Mechanical Code.

(58)  Section 704.1.1 is hereby amended to read as follows:

Sec. 704.1.1 AUTOMATIC SPRINKLER SYSTEMS.

) Inspection, testing and maintenance of automatic sprinkler systems shall be in accordance
with NFPA 25, the Michigan Building Code and Michigan Residential Code.

(59) Section 704.2 is hereby amended to read as follows.
Sec. 704.2 SMOKE ALARMS.

Single- or multiple-station smoke alarms shall be installed and maintained in Group R-2,
R-3 or R-4 and in dwellings not regulated in Group R occupancies, regardless of occupant load
at all of the following locations:

1. On the ceiling or wall outside of each separate sleeping area in the immediate
vicinity of bedrooms.

2. In each room used for sleeping purposes.

3. In each story within a dwelling unit, including basements and cellars but not
including crawl spaces and uninhabitable attics. In dwellings or dwelling units
with split levels and without an intervening door between the adjacent levels, a
smoke alarm installed on the upper level shall suffice for the adjacent lower level
provided that the lower level is less than one full story below the upper level.

Single- or multiple-station smoke alarms shall be installed in other groups in accordance with the
International Fire Code.-Michigan Building Code and Michigan Residential Code.

(60)  Section 704.3. is hereby amended to read as follows.

Sec. 704.3  POWER SOURCE.

In Group R occupancies and in dwellings not regulated as Group R occupancies, single-
station smoke alarms shall receive their primary power from the building wiring provided that
such wiring is served from a commercial source and shall be equipped with a batter backup.

Smoke alarms shall emit a signal when the batteries are low. Wiring shall be permanent and
without a disconnecting switch other than as required for overcurrent protection.

Exception: Smoke alarms are permitted to be solely battery operated in buildings where



no construction is taking place, buildings that are not served from a commercial power source
and in existing areas of buildings undergoing alterations or repairs that do not result in the
removal of interior wall or ceiling finishes exposing the structure, unless there is an attic, crawl
space or basement available which could provide access for building wiring without the removal
of interior finishes. Where allowed, battery powered smoke detectors shall be energized with not
less than a five year battery.

Section 2. This ordinance shall be in full force and effect on the day of
, 2015.

I hereby certify that the above-entitled Ordinance was adopted by the City of Wyoming at a
session of the City Council held on the day of , 2015.

Kelli A. VandenBerg
Wyoming City Clerk

Ordinance No. 5-15



5/4/15
Clerk/RG
ORDINANCE NO. 6-15

AN ORDINANCE TO AMEND SECTION 90-32 OF THE CODE OF THE
CITY OF WYOMING BY ADDING SUBSECTION (100) THERETO

THE CITY OF WYOMING ORDAINS:

Section 1. That Section 90-32 of the Code of the City of Wyoming is hereby amended by
adding Subsection (100) thereto, to read as follows:

(100) To rezone 0.4 acres from RO-1 Restricted Office to B-1 Local Business (4992 Wilson
Avenue)

LEGAL DESCRIPTION:

THE WEST 183 FEET OF THE SOUTH 140 FEET OF THE NORTH 1/2 OF THE
SOUTHWEST 1/4 OF SECTION 29, TOWN 6 NORTH, RANGE 12 WEST,; CITY OF
WYOMING, KENT COUNTY, MICHIGAN. SUBJECT TO AN EASEMENT FOR HIGHWAY
PURPOSES OVER THE WEST 33 FEET THEREOF.

Section 2. This ordinance shall be in full force and effect on the day of June, 2015.

I hereby certify that the above-entitled Ordinance was adopted by the City of Wyoming at a
regular session of the City Council held on the day of June, 2015.

Kelli A. VandenBerg
Wyoming City Clerk

Ordinance No. 6-15



Planning & Development Department
Telephone (616) 530-7258
1155 28" Street SW, Wyoming, Michigan 49509

MAYOR
Jack A. Poll

AT-LARGE COUNCILMEMBER
Sam Bolt

AT-LARGE COUNCILMEMBER
Kent Vanderwood

AT-LARGE COUNCILMEMBER
Dan Burrill

1STWARD COUNCILMEMBER
William A. VerHulst

20D WARD COUNGILMEMBER
Richard K. Pastoor
3RDWARD COUNCILMEMBER
Joanne M. Voorhees

CITY MANAGER
Curtis L. Holt

WWW.Wyomingmi.gov
April 28,2015

Ms. Kelli Vandenberg
City Clerk
Wyoming, MI

Subject: Request to rezone 0.4 acres from RO-1 Restricted Office
to B-1 Local Business. The property is located at 4992
Wilson Avenue.

Recommendation:  To approve the proposed rezoning.
Dear Ms. Vandenberg:

The above referenced request was reviewed by the Wyoming Planning
Commission at its regular meeting on April 21, 2015. A motion was made by
Woodruff, supported by Micele, to recommend to City Council approval of the
subject rezoning. After discussion, the motion passed unanimously. While a more
detailed review is available in the Planning Commission minutes, the following is
provided as basic background information:

The petitioners propose to rezone this property to accommodate its development
as a two-tenant and 3000 square foot retail center (see attached exhibits). If the
rezoning is approved, the petitioners will then seek special use and site plan
approval from the Planning Commission for the project.

The City of Wyoming Land Use Plan 2020 was adopted in 2006. It identifies this
site (see attached) as being appropriate for Community Commercial purposes.
This is the same designation as the swrounding commercial developments.

Prior to 2004, the developers of the Wilsontown Shopping Center had sought to
acquire this property to combine with their development. This did not occur, and
the access drive to the shopping center was constructed along the property’s north
property line. This contention between the property owners blocked the ability to
share access. Subsequently in June 2004, this property was rezoned from ER
Estate Residential to RO-1 Restricted Office. The rational for the rezoning was
that the property would be poorly suited for residential purposes. In addition,
because of its small size and lack of shared access, its ability to be developed for
commercial purposes would be greatly restricted, given the need for the front yard
greenbelt, parking and setback requirements. A small office building with limited
parking needs was considered to be all that would be feasible on the site (see
attached 2004 conceptual plan). This rezoning also occurred prior to Wilson
Avenue being widened to four lanes.




The petitioners have now obtained a working agreement to have access to the
Wilsontown Shopping Center driveway. If the rezoning is approved, the property
owners will finalize this agreement to allow the development to proceed. The
petitioners have voluntarily offered to enter into a Development Agreement (see
attached) with the City Council to commit to the proposed development plan.

This property is unsuitable for rezoning to the PUD-2 Commercial Planned Unit
Development district which borders the site to the north and east. The PUD-2
district was expressly created to address the development of the Wilsontown
Shopping Center. The PUD-2 district requires properties to be a minimum of one
acre and a 200 foot building setback is required from residential properties. The
B-1 district requires properties to be a minimum of 6,500 square feet (0.15 acres)
with a 20 foot minimum building setback from residentially zoned properties.

The properties to the south along the east side of Wilson Avenue to 52nd Street
are identified in the Land Use Plan as being appropriate for Office Service. Dating
back to before development of the Land Use Plan, those property owners have
desired commercial zoning. The Land Use Plan was developed to create a balance
of commercial, office and multifamily uses where appropriate along the Wilson
Avenue frontage.

The 16 acres across Wilson Avenue and to the southwest was rezoned in January
2015 to accommodate 192 apartments (14 acres) and a small office development
(2 acres).

Conformance with the City of Wyoming Sustainability Principles:

Sustainability: The advancement and promotion, with equal priority, of
environmental quality, economic strength, and social equity so that a stable and
vibrant community can be assured for current and future generations.

This area of Wyoming and Grandville is one of the predominant commercial
centers in West Michigan. The proposed rezoning and subsequent development is
small in scale, and would integrate well into the Wilsontown Shopping Center
development. The development would contribute to the area’s economic strength,
and would provide employment though construction and ongoing business
activities. The proposed rezoning conforms to the City of Wyoming Sustainability
Principals.

The Development Review Team suggested the Planning Commission recommend
to the City Council approval of the rezoning.




At the public hearing there was one speaker who was concerned over how this
rezoning may influence future land use to the south along Wilson Avenue.

Postema requested to abstain from the voting due to a conflict of interest. That
request was approved by the Commission. A motion was made by Woodruff,
supported by Micele, to recommend to City Council approval of the proposed
rezoning. The motion carried unanimously.

Respectfuily submitted,
/ ﬂwfé Gt

Timoth}?échran, City Planner
Planning/and Development Department

cc: Curtis Holt, City Manager
Rebecca Rynbrandt, Director of Community Services




Terms of a Development Agreement for 4992 Wilson Avenue:

The developer offers to the City of Wyoming an agreement to develop the site at 4992 Wilson Avenue as
follows:

Upon successful completion by the City of Wyoming of rezoning to B-1, site plan approval and approval
of the special use permit for a drive through, and granting of necessary variances the developer agrees
to the following conditions:

The Site shall be developed in general conformance to the submitted site plan, subject to City of
Wyoming review comments. Minor deviations shall be permitted to adjust for unforeseen field
conditions, City of Wyoming requirements and other similar requirements necessary for the successful
construction of the proposed project.

The developer will obtain the necessary easements from the Wilsontown Development and Home
Depot to complete the driveway access system shown on the proposed site plan.




-
0 ot i g Er
Coe e et R
ve b




"IAV NOSTIM

HGVONVAY
=

MICHELAST

R ||




FUTURE LAND USE
CITY oOF WYOMING & LAND USE PLAN 2020

\ RIVERTOWHN CROSSINGS ACCESS /

Vilsan Avenue Eurridﬁé

City of Wyoming |
~ Kent County, Ml ?

Low Density Residential (up to 3.5 unitsfac.)

IAbced Residential (up to 4 unitsfac)

5

Low-Kedum Density Resldential (3.5 te § unitsfec.)

INDCREST

b

MedunyHigh Density Resldeatial (6 to 18 units/ac))

High Density Residential (16+ units/ac))

Meighborhood Commercial

__ Qffica Saivica
l
. Cemmunity Commarcial

Downtown Center

Mixed Use

Division Avenue Commerciel

Medcal Villaga

Business Incustrial

Mc-ORMICK

DEL MAR

>
e
(7]

‘Fo 7\‘0,:;.
s 0 Ghgp,
RHIN|

General Industrial

Parks & Opzn Space
[

Schools

 CHAROLAIS

PEJNY

City Buildings

KUIPER

Data Sources:

RECIS !
Mchigan Center for Geogrephle Information
0 200 400 200 1z00 1500

[E— e

FUTURE LAND USE 19







DMLl Wi NPT
a1 AL

INIWISYY mmmoo<
ARG Dmpmmzammﬁ

‘4ald¥y axvun
n e e ar

SoRar HYBEISI
e v e

-

D
T d MAAD LRSS T,

A0 yIEY amuodwmé

g oy

3 . N\ |
/ Vo \ / ! \
/ N b / / // N, / e
/,,/ / / //. ,/ f/ \ \?P// i
/ NN ) " , %,
s ,Ewﬁ_m«uﬁnk. s 2/ oy, 3 s .I..,.rhi.
LB y Lo, | R
IAUNCETM oY |8 +/ N
ENNFIR T .m;
WOH 522 sivaa s ™

LOGITHNOFHACH INT-AE -3 HL S@mu_lomwd mbmwf\l/

S LaNasE 35700 m>aqammmmyomm%pf \\l\ et
\\\L/\/ /1\\\ o _|\:///
) INSNESHINOS §F
. OMILSHI
e »mp ﬁ
///fd//.rlpfrfﬂ.lL
./;/

%
ON

GNHOE/I/%

/

y NOS'.UZ

/

7/1

5

iy

og HJ,)}\OS
) s

)

v\vosm{\m\m

A7




W el & GAWE SRR

sl LME, SW /e, WL T8 TN A1QW

0T AT

pd
=)
n
=
F: )
=)
=,
-
Q
Q)
-
o~
—
&
i
5/1
3
|
|
!
Home — — = Ff= =
[
o
- $ITE
-
I
|
H
1

WILSON AVE.

=

NORTHBOUND WILSON

2004 (ONCEPT PLAN

PROPOSED
LANDSCAPED
REA

PROPOSED
PARKING
AREA

v

PROPOSED BUILDING
Lt 13600 SqFLy

= I.'ﬁ
.

.’f
b

fym

e
»- ‘-L“:‘
.-

-ﬂ.,

LAt

e A
IT‘ > f




	Agenda Page 1
	Agenda Page 2
	  1)  Call to Order
	  2)  Invocation
	  3)  Pledge of Allegiance
	  4)  Roll Call
	  5)  Student Recognition
	  6)  Approval of Minutes
	From the April 20, 2015  regular meeting


	  7)  Approval of Agenda
	  8)  Public Hearings
	7:01: Proposed City Budget for 2015-2016

	7:02: To Consider an IDD for Jasper Weller, LLC


	  9)  Public Comment on Agenda Items
	10)  Presentations and Proclamations
	a)  Presentations
	1. CALEA

	2. WDPS Annual Report 

	b)  Proclamations
	1. Police Week



	11)  Petitions and Communications
	a)  Petitions
	b) Communications

	12) Reports from City Officers
	a) From City Council
	b) From City Manager

	13)  Budget Amendments
	14) Consent Agenda
	a) Of Appreciation to Eric Hartfield

	b) To Appoint Robert Brenzing


	15) Resolutions
	c) To Consider a New Tavern Licensed Business

	d) Deputy Finance Director Employment Agreement

	e) Administrative Assistant (HR) Employment Agreement

	f) Salvation Army Social Services Agreement


	16) Award of Bids, Contracts, Purchases and Renewal of Bids and Contracts  
	g) To Award a Bid for Watermain Replacement

	h) To Authorize Work at Frog Hollow Park

	i) To Accept a Quote for a Security X-Ray System

	j) To Authorize the Purchase of Ammunition

	k) For Award of Bid for Work Uniforms & Clothing Items


	17)  Ordinances
	05-15: To Amend Article VII of Chapter 10 of the Code (Property Maintenance Code) FIRST READING

	06-15: To Amend Section 90-32 of the Code by adding Subsection (100) Thereto (Rezoning) FIRST READING 


	18)  Informational Material
	19) Acknowledgement of Visitors
	20) Closed Session (as necessary)
	21) Adjournment



